TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
BOARD OF TRUSTEES MEETING
October 18, 2022

6:30PM
AGENDA
ROLL CALL 6:30
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
PUBLIC COMMENT

Each speaker will be limited to three minutes. The Board of Trustees is not authorized by the
Colorado Open Meetings Law to discuss, comment, or act at the meeting on any issue raised by
public comment. The Mayor may refer the matter to the Town Administrator or Town Attorney for
immediate comment, or to staff to obtain additional information and report back to the Board as

appropriate.
CONSENT AGENDA Mayor Palmer
a. Approval of September 20, 2022 Minutes
REPORTS
a. Mayor
b. Trustees
c. Finance Report
d. Town Administrator
e. Chief of Police
OLD BUSINESS
a. There is no old business Mr. McCrumb
NEW BUSINESS
a. Trustee Bill #5 — Building Code (1% Reading) Mr. Thelen
i. PUBLIC HEARING - Trustee Bill #5 Mayor Palmer
b. Trustee Bill #6 — Master Plan - Trails (1* Reading) Mr. Kaslon
c. Set Public Hearing for Resolution #6 — FAMLI Mr. Schiller
d. Presentation of the 2023 Town Budget Mr. McCrumb

EXECUTIVE SESSION - An executive session to Conference with an  Mayor Palmer
attorney for the purposes of receiving legal advice on specific
legal questions, pursuant to C.R.S. § 24-6-402(4)(b).

ADJOURNMENT



TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
BOARD OF TRUSTEES

Minutes

August 16, 2022

Mayor Pro Tem Dotson called the Special Meeting of the Trustees to order at 6:00 p.m., in the
Conference Room at the Town Hall at 2 Middlefield Road, Columbine Valley, Colorado. Roll call
found the following present:

Trustees: Roy Palmer (remote), Bill Dotson, Kathy Boyle, Mike Giesen, Ed
Icenogle, and Jim Tarpey
Also present: Lee Schiller, Diane Rodriguez, J.D. McCrumb, and Bret Cottrell

EXECUTIVE SESSION: ACTION: upon a motion by Trustee Icenogle and a second by Trustee
Tarpey, the Board of Trustees unanimously approved entering executive session at 6:01
p.m. for the purpose of receiving legal advice on specific legal questions, pursuant to
C.R.S. § 24-6-402(4)(b). The Trustees came out of Executive Session at 6:36 p.m.

Mayor Pro Tem Dotson called the Regular Meeting of the Trustees to order at 6:37 p.m., in the
Conference Room at the Town Hall at 2 Middlefield Road, Columbine Valley, Colorado. Roll call
found the following present:

Trustees: Roy Palmer (remote), Bill Dotson, Kathy Boyle, Mike Giesen, Ed
Icenogle, and Jim Tarpey

Also present: Lee Schiller, Diane Rodriguez, J.D. McCrumb, Troy Carmann, and
Bret Cottrell

PUBLIC COMMENT: There was no public comment

APPROVAL OF AGENDA: Mayor Pro Tem Dotson asked that an item be added to the agenda.
ACTION: upon a motion by Trustee Icenogle and a second by Trustee Boyle, the
Board of Trustees unanimously approved amending the agenda to include an
item re cyber security under new business.

CONSENT AGENDA:
ACTION: upon a motion by Trustee Tarpey and a second by Trustee Giesen, the
Board of Trustees unanimously approved the consent agenda as presented.

REPORTS

A. The mayor had no comments.

B. Mayor Pro Tem Dotson updated the Trustees on a fire at one of our officers’ homes. He
encouraged the Trustees to support the officer financially and asked the Trustees to direct
staff to post information on the town’s media platforms through which citizens could
participate and asked the Trustees to approve a financial bonus to the officer of $1,000
(after taxes). The Trustees agreed this was appropriate and directed staff to follow through.
There were no additional Trustee comments.

C. Mrs. Rodriguez reviewed the August financials as presented in the Trustees Packet.

D. Mr. McCrumb reviewed his report as presented in the Trustees Packet.

E. Chief Cottrell reviewed the report as presented in the Trustee Packet.



OLD BUSINESS:
A. Review of CIP Roads Project Proposal: Mr. Carmann and Mr. McCrumb presented the
Trustees with a final breakdown of cost and fund allocation for the previously approved
CIP streets and stormwater program. The Trustees asked clarifying questions.
ACTION: upon a motion by Trustee Icenogle and a second by Trustee Giesen,
the Board of Trustees unanimously approved the project and funding allocations
and directed staff to proceed.

NEW BUSINESS
A. Cyber Security Proposal: Chief Cottrell presented a proposal for additional cyber
security and IT expenditures intended to enhance protections against ransomware and
other external threats to the towns IT infrastructure.
ACTION: upon a motion by Trustee Tarpey and a second by Trustee Giesen, the
Board of Trustees unanimously approved the proposal and necessary spending to
proceed immediately.

ADJOURNMENT: There being no further business, the meeting was adjourned at approximately
7:59 p.m.

Submitted by,
J.D. McCrumb, Town Administrator

* All reports and exhibits listed “as attached” are available on the Columbine Valley web site and by request at Town Hall,
** All minutes should be considered in DRAFT form until approved by the Board of Trustees at the next regular meeting.



TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
Financial Statements Ending September 30, 2022
Variance Summary

General Fund

Revenues
- General Fund Revenues are at 102% of budget (PY 108%)
o Property taxes $608,991, 99% of budget (PY 99%)
o Violations $332,075
o Software Grant from State of CO $1,885
o Interest $28,795
o NEU Grant of $376,773 (on balance sheet)
Administration — 61% of budget (PY 60%)
- Special Projects, Municode of $10,350 unbudgeted
- Bank/Credit card fees — both Wells Fargo and Bank of the West are active
- Accounting and audit — add’l work by CRS
Dues & Publications are for annual dues
Public Safety — 75% of budget (PY 75%)
- Workers comp insurance — paid in advance
- Arapahoe Cty Dispatch, Govpilot & Juvenile assessment & Tri-tech software are paid for the year
- Offsite server backup & protection — includes add’1 costs for new protection
- Office 365 $400 month, budgeted at $208 month
Public Works — 50% of budget (PY 45%)
General Fund Expenditures
- General Fund Expenditures are at 64% of budget (PY 63%). In addition, a transfer to the Capital fund
was made in the amount of $3,500,000
- The ending fund balance is $1,307,376

Capital Fund
- Purchase of Ford F450 snowplow $69,075

- Sale of Ford F350 $5,000
- Transfer from the general fund of $3,500,000, the ending fund balance is $4,883,993

Conservation Trust Fund
- Ending fund balance $23,263

Arapahoe County Open Space Fund
- Open Space funding received of $51,448
- Ending fund balance $540,989

Impact Fees
- Impact Fee revenues $292,100, 100% of budget (PY 71%) with zero expenditures to date

- Ending fund balance $1,177,531

Transportation Fees
- Transportation fees $58,941, 65% of budget (PY65%) with zero expenditures to date
- Ending fund balance $166,280

Page | 1



TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
CASH POSITION
YEAR TO DATE (YTD) AS OF SEPTEMBER 30, 2022

TOTAL
ALL
Account Activity Item Description CHECKING INVESTMENTS ACCOUNTS
Wells Fargo checking $ 1,176,413 | $ - $ 1,176,413
Bank of the West checking 1,077,357 - 1,077,357
Bank of the West maney market - 419,548 419,548
C-Safe Primary - 3,469,050 3,469,050
C-Safe Impact fee - 1,164,831 1,164,831
C-Safe CTF - 23,119 23,119
Arapahoe County shareback - 548,833 548,833
YTD Cash Balances 2,253,770 5,625,381 7,879,151
Less amount allocated for capital (4,883,993)
Less amount restricted for CTF (23,263)
Less amount restricted for ACOS (540,989)
Less amount restricted for impact fees (1,177,531)
Less amount restricted for transportation fees (166,280)
CURRENT UNRESTRICTED/UNALLOCATED BALANCE $ 2,253,770 | $ 5,625,381 | § 1,087,095

Page 1




Z vbeg

(z1 =bed) (11 ebed) {0} =6bed) {6 abed) (g obed) {tr abed) aousalajal [enjoe sa 1abpng

ZEP'660'8 08Z'991 A I $ | 686'0FS $ | £9z'cZ $ || £66°'c88'Y $ | 928°20¢'L SIONVIVE aNNd ONIANI aLA

SLE'VER'L LY6'85 889°00¢ Sye'LS 0B0'S S26'SEV'E ri_m.tm.: asuejeq punj uj aBueys joN
000's = - 2t " 000'S = 0S€d pJod jo ajeg
: z " * # 000'005'¢ (000'005°¢} siajsued ]
(s09'261) . - 3 e = (c09'261) ss07

026'9Z1'2 L¥6'8S 889'00E SYZ'LS 080°S (520'69) L$0'082'L sainjipuadxa (1apun) Jaao sanuaaal Jo ssaoxg|

(ooz'015°1) E = l(e62'F) (0z1'2) (520'69) (602'sE+'L) sainyipuadxa QLA lejoL

029°.e9' L¥6'85 889°00€ L¥G'SS 002'2 = 0sz'sLe'e SONUaAal QLA [BI101
L¥6'85 L¥6'85 . : - - - $93) uojepodsuel |
001262 ™ 001262 - - = = saaj joedu)
8y¥'LS > - grt'Ls - - - pury eoeds uado Aunoy aoyedesny
8£0'2 - # - 8£0°,L - - JU3WaRUa pund IsnJ| UCHBAIBSUC)
588’ - . = = = 688l sjuelg
561'G = » # - 2 GG2'G Elile)
8E9'LY - 8858 £60't <91 - S6L'8¢ 1saiay|
vel'ole - - - - - vgl'ale |ejuaunuaacbisiu)
S9%'ErR = - - - - SO8‘EHR saul pue sjuLag
991'856'L = 7 = - E 991'a56'} SoxXe]

SLINIWILYLS TVIONVYNIA H3d SINNIAIH QLA

ZLL'S9L'9 6£€'201 $ | eve'ol8 $ | vrL'e8Y $]eaL'sl $ | 8o0'stt'L $ | ove'veT'e S3ONVIVE ANNd ONINNID3G

SIVLOL s094 s394 asedg uadg Jsniy |endesn [CTENED) uonduasaqg waj AAI9Y JUnosay
uonepodsues) jaeduw) A1 aoyedery uoneAIesu0)

2202 ‘0 ¥38W3ILd3S 40 SV (01A) 31va OL ¥Y3A
SIAINVIVE NN T1GVIIVAY 40 NOLLYDO1IV

AITIVA INIBANNTOD 40 NMOL



TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
BALANCE SHEET - ALL FUNDS

GOVERNMENTAL FUNDS
September 30, 2022
Unaudited

ASSETS

Cash and investments

Accrued revenue

Other receivables

Property tax receivable
TOTAL ASSETS

LIABILITIES AND FUND BALANCES
LIABILITIES
Accounts payable
Accrued liabilities
NEU Grant
Deferred property tax revenue

Total liabilities

FUND BALANCES
General
Capital
Conservation trust fund
Arapahoe county open space
Impact fees
Transportation fees

Total fund balances

TOTAL LIABILITIES AND FUND BALANCES

Page 3

General

$ 7,879,151
241,131
384,569

6,428

$ 8,511,279

$ 10,425
18,221

376,773

6,428

411,847

1,307,376
4,883,993
23,263
540,989
1,177,531
166,280

8,099,432

$ 8,511,279




TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
GENERAL - SUMMARY
STATEMENT OF REVENUES, EXPENDITURES AND CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE

BUDGET AND ACTUAL - MODIFIED ACCRUAL (BUDGETARY) BASIS

FOR THE NINE MONTHS ENDED SEPTEMBER 30, 2022

REVENUES
Taxes
Permits and fines
Intergovernmental
Interest
Other
Grants

Total revenues

EXPENDITURES
Administration
Planning and engineering
Public safety
Public works

Total expenditures

EXCESS OF REVENUES OVER
EXPENDITURES

OTHER FINANCING USES

Other loss
Transfer to capital

Total other financing uses
NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE

ENDING FUND BALANCE

Unaudited
Percent of
Adopted YTD Variance Annual
YTD Annual from Annual Budget
Actual Budget Budget (75% YTD)
$ 1,958,166 $ 2,129,498 §  (171,332) 92%
843,865 630,000 213,865 134%
376,784 382,259 (5,475) 99%
28,795 1,000 27,795 2880%
5,755 - 5,755 -
1,885 - 1,885 -
3,215,250 3,142,757 72,493 102%
582,707 953,612 (370,905) 61%
20,202 53,500 (33,298) 38%
651,762 867,980 (216,218) 75%
180,538 361,849 (181,311) 50%
1,435,209 2,236,941 (801,732) 64%
1,780,041 905,816 874,225 197%
(197,605) - (197,605) -
(3,500,000) (2,700,000) (800,000) 130%
(3,697,605) (2,700,000) (997,605) 137%
(1,917,564) § (1,794,184) §  (123,380)

3,224,940

$ 1,307,376

Page 4



REVENUES

Taxes
Cable television
Property taxes
Sales and use taxes
Specific ownership taxes
Utility franchise fees

Total taxes

Permits and fines
Court fines
Permits, fees and services
Violations

Total permits and fines

Intergovernmental
Bow Mar IGA
Bow Mar IGA admin
County highway tax revenue
Motor vehicle registration fees
State cigarette tax apportionment
State highway user's tax

Total intergovernmental

Interest
Other
Grants

TOTAL REVENUES

EXPENDITURES

Administration
Accounting and audit
Advertising/notices
Bank/credit card fees

Building inspection and planning review

Building maintenance and utilities
Community functions

Computer expense

County treasurer's collection fees
Dues and publications

Education and training

Election

Emergency response and preparedness

Health insurance
Insurance and bonds
Legal

Mayor/monthly breakfasts
Miscellaneous

Payroll taxes

Pension

TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
GENERAL - DETAILS
STATEMENT OF REVENUES, EXPENDITURES AND CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BUDGET AND ACTUAL - MODIFIED ACCRUAL (BUDGETARY) BASIS
FOR THE ONE MONTH AND NINE MONTHS ENDED SEPTEMBER 30, 2022

Unaudited

Percent of

Adopted YTD Variance Annual

Current YTD Annual from Annual Budget
Month Actual Budget Budget (75% YTD)
b 3,160 % 20462 § 36,000 3 (6,538) 82%
(2,638) 608,991 615,419 (6,428) 9%
117,178 1,239,633 1,385,000 (145,367) 90%
3,330 29,256 43,079 (13,823) 68%
4,166 50,824 50,000 824 102%
125,196 1,958,166 2,129,498 (171,332) 92%
5,802 74,997 100,000 (25,003) 75%
21,076 436,793 530,000 (93,207) 82%

- 332,075 - 332,075 -
26,878 843,865 630,000 213,865 134%
76,208 304,833 300,259 4,574 102%
5,000 20,000 20,000 - 100%
1,250 17,838 15,000 2,338 119%
667 4,383 6,000 (1,617) 73%
- 523 1,000 @M 52%
3,450 29,207 40,000 (10,793) 713%
86,575 376,784 382,259 (5,475) 99%
7,539 28,795 1,000 27,795 2880%

262 5,755 - 5,755 -

- 1,885 - 1,885 -
246,450 3,215,250 3,142,757 72,493 102%
216 65,203 63,500 1,703 103%
66 1,661 500 1,161 332%
432 6,518 5,100 1,418 128%
- 143,588 238,500 (94,912) 60%
1,111 16,747 22,011 (5,264) 76%
- 27,555 55,000 (27,445) 50%
923 4,705 14,500 (9,795) 32%
(28) 6,095 6,154 (59) 99%
- 9,931 8,850 1,081 112%
- 3,174 12,000 (8,826) 26%
- - 4,000 (4,000) 0%
- 1,225 3,000 (1,775) 41%
4,880 37,832 47,000 (9,168) 80%
4,327 19,463 34,047 (14,584) 57%
2,490 24,972 45,000 (20,028) 55%
- 289 2,000 (1,711) 14%
- 2,453 2,300 153 107%
594 5,641 12,575 (6,934) 45%
695 6,142 12,575 (6,433) 49%

Paae 5



TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
GENERAL - DETAILS

STATEMENT OF REVENUES, EXPENDITURES AND CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE

BUDGET AND ACTUAL - MODIFIED ACCRUAL (BUDGETARY) BASIS
FOR THE ONE MONTH AND NINE MONTHS ENDED SEPTEMBER 30, 2022

Salaries

Special projects

Supplies, printing, postage
Telephone/communications
Emergency reserve

Total administration

Planning and engineering
Town planning
Town engineer
Miscellancous

Total planning and engineering

Public safety
Operations
Cruiser gas
Cruiser oil/maintenance
Cruiser insurance
Education/training
Equipment repair
Health insurance
Workers comp insurance
Payroll taxes
Pension
Salaries
Supplies/miscellaneous
Telephones/air cards
Uniforms

Total operations
Municipal court
Judge
Legal
Administration
Supplies
Interpreter

Total municipal court
Contracts
Arapahoe county dispatch fee
Tri-tech software
Humane society
Juvenile assessment
Netmotion
CACP
CISC
WhenlWork

Total contracts
Computer/IT

Offsite server backup and protection

Office 365 accounts

Scheduled computer replacement

Paae 6

Unaudited

Percent of

Adopted YTD Variance Annual

Current YTD Annual from Annual Budget
Month Actual Budget Budget (75% YTD)
16,223 177,900 251,500 (73,600) 1%

- 10,350 - 10,350 -
419 5,813 13,000 {7,187) 45%
737 5,450 6,500 (1,050) 84%
- - 94,000 (94,000) 0%
33,585 582,707 953,612 (370,905) 61%
200 8,850 36,000 (27,110) 25%
- 11,312 16,000 (4,688) 1%
- - 1,500 (1,500) 0%
200 20,202 53,500 {33,298) 38%
- 13,354 22,100 (8,746) 60%
523 5,430 18,000 {12,570) 30%
1,203 4,558 8,487 (3,929) 54%
521 4,246 11,750 (7,504) 36%
- - 5,875 (5,875) 0%
5,839 56,044 70,900 (14,856) 79%
7,684 35477 29,705 5,772 119%
1,540 14,455 24,730 (10,275) 58%
3,797 36,081 49,459 (13,378) 73%
40,848 378,836 494,590 (115,754) 7%
702 6,170 15,980 (9,810) 39%
150 1,536 2,938 {1,402) 52%
- 5,160 11,750 (6,590) 44%
62,807 561,347 766,264 (204,917) 73%
500 4,500 8,000 (3,500) 56%
2,505 21,690 27,500 {5,810) 79%
- 1,328 2,000 (672) 66%
- 1,312 2,000 (688) 66%
200 1,800 2,000 (200) 920%
3,205 30,630 41,500 (10,870) T4%
- 34,406 33,709 697 102%
- 1,224 1,225 (1) 100%
- - 500 {500) 0%
- 595 782 (187) 76%
- - 500 (500) 0%
- - 250 (250) 0%
- - 1,000 (1,000) 0%
36 36 450 {414) 8%
36 36,261 38416 (2,155) 94%
1,350 2,700 1,800 900 150%
- 3,087 2,500 587 123%
1,476 3,737 3,500 237 107%



TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY

GENERAL - DETAILS

STATEMENT OF REVENUES, EXPENDITURES AND CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BUDGET AND ACTUAL - MODIFIED ACCRUAL (BUDGETARY) BASIS
FOR THE ONE MONTH AND NINE MONTHS ENDED SEPTEMBER 30, 2022

Govpilot
Total computer/IT
Total public safety

Public works
Ground maintenance
Health insurance
Other drainage/water
Payroll taxes
Pension
Professional fees-mosquito control
Salary
Sanitation/trash/recycle service
Signs maintenance
Snow removal
Storm water permit process/NPDES
Street and gutter maintenance
Streets and gutters contingency
Street lighting
Striping
Vehicle maintenance

Total public works
TOTAL EXPENDITURES

EXCESS OF REVENUES OVER
EXPENDITURES

OTHER FINANCING USES
Other loss
Transfer to capital

Total other financing uses

NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE

BEGINNING FUND BALANCE

ENDING FUND BALANCE

3,224,940

$ 1,307,376

Paaa 7

Unaudited

Percent of

Adopted YTD Variance Annual

Current YTD Annual from Annual Budget
Month Actual Budget Budget (75% YTD)
- 14,000 14,000 - 100%
2,826 23,524 21,800 1,724 108%
68,374 651,762 867,980 (216,218) 75%
796 9,635 8,578 1,057 112%
493 5,895 7,934 (2,039) 74%
- - 5,000 {5,000) 0%
198 1,917 4,193 (2,276) 46%
273 3,500 4,193 {693) 83%
- 7,042 7,500 (458) 94%
6,481 52,591 83,850 (31,259) 63%
8,365 73,901 92,000 (18,099) 80%
- - 1,061 {1,061) 0%
- 2,246 5,500 (3,254) 41%
- 705 7,500 (6,795) 9%
- 5,740 75,000 (69,260} 8%
- - 40,000 (40,000) 0%
1,787 15,315 15,000 315 102%
- - 1,040 (1,040) 0%
- 2,051 3,500 (1,449) 59%
18,393 180,538 361,849 (181,311) 50%
121,052 1,435,209 2,236,941 (801,732) 64%
125,398 1,780,041 905,816 874,225 197%

- (197,605) - (197,605) -
- (3,500,000) (2,700,000) (800,000) 130%
- (3,697,605) (2,700,000) {997,605) 137%

3 125,398 5 (1,917,564) § (1,794,184) § (123,380)



TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
CAPITAL
STATEMENT OF REVENUES, EXPENDITURES AND CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BUDGET AND ACTUAL - MODIFIED ACCRUAL (BUDGETARY) BASIS
FOR THE NINE MONTHS ENDED SEPTEMBER 30, 2022

Unaudited
Percent of
Adopted YTD Variance Annual
YTD Annual from Annual Budget
Actual Budget Budget (75% YTD)
REVENUES
Total revenues 5 - S - $ - -
EXPENDITURES
Public safety
Flock camera system - 17,500 (17,500) 0%
Vehicle 69,075 55,000 14,075 126%
Public works
Lightpole replacement - 12,000 (12,000) 0%
Truck - snow removal - 68,000 (68,000) 0%
Total expenditures 69,075 152,500 (83,425) 45%
EXCESS OF EXPENDITURES OVER
REVENUES (69,075) (152,500) 83,425 45%
OTHER FINANCING SOURCES
Gain on sale of asset 5,000 - 5,000 -
Transfer from general 3,500,000 2,700,000 800,000 130%
Transfer from impact fee - 9,520 (9,520) 0%
Total other financing sources 3,505,000 2,709,520 795,480 129%
NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE 3,435,925 $2557,020 § 878,905
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE 1,448,068
ENDING FUND BALANCE $ 4,883,993

Page 8



TOWN OF COLUMBINE YALLEY
CONSERVATION TRUST
STATEMENT OF REVENUES, EXPENDITURES AND CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BUDGET AND ACTUAL - MODIFIED ACCRUAL (BUDGETARY) BASIS
FOR THE NINE MONTHS ENDED SEPTEMBER 30, 2022

REVENUES
Conservation Trust Fund entitlement
CTF interest

Total revenues

EXPENDITURES
Conservation trust fund expenditures

Total expenditures
NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE

ENDING FUND BALANCE

Unaudited
Percent of
Adopted YTD Variance Annual
YTD Annual from Annual Budget
Actual Budget Budget (75% YTD)
$ 7,038 8,700 $ (1,662) 81%
162 7 155 2314%
7,200 8,707 (1,507) 83%
2,120 6,000 (3,880) 35%
2,120 6,000 (3,880) 35%
5,080 2,707 3 2,373
18,183
$ 23,263

Page 9



TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY

ARAPAHOE COUNTY OPEN SPACE FUND

STATEMENT OF REVENUES, EXPENDITURES AND CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BUDGET AND ACTUAL - MODIFIED ACCRUAL (BUDGETARY) BASIS
FOR THE NINE MONTHS ENDED SEPTEMBER 30, 2022

REVENUES
Arapahoe County open space revenues
ACOP interest

Total revenues

EXPENDITURES
Nevada ditch

Total expenditures
NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE

ENDING FUND BALANCE

Page 10

Unaudited
Percent of
Adopted YTD Variance Annual
YTD Annual from Annual Budget
Actual Budget Budget (75% YTD)
$ 51,448 $ 46,114 $ 5,334 112%
4,093 184 3,909 2224%
55,541 46,298 9,243 120%
4,296 30,000 (25,704) 14%
4,296 30,000 (25,704) 14%
51,245 § 16,298 b 34,947
489,744
$ 540,989



TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
IMPACT FEES

STATEMENT OF REVENUES, EXPENDITURES AND CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BUDGET AND ACTUAL - MODIFIED ACCRUAL (BUDGETARY) BASIS
FOR THE NINE MONTHS ENDED SEPTEMBER 30, 2022

REVENUES
Impact fees
Interest

Total revenues

EXPENDITURES
Total expenditures

EXCESS OF REVENUES OVER
EXPENDITURES

OTHER FINANCING USES
Transfer to capital

Total other financing uses
NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE

ENDING FUND BALANCE

Unaudited
Percent of
Adopted YTD Variance Annual
YTD Annual from Annual Budget
Actual Budget Budget (75% YTD)
$ 292,100 § 292,100 $ - 100%
8,588 145 8,443 5923%
300,688 292,245 8,443 103%
300,688 292,245 8,443 103%
- (9,520) 9,520 0%
- (9,520) 9,520 0%
300,688 $ 282,725 $ 17,963
876,843
_S 1,177,531

Page 11



TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
TRANSPORTATION FEES
STATEMENT OF REVENUES, EXPENDITURES AND CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BUDGET AND ACTUAL - MODIFIED ACCRUAL (BUDGETARY) BASIS
FOR THE NINE MONTHS ENDED SEPTEMBER 30, 2022

Unaudited
Percent of
Adopted YTD Variance Annual
YTD Annual from Annual Budget
Actual Budget Budget (75% YTD)
REVENUES
Transportation fees $ 58941 $ 90,000 $ (31,059) 65%
Total revenues 58,941 90,000 (31,059) 65%
EXPENDITURES - - - -
Total expenditures & g . N
NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE 58,941 $ 90,000 $  (31,059)
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE 107,339
ENDING FUND BALANCE $ 166,280

Page 12



Town Administrator’s Report
October 2022

Town of Columbine Valley Tel: 303-795-1434
2 Middlefield Road Fax: 303-795-7325
Columbine Valley, CO 80123 jdmeccrumb@columbinevalley.org

Town of

YaColumbineValley
Colorado




~3y o

Communications & Administration

The flu shot clinic and fall shred events were, as always, wildly
popular with high citizen participation at both events.

With help from our new HR Contractor, the employee benefits
renewal process has been improved with significant
communications and clarity added, and additional support
available for those with questions about their benefits.

Lennar has made arrangements to come current on outstanding
fine balances.

Invitations will be going out soon for the December 6 Trustee
meeting and end-of-the-year appreciation event.

With the transition to all virtual court, staff will be working with
the City of Littleton to update our IGA for use of the municipal
court facility in Littleton.

Work is underway planning for the street and stormwater project
next spring including bids for non-pavement work,
communications planning and coordination with HOAs and the
Country Club.

Directory Update: Approximately 203 printed directories have
been picked up at Town Hall. Approximately 176 households
have also opted in for DirectorySpot (online directory). Work on
the 2023 printed directory has begun.




Building Department

Sept. Permit Rev.: $65,559.63

New 3?:'1_:‘-'!_:4.- J}

Permit Fee,
$14,905.50

Open Space,
$1,896.91

Transportation
Fee, $4,388.94

nue §:3 Mont

2022

April
May 76 $ 57.32 $342,301.78
$62,386.70
$4,905.67
$1,461,370.06
$1,822,478.43 59.63 $1,526,929.69
$2,080,158.19
$2,276,532.40

December  $335,624.07  $2,612,156.47




Pubic Works Departmnt

Streets: The final list for 2022 gutter pan replacement
was completed and sent out to bid. This year's
concrete replacement portion of the paving program
will include 2,000 square feet of gutter pan
replacement across the town.

Wild Plum: Additional drone footage was taken over
the developing areas of Wild Plum. This helps to
track the progress of the project, as well as the current
status of the outstanding projects remaining to be
completed. Repair of the crusher fines trail has begun
in preparation of the final lift and compaction of the
trail.




Columbine Valley Police
Department

Serving Bow Mar
2 Middlefield Rd. Columbine Valley, Colorado 80123
www.columbinevalley.org
(303) 795-1434 Fax (303) 795-7325

Columbine Valley P.D. Monthly Report

For October 2022
Full Time Positions 6 of 6
Part Time Positions 20f4
Regular hours 928
OT hours worked 51
Off Duty 0
PTO 86

September 2022 Violations

Charges For the Date Range 9/1/2022 Thru 9/30/2022

Qty Charge
40 1101(2)(H) SPEEDING 10 - 19 MPH OVER:
7 703(3) FAIL TO STOP AT A STOP SIGN:
3 604 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNAL:
3 1101(2)(H) SPEEDING 20 AND OVER:
2 1210(A) ON STREET PARKING PROHIBITED (3-6 AM):
1 BMC 16-12 OUTDOOR STORAGE PROHIBITED:
1
1 217(1) FAILED TO DIM HEADLIGHTS:
1 1409 COMPULSORY INSURANCE:
0

59

Total Number of Violations Issued



Case Number
Cv22-0000162
CV22-0000163
Cv22-0000164
CV22-0000165
CV22-0000166
CVv22-0000167
Cv22-0000168
CVv22-0000169
Cv22-0000170
Cv22-0000171

Monthly Case # Report

Event Date

09/01/2022 03:50:20 PM
09/07/2022 11:48:34 PM
09/08/2022 02:23:56 PM
09/14/2022 05:40:17 PM
09/15/2022 06:54:34 PM
09/15/2022 09:49:42 PM
09/16/2022 02:51:46 PM
09/17/2022 08:18:31 PM
09/25/2022 02:24:35 PM
09/29/2022 11:00:21 PM

Situation Reported
TRAFFIC STOP IP
TRAFFIC ARREST IP
Theft

MENTAL SUBJECT IP
ANIMAL CALL IP*
INFORMATION [P
WARRANT ARREST IP
Burglary

TRAFFIC ARREST IP
ELUDING IP



Problem Type Summary

11:46 AM 10/11/2022
Data Source: Data Warehouse

gency: ACSO
ivision: Bow Mar, Bow Mar Inactive Personnel, Columbine Valley, Columbine Valley Inactive Pers
ay Range: Date From 9/1/2022 To 9/30/2022

« Calls canceled before first unit assigned
e Calls canceled before first unit at scene

Select a format _:_lflport

xclusion:

Priority Description

1 P1 In Progress
2 P2 Urgent
3 P3 Non Emergency
4 P4 Police Details
5 |P5 On View
6 |P6 Phone
7 P7 Dispatch
8 P8 CAD Test Record
9 P9 Call on Hold
Priority
Problem Type 1 2 3 4 5 (] 7/ 8 9 Total
1 HANGUP IP
BANDONED VEHICLE IP*
CCIDENT ALERT IP
NIMAL CALL IP* 6 6
ssault
h T TO OTHER AGENCY IP 1 1
uto Theft
UTO THEET IP
urglary 1 1
urglary Attempt
URGLARY ATTEMPT IP
1 1
ANCEL RUNAWAY IP
hild Abuse
HILD ABUSE IP
¥ IST IP 3 3
FORCEMENT IP* 2 2
riminal Impersonation
RIMINAL IMPERSONATION IP
riminal Mischiefl
RIMINAL MISCHIEF IP




riminal Tampering
RIMINAL TAMPERING IP
EAD ON ARRIVAL IP
isturbance Physical
ISTURBANCE PHYSICAL IP
isturbance Verbal
ISTURBANCE VERBAL IP
omestic Violence Physical
1IC VIOLENCE PHYSICAL IP
olence Verbal
IC VIOLENCE VERBAL IP
rug Violation
RUG VIOLATION IP
RUNK SUBJECT IP
urip
Ider Abuse
LDER ABUSE IP
IREWORKS IP

ARASSMENT IP

ate Crime

ATE CRIME IP

OME CHECK IP*

Theft
TY THEFT IP

IPOUNDED VEHICLE IP
\FORMATION IP

jury Accident

JURY ACCIDENT IP
TIMIDATING A WITNESS IP
EEP THE PEACE IP*
IQUOR VIOLATION IP
OUD NOISE COMPLAINT IP
EDICALIP

enacing

IENACING IP
IENTAL SUBJECT IP

AGE FOR DEPUTY IP

HISSING CHILD IP

issing Person

ISSING PERSON IP
BSTRUCTION IP

DOR INVESTIGATION IP
PEN DOOR IP*
VERSIZED VEHICLE IP*

0SS SHOTS FIRED IP
roperty Accident
ROPERTY ACCIDENT IP

s VEHICLE IP*

STOLEN PROPERTY IP

ECOVERED STOLEN VEHICLE 1P
EDI REPORT IP
EPOSSESSED YEHICLE IP
ESIDENTIAL ALARM IP

estraining Order Vio
ESTRAINING ORDER VIO IP
obbery

1 1
5 5

2 2

15 15
1 1

3 5

14 14

3 3

1 1

7 7




OBBERY IP

unaway

UNAWAY IP

AFE 2 TELL

LECTIVE ENFORCEMENT IP*
X Assault

HOTS FIRED IP
icide Attempt
UICIDE ATTEMPT IP
JUICIDE COMPLETED IP
JICIDE THREAT IP
ISPICIOUS CIRCUMSTANCE IP
ISPICIOUS PERSON IP
USPICIOUS VEHICLE IP
heft
heft from Motor Vehicle
HEFT FROM MOTOR VEHICLE IP
HEFT IP
RAFFIC ARREST IP
raffic Complaint
RAFFIC COMPLAINT IP
RAFFIC OBSTRUCTION IP
RAFFIC STOP IP
RANSPORT IP
respass to Property
RESPASS TO PROPERTY IP

INJURY ACCIDENT IP
NLAWFUL ACISIP
NWANTED SUBJECT IP
EHICLE LOCKOUT IP
'ARR/ ARREST IP
'ARRANT PICKUP IP
'eapons Violation
'EAPONS VIOLATION IP
'ELFARE CHECK IP
Z-Animal Call

Z-Suspicious Person
Z-Suspicious Vehicle
Z-Unwanted Subject
Z-ZONING IP

Total

4 4

1 1
3 3
2 2
1 1

1 1
57 57
1 1
1 1

3 3
101 35 6 142




Date:

Title:
Presented By:
Prepared By:

Background:

Attachments:

Fiscal Impacts:

Staff Recommendations:

Recommended Motion(s):

Town of

*aColumbineValley
Colorado

Request for Board of Trustee Action

October 18, 2022

Trustee Bill #5 — Series 2021 Building Codes
Jim Thelen, Chief Building Official

Jim Thelen, Chief Building Official

Tonight, the Board of Trustees will consider the adoption of the 2021
commercial building code; the International Building, Plumbing,
Mechanical, Energy Conservation, Fuel Gas, Property Maintenance,
Swimming Pool/Spa, and Elevator codes. The Town is presently
utilizing the 2018 International Residential Code and the 2017
National Electric Code.

A series of minor amendments from the codes as written are
presented for adoption in Columbine Valley.

To reflect a more accurate valuation for decks, patio covers and
garages the valuation tables have increased to $65.00 per square foot
for each of these projects. All other valuations remain the same. The
Trustees increased building permit fees with the adoption of the 2015
International Codes. A fee increase is not included in the ordinance,
however if the trustees wish to discuss an increase a Resolution will
be prepared.

Trustee Bill #5 — Series 2022

As presented, the increase in valuation for decks, patio covers and
garages would result in a slight increase in overall building
department revenue.

Approve as presented.

“I move to approve as presented Trustee Bill #5, 2022 on 1%
reading.”



TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY

TRUSTEE BILL NO. 5 INTRODUCTED BY TRUSTEE
SERIES OF 2022 TRUSTEE: AL TIMOTHY
A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

ADOPTING THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL’S 2021 INTERNATIONAL
BUILDING CODE; THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL’S 2021 INTERNATIONAL
RESIDENTIAL CODE; THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL’S 2021 MECHANICAL
CODE; THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL’S 2021 PLUMBING CODE; THE
INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL’S 2021 FUEL GAS CODE; THE INTERNATIONAL
CODE COUNCIL’S 2021 INTERTNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE; THE
INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL’S 2021 INTERNATIONAL ENERGY
CONSERVATION CODE; THE INTERNATIONAL CODE CONFERENCE’S 2021
INTERNATIONAL SWIMMING POOL AND SPA CODE; AMERICAN NATIONAL
STANDARD INSTITUTE / AMERICAN SOCIETY OF MECHANICAL ENGINEERS A.17.1
2019 AMERICAN SOCIETY OF MECHANICAL ENGINEERS A.17.3 2005; AMERICAN
SOCIETY OF MECHANICAL ENGINEERS A.18.1 2017 SAFETY CODE FOR ELEVATORS
WITH AMENDMENTS AND ALL APPENDICES THERETO; PROVIDING PENALTIES
FOR VIOLATIONS THERETO; ADOPTING AMENDMENTS; AND PROVIDING NOTICE
THAT COPIES THEREOF ARE AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION AT THE TOWN’S OFFICE
LOCATED AT 2 MIDDLEFIELD.

WHEREAS, the purpose of the International Building Code is to provide minimum
standards to safeguard life or limb, health, property, and the public welfare by regulating and
controlling the design, construction, quality of materials, use and occupancy. Location and
maintenance of all buildings and structures within this jurisdiction and certain equipment
specifically regulated therein;

WHEREAS, the purpose of the International Residential Code is to provide minimum
standards for the construction, alteration, movement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy,
location removal and demolition of one- and two-family dwellings.

WHEREAS, the purpose of the International Mechanical code is to provide minimum
requirements and standards for the protection of the public welfare by regulating and controlling
the design, construction, installation, quality of materials, location operation and maintenance, or
use of heating, ventilating, cooling, refrigeration systems, incinerators, and other miscellaneous
heat producing appliances within this jurisdiction.



WHEREAS, the purpose of the International Plumbing Code is to provide minimum
standards for the protection of the public health, safety and welfare by providing for the safe
installation and maintenance of sewage and water piping systems.

WHEREAS, the purpose of the International Fuel Gas Code is to provide minimum
standards for the protection of the public health safety and welfare by providing for safe
installation of fuel gas piping systems, fuel gas utilization equipment and related accessories;

WHEREAS, the purpose of the International Property Maintenance Code is to provide
standards to safeguard life, health and the public welfare by regulating and controlling the uses
and occupancy, location and maintenance of all buildings and structures;

WHEREAS, the purpose of the International Energy Conservation Code is to establish
minimum standards and regulations for the design of energy efficient constructions;

WHEREAS, the purpose of the International Fire Code is to establish the minimum
requirements for providing a reasonable level of fire safety and property protection from hazards
of fire, explosion or dangerous conditions in new and existing buildings;

WHEREAS, the purpose of the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code is to
regulate the construction, alteration, movement, renovation, replacement, repair and maintenance
of aquatic recreation facilities, pools and spas;

WHEREAS, copies of the above-mentioned documents are available for inspection in
the office Columbine Valley, Colorado during weekday business hours; and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE TOWN TRUSTEES OF THE TOWN
OF COLUMBINE VALLEY, COLORADO, THAT:

Section 1: Chapter 15.08 of the Town of Columbine Municipal code is hereby amended
to read:

15.08.010 Code adoption

15.08.020 Amendments, Modifications and Changes

15.08.010 INTERNATIONAL CODES ADOPTED: The following codes are
hereby adopted for use and regulation of buildings and structures within the town; said
codes shall be available for public inspection at all reasonable hours in the town offices



A)

B)

)

D)
E)
F)
G)
H)
D)

J)

A)

International Building Code, 2021 edition of the International Code Council, including
Appendix Chapter C and J.

International Residential Code, 2021 edition of the International Code Council.

International Mechanical Code, 2021 edition of the International Code Council, including
Appendix Chapter A.

International Plumbing Code, 2021 edition of the International Code Council.
International Property Maintenance Code, 2021 edition of the International Code Council.
International Fuel Gas Code, 2021 edition of the International Code Council.
International Energy Conservation Code, 2021 edition of the International Code Council.
International Fire Code, 2021 edition of the international Code Council. (Reserved)

American National Standard Institute/American Society of Mechanical Engineers (ASME) A17.1
2019 Safety code for Elevators and Escalators; (ASME) A17.3 2017 and (ASME) A18.1 2005
American National Standard Institute/American Society of Mechanical Engineers (ASME) A17.1
2007 Safety code for Elevators and Escalators; (ASME) A17.3 2005 and (ASME) A18.1 2017

International Swimming Pool and Spa Code, 2021 edition of the International Code Council.

Section 2: Chapter 15.08.020 of the Town of Columbine Valley Municipal Code is repealed and
reenacted to read.

15.08.020 AMENDMENTS, MODIFICATIONS AND CHANGES

Amendments to the International Building code: The following amendments are hereby
adopted to the International Building Code.

1) Chapter 1 is hereby deleted, the administrative requirements for the International Building
Code are in Section 15.40.20 of the Town Municipal Code.

2) Table 508.4 is hereby amended to read:

The required fire separation between a B occupancy and an F-1 occupancy shall be 1 hour, the required
fire separation between a B occupancy and an S-1 occupancy shall be 1 hour, the required fire separation
between an M occupancy and a F-1 occupancy shall be 1 hours, the required fire separation between an
M occupancy and an S-1 occupancy shall be 1 hours.

3) Section 1011.7.3 Exception is hereby deleted and reenacted to read:

Exception: Spaces under stairways serving and contained with single residential dwelling
unit in Group R-2 or R-# shall be permitted to be protected on the enclosed side with 5/8”
type x gypsum board.



B)

4)

Section 1601 is hereby amended by the addition of a new paragraph 1601.1 which shall

read:

1601.1 Design Criteria: The design criteria for the Town of Columbine Valley shall be as
follows:

5)
6)

Roof snow load
Nominal wind speed
Ultimate wind speed
Frost depth

Seismic design category

Termite
Decay
Weathering

Winter design temperature
Ice shield underlayment requires

Degree heating days
100-year hourly rainfall

30 psf.

110 mph

120 mph

36 inches

B

slight to moderate
none to slight
severe

1 degree

yes (see sec. 1507.2.8.2)
6200

2.67” per hour

Section 1704.14 is hereby amended by the deletion of the exceptions.

Section 2701.1 is hereby repealed and reenacted to read:

2701.1 Scope: This chapter govemns the electrical components, equipment and systems
used in building and structures covered by this code. The administrative code
requirements shall be in accordance with 18.08.020 of the Town of Columbine Valley

Municipal Code.

Amendments to the International Residential Code: The following amendments are hereby
adopted to the International Residential Code.

)
2)

3)

Prior to the issuance of the building permit HOA approval is required.

The height of a new single — family homes shall have the height certified by a
licensed Colorado Surveyor after the roof trusses are set.

Section R301.1 is hereby amended by the following paragraph:



Design Criteria: The design criteria or the Town of Columbine Valley shall be as follows:

0

4

Roof snow load 30 psf.

Nominal wind speed 110 mph
Ultimate wind speed 120 mph

Frost depth 36 inches

Seismic design category B

Termite slight to moderate
Decay none to slight
Weathering severe

Winter design temperature 1 degree

Ice shield underlayment requires yes (see sec. 1507.2.8.2)
Degree heating days 6200

100-year hourly rainfall 2.67” per hour

Table 302.6 Dwelling/Garage Separation, is hereby amended to read:

Separation

Materials

From the residence and attic

5/8” X gypsum board applied
To the garage side

From habitable rooms above garage

Not less than 5/8” X gypsum board

Structures supporting floor ceiling
assemblies used for separation
required by the section

Not less than 5/8” X gypsum board

Garages located less than 3 feet
from a dwelling unit on the same lot

Not less than 5/8” X gypsum board
applied to the interior side of the
exterior walls that are within this
area

Amendments to the International Plumbing Code: The following amendments are hereby
adopted to the International Plumbing Code.

1) Chapter 1 is hereby deleted; the administrative requirements for the International Plumbing
Code are in chapter 15.04.20 of the Town of Columbine Valley Municipal Code.

2) Section 305.4 is hereby repealed and reenacted to read:

305.4 Freezing: Water, soil and waste pipes shall not be installed outside the building, attic or
crawl spaces concealed in outside walls, or in any other place subject to freezing temperatures
unless adequate provision is made to protect such pipes from freezing by insulation or heat or
both. Exterior water supply piping shall be installed not less than 60” below grade.

3) Section 903.1 is hereby repealed and reenacted to read:

903.1 Roof Extensions: All open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall be
terminated at least 12” above the roof.



D)

4)

5)

Subsection 918.1 is hereby amended by the addition of a new paragraph 918.1.1 which
shall read:

918.1.1 Isometric drawings required: In other than one- and two-family dwellings, an
isometric drawing of the waste and vent system with location of air admittance valves
shall be provided. Such drawing shall be prepared and wet stamp and signed by a
registered Colorado Professional Engineer.

Subsection 1111.1 is hereby repealed and reenacted to read:

1111.1 Subsoil Drains: Subsoil drains shall be installed as required by the engineered
geo-technical soils report. Subsoil drains shall be open jointed, horizontally split, or
perforated pipe conforming to one of the standards listed in table 1102.5. Such drains
shall not be less than 4” in diameter. When the building is subjected to backwater, the
subsoil drain shall be protected by an accessibly located backwater valve. Subsoil drains
shall discharge to a trapped area drain, sump, drywell, or approved location above
ground. When the subsoil drains discharges into a pit locate within the structure, a sump
pump shall be provided and installed. The sump and plumbing system shall comply with
subsection 1113.1.

Amendments to the International Fuel Gas Code: The following amendments are hereby
adopted to the International Fuel Gas Code.

D

2)
3)

Chapter 1 is hereby deleted; the administrative requirements for the International Fuel
Gas Code are in chapter 15.04.20 of the Town of Columbine Valley Municipal Code.

Section 303.3 is hereby amended by the deletion of exceptions 3 and 4.

Section 406.4 is hereby repealed and reenacted to read:

406.4.1 Test pressure: The gas piping shall withstand a pressure of not less than10 pounds per

4
5)
6)

square inch gauge pressure as measured on a 30-pound gauge. Test pressures shall be
held for a length of time satisfactory to the administrative Authority, but in no case less
than 15 minutes, with no perceptible drop in pressure. For welded piping, and for piping
carrying gas at pressure more than fourteen inches water column, the test pressure shall
not be less than sixty pounds per square inch and shall be continued for a length of time
satisfactory to the administrative authority, but in no case less than thirty minutes. These
tests shall be made using air, C02, or nitrogen pressure only and shall be made in the
presence of administrative authority. All necessary apparatus for conducting tests shall
be furnished by the permit holder.

Section 406.4.2 is hereby deleted in its entirety and without substitution.
Section 501.8 is hereby amended by the deletion of items 8 and 10 hereof.

Section 621 is hereby deleted in its entirety and without substitution.



D)

E)

Amendments to the International Mechanical Code: The following amendments ae hereby
adopted to the international Mechanical Code.

1)

2)

Chapter 1 is hereby deleted: the administration requirements for the International
Mechanical Code are in chapter 15.0.20 of the Town of Columbine Valley Municipal
Code.

Section 902 is hereby amended by the addition of a new paragraph 902.1.1 which shall
read:

902.1.1 Decorative appliance in solid fuel masonry: Notwithstanding anything
contained in this code to the contrary, any new or remodeled solid fuel fireplace
shall be one of the following:

1) A gas appliance
2) An electric device or

3) A fireplace or fireplace insert that meet the most stringent emission standards for
wood stoves established by the Air Pollution Control Division Quality Control
Commission of the Department of Health of the State of Colorado, or any other
clean device that is approve by said commission.

Any person who installs or constructs any fireplace insert or fireplace shall
provide evidence of a certificate issued by the Air Pollution Control Division of
the Department of Health of the State of Colorado, and in the case of site-build
fireplace shall demonstrate compliance with the certificate.

Amendments to the International Property Maintenance Code: The following amendments
are hereby adopted to the International Property Maintenance Code.

2)

1) Subsection 107.1 is hereby amended by the following paragraph to be the last
paragraph thereof’

Statements advising that if any owner refuses or neglects to comply with an order issued
by the building official, and where conditions exist which make a building or premises
unsafe, dangerous, or hazardous, that the building official 1. Will order the building
vacated and posted to prevent further occupancy until the work is completed or/and (ii)
may proceed to cause the work to be done and charge the costs thereof against the
property or its owners. The giving of the notice provided for hereinabove shall not be a
condition precedent to the city’s right to prosecute, in its municipal court, any person for
any alleged violation of any of the terms of this code.

Section 107 shall be amended by the addition of subsection 107.7 to read:

Section 107.7 Extension of time to perform work: Upon receipt of an application form
the person required to conform to the order and by agreement of such person to comply
with the order if allowed additional time, the code official may grant an extension of
time, not to exceed an additional 120 days, within which to complete said repair,

7



3)

4)

rehabilitation or demolition, if the code official determines that such an extension of time
will not create or perpetuate a situation imminently dangerous to life or property. The
code official’s authority to extend time is limited to the physical repair, rehabilitation or
demolition to premises and will not in any way affect or extend the time to appeal the
notice an order.

Section 202 is hereby amended by the addition of the following definition.

NUISANCE: The Following shall be defined as nuisances as applied to the 2021
International Property Maintenance Code:

1) Any public nuisance known at common law or in equity jurisprudence.

2) Any attractive nuisance that may prove detrimental to children
whether in a building, on the premises of a building or on an
unoccupied lot. This includes any abandoned wells, shafts, basements
structurally unsound fences or structures; or any lumber, trash, debris,
or vegetation that may prove a hazard for inquisitive minors.

3) Whatever is dangerous to human life or is detrimental to health, as
determined by the Building Official.

4) Overcrowding a room with occupants.

5) Insufficient ventilation or illumination.

6) Inadequate or unsanitary sewage or plumbing facilities.

7) Uncleanliness, as determined by the Building Official.

8) Whatever renders air, food or drink unwholesome or detrimental to
health of human beings as determined by the Building Official.

Section 302.4 is hereby repealed and reenact to read:

302.4 Weeds: it is the duty of every person owning vacant or improved property,
including easements and drainage-ways within the Town, to keep cut within ten inches of
the ground all weeds and to keep said property free from brush and rubbish of all kinds.
However, this section shall not apply to vegetable gardens, flower gardens, and shrubbery
plots. Wheat, barley, oats, rye, and similar agricultural commodities also shall be
exempted from. Upon failure of the owner or agent having charge of a property to cut
destroy weeds after service of a notice of violation, they shall be subject to prosecution in
accordance with Section 106.33 and as prescribed by the Town of Columbine Valley.
Upon failure to comply with the notice of violation, any duly authorized employee of the
Town or contractor hired by the Town shall be authorized to enter upon the property in
violation and cut and destroy the weeds growing thereon, and the costs of such removal
and an administrative fee of forty percent of the cost, shall be paid by the owner of agent
responsible for the property.



F)

G)

D)

Amendments to the International Energy Conservation Code: The following amendments
are hereby adopted to the International Energy Conservation Code.

(Reserved)

Amendments to the International Fire Code: The following amendments are hereby adopted
to the international Fire Code.

(Reserved)

Amendments to the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code: The following
amendments are hereby adopted to the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code.

1)

2)

3)

Section 305.1 is hereby amended to read:

Section 305.1 General. The provisions of this section shall apply to the design of barriers
for restricting entry into area’s having pools and spas. Spas and hot tubs equipped with a
lockable cover complying with ASTM F1346 shall not be required to comply with
sections 3.5.2 Through 305.7.

Section 305.1 is hereby amended by a new section 305.1.1.2 which shall read:

Section 305.1.1.2 the maximum size of spas and hot tubs; spas and hot tubs shall not be
greater than 150 cubic feet. Maximum length is 10 feet, maximum width is 5 feet and
maximum depth is 3 feet. Spas and hot tubs larger than the given dimensions shall be
considered swimming pools.

Section 305.2.1 is hereby amended to read:

The top of the barrier shall not be less than 60” above grade were measured on the side of
the barrier that face away from the pool or spa. Such height shall exit around the entire
perimeter of the barrier and for 3 feet measured horizontally from the outside of the
required barrier.

Amendments to the American National Standard Institute / American Society of
Mechanical Engineers (ASME) A17.1 2007 Safety code for Elevators and Escalators;
(ASME) A17.3 2005 and (ASME) A18.1 2005 shall be as follows:

(Reserved)

Section 3: Section 15.08.030 is hereby amended to read:



MISCELLANEOUS PROJECT VALUATION SCHEDULE

PATIO COVER $65 PER SQUARE FOOT
DECK $65 PER SQUARE FOOT
GARAGE $65 PER SQUARE FOOT

Section 4: Severability.

If any part, section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase of this ordinance is for any
reason held to be invalid, such invalidity shall not affect the validity of the remaining
sections of this ordinance. The city council hereby declares that it would have passed this
ordinance, including each part, section, subsection, sentence, clause or sentences, clauses
or phrases may be declared invalid.

Section 5:  Repealer.
All ordinance or resolutions, or parts thereof, in conflict with this ordinance are hereby

repealed, provided that this repealer, shall not repeal the repealer, or clauses of such
ordinance nor revive any ordinance thereby.

10



PUBLIC HEARING on the ordinance to take place on the day of ,2022
in the offices of the Town of Columbine Valley, 2 Middlefield Road, Columbine Valley,

Colorado, at the hour of 6:00 p.m., or as soon thereafter as it may be heard.

Introduced as Trustee Bill No. 5, series of 2022 at a regular meeting of the Board of Trustees of
the Town of Columbine Valley, Colorado, on the 18" day of October 2022, passed by a vote of ___ for
and ___ against, on first reading; passed on second reading, as Trustee Bill No. 5, 2022, at a regular
meeting of the Board of Trustees by a vote of ___ for and___ against on the 15" day of November

2022, and ordered published in the Littleton Independent on the  day of , 2022.

Roy Palmer, Mayor

TRUSTEE BILL NO. 5
SERIES OF 2022

ATTEST:

J.D. McCrumb,
Clerk of the Town of Columbine Valley

11



Date:

Title:
Presented By:
Prepared By:

Background:

Attachments:

Staff Recommendations:

Recommended Motion:

Town of

YaColumbineValley
Colorado

Request for Board of Trustee Action

October 18, 2022
2022 Trails Addendum
Brent Kaslon, Town Planner

Brent Kaslon, Town Planner

In the fall of 2021 the Board of Trustees directed the creation of a
community committee to consider options for trails in Columbine
Valley. The trails committee met during the first quarter of 2022 for a
total of three meetings to discuss the possibilities for a trail system
within the Town of Columbine Valley. Proposals for creating
connections within Town limits were identified, discussed, and
finalized in concept. These proposals include the Platte Canyon Road
Sidewalk, new trails connections, and the changes to the existing
infrastructure as improvements are made to create a loop “trail”
within the Town limits of Columbine Valley.

Consensus was gained by all the members of the committee that the
proposals included in the addendum to the master plan were feasible
but would also add to the betterment of the Town. Careful
consideration of the needs of the community and the concerns made
by Columbine Country Club comments were addressed. These
proposals were presented in concept and were also endorsed in
concept by the Club Executive Board.

This committee consisted of Trustee Boyle, the Planning
Commission Chair, two residents of the Town at large, a Columbine
Country Club Representative, the Town Planner, and the Town
Administrator.

In March of 2022, the Trustees reviewed the draft addendum and
instructed staff to proceed making it an official amendment to the
2020 Master Plan.

The Planning and Zoning Commission met on October 11, 2022,
held a public hearing, and then unanimously approved the addendum
as presented.

Trails Addendum Staff Summary
2022 Trails Addendum

Approve as presented.

“I move to approve the 2022 Trails Addendum as presented.”



Town of Columbine Valley 2020 Master Plan — Trail Addendum 2022

What is the 2020 Master Plan?

The master plan is a document prepared for the Town of Columbine Valley to guide future growth and
development. The 2020 Master Plan was the first update since 2007, and the plan reflects resident feedback
collected in 2019. Resident input was sought through online and paper surveys, in-person questionnaires, and open
houses. Staff and the Planning & Zoning Commission then prepared the draft plan.

The 2020 Master Plan created vision and mission statements to guide the direction of the Town for the next decade.

Master Plan Vision: “To remain a friendly, attractive, safe and desirable community — in a fast-growing metro area
— through thoughtful development and civic policies.”

Master Plan Mission: “To preserve our small-town heritage and quality of life by providing high-quality public
services and giving citizens a voice in shaping the town’s future.”

The plan reaffirms the traditional values that have long characterized Columbine Valley while recognizing that the
Town has grown and changed, which brings new challenges and opportunities. The master plan updated included
chapters on land use goals; parks and open space; trails and connections; roadways and transportation; floodplain

management; and lastly programs, services, and utilities.

2022 - Trails Addendum Summary
During our public engagement process in the 2020 Master Plan, many residents expressed a desire for more trails in
Town and better connections to existing trails. The current master plan recommendations include:

¢ Create safe connections from Columbine Valley to schools and regional trails.
Expand the Wild Plum trail system to connect subdivisions and improve the off-street experience.
Preserve unofficial Town trails.
Investigate better access to the Mary Carter Greenway and South Platte Park, avoiding Bowles Avenue.
Work with partners to improve trail access to Downtown Littleton, the South Platte River, regional trails,
and adjacent parks.
e Acquire existing underutilized open space in Town to create an internal trail corridor.

To further develop a plan that incorporates the desires of the community, staff along with a formalized trails
committee created an addendum to the master plan that formulates an implementation strategy for the development
of these trails and connections. This committee met during the first quarter of 2022 for a total of three meetings to
discuss and the possibilities for a trail system within the Town of Columbine Valley. Proposals for creating
connections within Town limits were identified, discussed, and finalized in concept. These proposals include the
Platte Canyon Road sidewalk, new trail connections, and changes to the existing infrastructure as improvements are
made to create a loop “trail” within the Town limits of Columbine Valley.

Consensus was gained by all the members of the committee that the proposals included in the addendum to the
master plan were feasible but would also add to the betterment of the Town. Careful consideration of the needs of
the community and the concerns made by Columbine Country Club comments were addressed. These proposals
were presented in concept and were also endorsed in concept by the Club Executive Board.

This committee consisted of a Town of Columbine Valley Trustee, the Planning Commission Chair, two residents
of the Town at-large, a Columbine Country Club Representative, the Town Planner, and the Town Administrator.



Town of

ColumbineValley

Colorado

Master Plan 2020

Trails Addendum 2022




Acknowledgments

Committee Members:
« Kathy Boyle - Trustee

« Sandy Graham - Planning Commission Chair

» Tony Gorski - Columbine Country Club Representative
« Marti Cardi - Community Member

« Kimberly Danielson - Community Member

« JD McCrumb - Town Administrator

Staff:

» Brent Kaslon - Town Planner

« Kristen Ruberg - Associate - Valerian LLC

» Becca Randolph - Landscape Designer - Valerian LLC

Town of Columbine Valley Master Plan, Trails Addendum | 2022



Purpose

Columbine Valley Trails Addendum

In 2019, the Town completed a rigorous Master Planning effort that presented a comprehensive vision for
moving Columbine Valley into the next decade. During the public engagement process, some residents
expressed a desire for trails within the Town of Columbine Valley. Thus the Master Plan included the

goals of expanding the trail system within the
Town limits as much as possible and improving
off-street movement of pedestrians, bicycles,
and golf carts. This plan is an addendum to the
2020 Town of Columbine Valley Master Plan.

Background

The existing pedestrian and bicycle modalities

mix off-street pathways and streets. Off-street

pathways are found only in a few spots including
dedicated trails in the Wild Plum neighborhood,
the Burning Tree drainage connection to Fairway
Lane, and maintenance paths through the
Drainageway D corridor in the Willowcroft and
Brookhaven neighborhoods. The town also has
a few sidewalk connections along Hunter Run
Lane, Platte Canyon Road, and Bowles Avenue.
Most pedestrians use the streets when walking
through Town considering the Town does not
have an identified trail system. The current
configuration requires an “out and back” route
that is caused by the lack of connection between
the streets and pathways through Town. An out
and back trip is identified as starting at a certain

Columbine Valley Residents using multi-modal streets for
walking. (Photo courtesy of Jay Neese)

spot, reaching a goal or end of a street, turning back around, and reversing down the same path that

was originally taken.

Trails Addendum

A Board of Trustees-appointed citizen working group has identified a composite system that could
be implemented using both existing infrastructure and new connections or linkages with the goal of
creating a “loop” system within the Town boundaries. This loop system would include both off-street

Town of Columbine Valley Master Plan, Trails Addendum | 2022 3



Trails Addendum

and on-street pedestrian and bicycle movement modalities. These different proposed action items
are discussed and illustrated on the following pages. The loop system could then be supplemented
by other segments including a Brookhaven Extension, a Watson Lane connection, a Burning Tree/
Polo Meadows Extension, and a Platte River Extension. These extensions would help to connect the
remaining neighborhoods not directly adjacent to the primary loop as identified in the supplemental
map. Street striping would also be added to select streets to delineate the on-street trail system as
identified in the supplemental maps and separate pedestrians and bicyclists from vehicular traffic.

Many of the proposals in this plan involve constraints both identified and unidentified such as existing
easements, ownership hurdles, and stakeholder feedback gathering. As each proposal moves forward,
the Town would seek input from residents and stakeholders and look for solutions to constraints.

Lastly, funding the proposed linkage program will be considered. Staff is prepared to explore the use of
grants through jurisdictions including Arapahoe County and the Colorado Department of Transportation
and funding that may include but is not limited to the Mile High Flood District and South Suburban Parks
and Recreation District.

The identified missing links in the system have been delineated as the following proposals. An
implementation plan is listed at the end of this document that discusses timing for each of the proposals.

Proposal A - Platte Canyon Road Sidewalk from Village Court to the Ponds Circle Pedestrian Light

While taking public comment for the Master Plan in 2019, the Town learned that children were using
the intersection of Village Court and Platte Canyon Road to get to Wilder Elementary. Pedestrians
also are crossing Platte Canyon Road to access the Columbine Trail on the west side of the highway.
This is an unsignalized crossing that is highly dangerous and needs mitigation. Staff is working on the
feasibility of extending the sidewalk that currently runs from Fairway Lane to the Ponds Circle signal to
create a safer alternative to crossing Platte Canyon Road. The trails committee considers this a priority
for action.

Proposal B - Dutch Creek Connection from Fairway Lane at Platte Canyon Road to Fairway Lane
on the south side of Dutch Creek

Currently, pedestrians, bicyclists, and golf carts from the south side of Town (Old Town, Burning Tree,
Polo Meadows, and Wild Plum) must loop around Fairway Lane or cross through the golf course to get to
the club, pool, or anywhere on the north side of Columbine Valley. This proposed connection would use
the open space along Dutch Creek to create a trail from the south side of the creek to the north side
of the creek linking the north side of Fairway Lane to south side of Fairway Lane. The surrounding area
would be kept largely in a natural state to align with the use as a drainageway and serve as more of a
passive-use park. This trail would provide a safer route to school for southern neighborhoods as well
as a safer route to the club that does not require using the cart paths that could interrupt golf play.

Proposal C - Brookhaven Trail Connection from Brookhaven Trail to Brookhaven Lane

This connection would finish the maintenance pathway from Brookhaven open space, connecting
Watson Lane and the rest of Columbine Valley. This could bring pedestrian, bicycle and golf cart use
off Brookhaven Lane, thus improving safety. This project would also add a soft surface secondary trail
through the open space with added benches and plantings.

Town of Columbine Valley Master Plan, Trails Addendum | 2022 4



Trails Addendum

Proposal D - Watson Lane Connection

The current connection between Watson Lane and Brookhaven Trail is designated only for residents in
those two neighborhoods. Opening this connection to everyone would help to serve the larger Town of
Columbine Valley community by creating new routes to Bowles, but could also serve the larger Watson
Lane Sub-Area if or when it is ever redeveloped.

Proposal E - Formalize the South Platte Levee Trail Loop at Fairway Lane and Wild Plum

This connection is currently being used as an unauthorized trail along the South Platte River levee
along an old gravel maintenance path. This connection would allow for the formalization of the path
with crusher fines and better access from Wild Plum Lane instead of through the cart path on hole #13
at the intersection into Wild Plum. This South Segment would create a loop away from the line of play
in the naturalized area east of Hole #13 of the Columbine Country Club. This trail would also establish
the only spot in the Town to experience the South Platte River.

Proposal F - Formalize the South Platte Levee Trail from South Platte Loop Trail (Proposal E) to
Driver Lane

Continuing the South Platte River extension loop in Proposal E, this trail would follow the existing
Columbine County Club maintenance path, pass the maintenance facility, and connect to Driver Lane.
There would also be a connection created north of the tee boxes at #14 near the maintenance facility
to Driver Lane, helping to complete a loop system.

Proposal G - Striping of the Streets to be used as Trails

As streets are resurfaced as a part of the Capital Improvements Program, the streets that are identified
to be used as trails may be redesigned to remove the steep crowns and re-striped to show the areas in
which pedestrians and bicyclists are to use the streets. This striping will be used to help create a safe
environment for the users, help identify the loop, and to make vehicle drivers aware that these streets
are to be shared.

Proposal H - Fairway Lane - Dutch Creek Bridge

The existing bridge on Fairway Lane that crosses over Dutch Creek, just south of the Columbine Country
Club Clubhouse, has been identified as a pinch point for pedestrians, bicyclists, golf cart and passenger
vehicles. The proposal will investigate the use of the turfgrass shoulder area for the separation of
pedestrians and bicyclists from the golf cart and passenger vehicles on Fairway Lane.

These proposals are also shown on the maps in the appendix of this document.

Maps included:

« Map A - Existing Trail System

« Map B - Comprehensive Trail Map

« Map C - Identified Linkage Program
« Map D - Nevada Ditch Locator

Town of Columbine Valley Master Plan, Trails Addendum | 2022 5



Trails Addendum

Implementation

Implementation of this trail master plan is likely to take many years and there is not currently a formal
strategy for each of the proposals to be completed. The plan is intended to be a working guide for
the future as opportunities may be presented to the Town with funding partners or as other needed
infrastructure improvements are completed. The Trail Committee recommends Proposal A as the top
priority due to the current safety concerns at Platte Canyon Road. The Committee then recommends
to continue down the list of proposals for Proposal B, C, and E. Proposal D would be on a development
timeline, as properties sell and redevelop in the future. Proposal F would be an on-going coordination
effort with the Columbine County Club, The Town of Columbine Valley and Corps of Engineers as
easements are renewed. Proposal G will be ongoing as streets are updated. Prior to any completion
or construction of any of these projects, the Board of Trustees shall be presented with the project for
approval in coordination with any stakeholders.

Nevada Ditch

The Trail Committee acknowledges that the addendum does not cover every potential trail in the Town,
and urges the Town to periodically identify additional ways to encourage walking and bicycling as the
years pass. One potential addition to the trail system could be the Nevada Ditch. The ditch is omitted
from this addendum because first, it is not necessary for completion of the loop system and second,
its future has not been determined. The ditch’s ownership, water flow, and stormwater management
are just a few of the variables that must be determined before it could be considered as an amenity
to the trail system.

Town of Columbine Valley Master Plan, Trails Addendum | 2022 6



Trails Addendum

Map A — Existing Trails Within Columbine Valley

LT UL
4§ RIPS
YT

“ur - -

/A

=
N

BEAEEL

f

S5
EHE!HEEEIFI

av
HEAS
CITET

m @
i—{ R |
/]

A s=upppEl

3
2

Existing Trails (On-Street and Off-Street)

Existing Trails (Private)

Qutside Town of Columbine

|:J Valley Limits

Town of Columbine Valley Master Plan, Trails Addendum | 2022



Trails Addendum

Map B — Identified Linkage Program

L d @ Platte Canyon Road Sidewalk
egen
9 . ® Dutch Creek Trail Connection

Existing Trails © Brookhaven Trail Connection
esssscecsses  Potential Trails

©® watson Lane Connection

On-Street Trail Striping Proposal
® South Platte River Loop Trail

Identified Linkage P I
gRTrepases ® South Platte River Trail Connection to Driver Lane

[ ] Outside Town of Columbine © striping of Streets as Trails

kally tiplts 0 Fairway Lane/Dutch Creek Bridge

Town of Columbine Valley Master Plan, Trails Addendum | 2022 8



Trails Addendum

Map C — Comprehensive Trail System

Extension
Watson

West 8°
Lane
Extension_
$
@
k7
N
3
)/
4 Platte River
Extension
Burning Tree / }
Polo Extension
Legend
Primary Loop mmmmmm=  \Watson Lane Extension
mmmmmmm= Burning Tree / Polo Extension mmmmeme Platte River Extension
Brookhaven Extension Outside Town of Columbine
I_—_l Valley Limits

Town of Columbine Valley Master Plan, Trails Addendum | 2022



Trails Addendum

Map D — Nevada Ditch Locator

Nevada Ditch

BYSINY Samsavsy

B 0,9 )
*:‘.llnnn- |
SappnnpnEEn||

Proposed Trail System
B — Nevada Ditch

|: Qutside Town of Columbine
Valley Limits

Town of Columbine Valley Master Plan, Trails Addendum | 2022 10



Date:

Title:
Presented By:
Prepared By:

Background:

Attachments:

Recommended Motion:

Town of

“aColumbineValley
Colorado

Request for Board of Trustee Action

October 18, 2022

Set Public Hearing for FAMLI Opt-Out
J.D. McCrumb, Town Administrator
J.D. McCrumb, Town Administrator

In order to consider actions regarding the Family Medical Leave and
Insurance Program, the Trustees must first hold a public hearing,
Staff will be recommending that the Town opt-out of the program.

Staff memo re FAMLI
FAMLI information packet
Draft resolution for consideration at November meeting

“I move to set a Public Hearing for consideration of the Family
Medical Leave and Insurance Program for Tuesday, November 15,
2022 at the Columbine Valley Town Hall.”



October 12, 2022

To: Columbine Valley Board of Trustees
From: Kate Eckel, HR Consultant
RE: State of Colorado FAMLI Leave for Local Governments

Information on Colorado Family and Medical Leave Insurance Program (FAMLI)

What is FAMLI?

FAMLI is a state funded paid leave program. It covers up to 12 weeks (additional 4 weeks for
pregnancy/birth of a child) of partial wage replacement. This fund was implemented to financially assist
and protect employees who are caring for themselves or a family member with a serious health
condition, birth/adoption/foster care of a child, care of military member, and victims of domestic
violence. FAMLI will start providing benefits to employees beginning January 1, 2024. Employees may
receive up to 90% of their pay through the FAMLI benefit.

Beginning January 1, 2023, Colorado Employers with over nine (9) employees will begin collecting
premiums of 0.9% of their employees’ wages and submitting to the State of Colorado Fund for Paid
Family and Medical Leave.

Local Governments

With this said, Local Governments may “opt out” of this program. Local Governments have the
following three options.

1. Participate in FAMLI. The premiums are set to 0.9% of employees’ wage with 0.45% paid by the
employer, CV, and 0.45% paid by the employee

2. Decline all participation: Local government would vote no to participation. Employees would still
have the option to participate in FAMLI and would register as an independent contractor

3. Decline Employer Participation: Employees have the option of participating at 0.45% that CV
would collect and submit payment to the government FAMLI plan.

While opting out is an option, both City of Littleton and City of Aurora are offering paid Short Term
Disability policies for their employees instead of the State of Colorado FAMLI fund. These policies
typically cover 12 weeks of partial salary replacement. Other local governments who have decided to
“opt out” include Lyons, Kremmling, Milliken, Meeker, Eaton, Canon City, Creede, New Castle, Bennett,
Bayfield, Fountain and Johnstown. The City of Windsor has decided on the employee only option.

Columbine Valley also offers a Short-Term Benefit policy as an ancillary benefit that can be paid for
under the Town’s cafeteria plan. Unfortunately, all of the carriers declined to underwrite short term



Important details:
All employers must register their intentions with the State of Colorado by the end of the year.

The benefits of participating in the state funded plan or having an equivalent plan is that it will
be easier to recruit quality talent with a benefit like this in place. Employees who experience
significant illness/birth of child or the iliness of a child/spouse/parent will be able to take time
off without worrying if they have funds to pay their bills. Studies have shown that employers
who offer similar benefits experience greater employee loyalty and lower turnover.

Staff Recommendation: Per the Town Administrator, it is recommended that the Town “Opt Out”
of the State Funded plan and remind all employees of their ability to sign up for the Short-Term
Disability benefit under the Town’s Cafeteria plan.



@ S lhs FAMILY AND MEDICAL
e e LEAVE INSURANCE

GOVERNMENT
GUIDE




£

LERITENETEN
asnqy Jo 3]npssy |pnNxas
uoiipuo) y3)paH snolas
3AD3) |D31pawt pup Ajwpf piod
JU3LWILLIZA0Y |D20T
Apog Buiuiaron
Viwd
Jaquaw Ajwoq
wvd
aafojdw3y
]DNPIAIPU] Pa13A0)
SITTWVA Ul OYM s5,0UM
a)p)dwa) uoi3paifizoN
aafo)dw3 a)qpziwo3sn)
sJafo)dw3 Buiapdidi3ing
1V J0f 133504
Wwooy ypa.lg piDpupls
N0 3d0 oYM SIUSLILIZACD
|p307 J0J 133504 Wooy ypalg
sjoo].

3pIN9 JUALIUIBAOS) |07 [TWVH

6L 19pisuo) 03 sajeq Aay
saujjawi) Supop
s2aAo0)dw3 1noj Af130N
uoistAld ITWYH ay3 Af130N
waysAs ITWvd ay3
YIIM J3)5183Y
IIWvd ut uoljodiaiyind
dnoj auiuwiiajag
ITWV4 10} aiedalg 03 MoH
uoi3nd1a13404
¥IA0TdW3 autj2ag
Ll uoi3odidiyiod TV aui)rag
uoypdp3nd J)nd
SIUSLIUIAA0D
]e307 40} uopjeddpyieg
{PapuUNy ITWv4 st Moy
{519)J0M JlaUaq [TWYL S0P MOH
iuoljeziuedio
Aw Jyauaq |TWv4 s20p MoH
9l ETWYA SEIeym

SHUIUO0)D

SPIND JUAWUIIA0D |80 [TWVY4



‘uojjeziuesio

ay3 10y 153q s1 JeY) AeMm JIAITRUM UL
Spasdu ylom Bunsal ayy Ny Auesodway
0} WOP33J} aY) SIUIWILISAOD 1BI0T
aplaoid ued sBulaes Aouedea ay) ‘aAea)
ITWv4d uo Ino st aakojdwa ay3 ajlym
KINIGIX3Y SIUSWLIDA0Y 18207 sapiaoad
wesdoud w4 ayL :9|qixald s,3

*s99A01dwa mau uresy pue aly

0] paau ayj udnpai Aq sSulaes apiaoad
uing ut s yoym uoledidijsed adioy
Joge) 3so0q pue ‘f3tanonpoud ‘Juajey
UlRIJ SJUIWLISADY 1B307 djay Tim
uol3oejsiyes qol YaiH “('#u “yiom puo uawopm
Jof 123u3) $138n) BDIOPIOM 3Y] UL ULRLLIDI
pue sqol 11ay3 01 uinjal 03 K12y aiow
3Je aAea) pled 03 s53208 YIm saakojdwa
PUR ‘(r107 M7 34037 K)ju1n4 piog 5,0140)1103)
alelow aakojdwa 1500q UED AR Ajlwey
pred 03 $5320® 1Y) SMOYS UdJeasay
UoIoRSIIRS JANIOM SaSEAIIU] )

*spaau Ajwey Asejljiw ssaippe pue
‘32U3j0LA |BNX3S JO J11saWOop 03 puodsal

‘PIlYd M3U B YyIM puoq ‘salduadisws
1edtpaw Ajiwe;j Jo jeuossad Joj ased

03 §j0 awy pred apiaoid Ajgepioyse 0y
s128pnq Ja3y813 Yum suakojdwa sy qnd
‘19)eWs SMO)E [Twvd “39%20d Jo Jno
9ARS) (edipaw pue Ajwej pred apiaoid
03 31qe aq yBiw ssakojdwa 1adie) ajym
*a31e1s ayy ul suskojdwa sreaud Jaylo
yim Juaje) doy Joj a3adwod 193139 03
0peI0j0) $5040F 51940)dWS JUSLIUIAACS
12301 31qeUd ||tm [TWY4 ‘a8eloys

Joqe) BuloB-uo Jua.uNd 3yl YIm
:3310y) jo 19ho]dw3 ue awodag noj

‘sBulAes

150D 3z/jeal 0] )qe aq Aew aAea) Ajwey
pred Jayjo 1o aaea) Ajiusajew aplaosd
01 19¥20d-jo-1no Surhed Apuaund ale
Jey) s1afojdw3 “juem si1ayiom opelo)o)
Jey) Jyauaq e pue weiSoid aa1da)e
1502 B S| [TWVA 19A1303))3 350D 5,3

‘weusosd aoueinsu|
uawhojdwaun ay) se 3)npayds alues ayy
Uo pue Aem awes ay) u} yom Ajasie) jIm

1 uUL3siuwpe 0} Asea si Wy :Ase3 s,

cuoneziuebio Awx

gausq I'TINVA
S90p MOH

n 3PIND JUALILIBA0S 2207 [TWV4

Al

‘weJBoud wv4 3yl Aq papiaoid asouy uelp sjyauaq Jajeals

40 1enba apaoid jeyy sueid ayeaud Sulkjienb 1ajj0 oym siakoydiwa 10323s ayeAud
PUE SJU3LWIUISAOY 18307 J0) SUO[3dadXa 3LLOS aJe 9Jay] 'S13XYI0OM 03 SIyausq Ino
Aed )M 3813 puny au3 03 swnjwaid aINqLIUOD )M saakojdwa pue siafojdwa yjog

*swesSo.d uni-a3e3s Jejiwis ssed 03 anuUO $33e1S AlowW
pue ‘we.o.d 3Ae3) |e31paW Ajiwey pied e a3e31)108) 03 33835 LIUIU BU3 S| Opelojod)

*1doddns 1aj0A
%LS UMM 0Z0T J9qWSAON U} 513104 opetojo) Aq paaoidde sem aaneniul ay

'suop3eal|dwod yiqpiya Jo Aoueudald aduauadxa oym asoyy Lo}
$}22m 91 03 dn pue paau uo Suipuadap aAea] pred jo $Haam z| 03 dn 3ye] 0} 3|qe aq
114 s13xIoM 31q18113 350 *suaddey aj1] USYM SIUO PIAC] 13U} JO SIAJISLIAY] JO 3.8

Bupiey pue 323ydAed e Suluiea uaamIaq 3SO0YD 0} DARL 3,UOM PUR SIIURISLUNDIID
Ulead Bulnp aAe3] pled 03 SS3J08 SABY SI3%JOM OPEIO|0D ISOLU INSUS J)LM [TWVA

‘weagold (ITWy4) 2ueInsu| aABaT Je2IPay pue AjlWES S,0peI0|0]) St ITWVA

¢I'TINVAI St yeym

SPIND JUSILIAA0S |80 [TWVH

14




%z "1 1@ padded Ajuoinjess sp wniwaud ayy
Inq ‘ejnurio £q pajsnfpe aq Aew ajes wnjwaid [IWy4 ay3 ‘5zoz ul SuuuiSag

“Jyauaq aakojdwa pappe ue se wnywaid ayy jo aueys ,saakoldws ay) jo |je Lo
awos Aed 03 uolydo 3y SARY SIUBWLLIBAOD 12207 ‘siako)dwa J0}das ajeAud ayl snr

‘safiem saakojdwa Jiay)

40 %&b 243 wal 5[ |)1m pue wnywaud ay) Jo aseys s,1ako1dws ay3 aINqLIIUOD
03 2ARY JOU |)im ‘s23f01dWa J1ama) J0 SUIU YIM SIUIWILLIBACD |BI0T *safem Jiay)
40 %60 Aed osje )M J9K01dwa JUaLWLISAOS 1BI0) J19Y) PUR ‘SaSem J1aY) JO ¥CH0
2INquUIU0d )M saakojdwy *saakojdwa yim wniwaid ay) Jo 3509 ay3 Jds Jm
wesdosd ay3 uy s1edpdiiied o) asooyd oym ssakojdwa +Q) YIm SJUBLLILLISADY) B30T

*%6°0 S $Z0Z YSnoayy a3es wnwaud ay|

‘puny
® ojul pted st Jeyl wnjwaud e ySnoyy papuny wesSoid aduelnsu; JeI1D0S B S| ITWY4

cPopuny
I'TINV] ST MOH

H BPIND JUSWUIBA0D 2307 TWV4

(Z102 *ainypasuj

Apunioddg sjwouerz) *paIIA0IB aaey Kay)
910J3Q 3Jom 0] Bujwinial Aq SaARSWAY)
ainfuial Jo asdejas pjnod suoypuod
Yaeay dIuodyd Yaim s1axiom Jey) 12y
53] 31 sayew pue saunful qof-ay}-uo

40 SJUaPIDUL S3INP3J BAR3| |BJIPAW pue
Ajwe) pred smoys Jayuny yoseasay

(pu *yimasg 3)qoyinb3) *y30Ys

JIWOU0I3 0] PEI| PIN0I 1Y) SIWILY
Buunp ssauys pue AJUNdasul jedueuy
$9InpaJ pue ‘pasnful Jo 1)L USYM s3u0
P3AO] PUR S3A]B5WAY) 10 SJBD SISHI0M
519] 9AR3) SUlAISaIED pue Jedlpaw pied

(1z0z 4ai0s-upssoy) ~yyjeay winyedysod
lewsazew yoedwi AjaAnisod ued siayjey

Joy aAea] pied paseaidut 0} ssa32e
pue Aqixay ade)dyiom alow Suuay0

(£28-06£ $380d 2107 '1129 7 J0pos

-uouppl) *pooypliyd Alea puoaq Suiise)
uaJpjly> Joj s1yauaq yjjeay juesyjusis
sey osje jnq ‘sjuased mau Joj SaWOIIN0
ynesy uo 3oedw) aanisod e sey Ajuo
J0u 2Aea) Jejuated pred smoys Yaseasay

(p'u ‘yamaun 3igounb3) *£JLINDAS JIWIOUODD

s, Allwey e sadueyua pue ‘yeay jewsalew
sarosdwy ‘Juawdojaaap Ayjjeay s, Ajwey
€ 03 $31nqLIU0D plIY2 433504 Jo pardope
Anuadas ‘ulogmau e 10) 918D 03 JJ0
awy pred aAey sjuased mau Suunsug

¢STINIOM JIJOUDq
ITINVA S°0p MOH

BpING JUAWUIBA0Y |8I07 |TWV4 n



(]

*julod Aue je u; 3do ued saakodwa
859y ‘pouad jJualu)jolua ou S| 313y

'9]qea3s3.0) S| 2Ae3) UaYm Ajuo
uj undo ploAe 03 sJeak 2aiy) 3sea) Je
10} 93ed1dijted 03 J1wwod 03 paJinbal

3l sjenplalpul asay) ‘weisoid
au) ojul undo Ajueunjoa uodn

"WR3sAs ayy ojul wniwald

A)13)senb e Supiwal pue eyep afem
412 Supjiodal J)1as 10j 3)qisuodsal
3q ])iM pUB JUN0JJE UMO J1ay3}
2)eald ||IM 3akojdwa enplalput ay |

"WalsAs [TWv4 aujjuo syl elA

PInom uosiad pafoldwa }jas e wioy
PUB J3UUELL aWes 3y} ul a8elanod
32312-}19s pInom saakoldwa asay)

‘wnjwald aakojdwa ay3 Jo ¥6p'0
2y Aed 03 pasinbai aq Ajuo pjnom

saafojdws asay] ‘sjuawhed wnywaid
UMO J13y3 J{LWaJ pue safem UMD Jiay
Uodai 0 paau 1M aledidiyed o)
9500y AjeunioA oym saakoldwy

*as00yd 0s A3}

J1 Bunedidiyred Jo uopdo a3 aaey
nns ‘wesSoud ay3 jo 3no 3do 03 3104
JBY) SIU3WILIBA0D 1B20T JO saakojdwy

*adejd uj ueyd aAea) pied jusjeainba
ue 9AeY 03 paJinbal Jou aJe weiSoid
ITWv4 au3 ut uojedidiJed autdap

0] 9]0A OYM SJUSLWILISAOS) 18I0

‘uonedioped

SUL23p 03 310A JISL] JO UOISIALG ITWVH
83 Aj130u 03 Wa3sAs ITwy4 3yl uj
42351821 35N JUAIUIIACSY) 18307 2y |

*uopjeddiyied
11® 8U1123p 03 330A Isniu Apoq
BUILIBADE 5,UaWUIAA0Y |20 3y L

uonedidnied Ty auroaq

BPING JUSWUIAACH 8307 [TWV4

*(safem

40 %Sk°0) wniwaud ay3 Jo aleys

Saafojdwa 1133 ym Suoje sapienb

B 3JUO UOISLAI] U} 0} BIRp afem

JILIGNS 0] Pasu )M JUSLLILISACL)
18207 3Y3 ‘SOLIRUDS YIOQ U] «

*S98BM JO ¥Gb°0 JO 1810 € oy
aleys saakojdwa ayy Jo ¥6p°0 a4l
Sumiwal Joy ajqisuodsal 1)13s 51 Inq

‘aseys 1afkoydwa auyy jo ¢G40 2y3 Aed

0] 3ABY J0U S30P JUIWIUIIA0Y 18307
9y} « saakojdwa | ueyy 1omMa4 «

*SIBEM JO %6°0 JO 1210] B 10} UOISIAG
Mwv4 ay3 03 ateys ,saakojdwa ayy
JO %GH°0 SYI JIWDI |)IM pue ,‘safem
40 %G#°0 ‘wniwaud ay) jo aseys
1akojdws ayy Aed )M JusWUIaA0n
18207 343 « saafojdwa alow 10 Q) «

JUDUILIBIAOL) |€D0T JO 9ZIS

‘paJinbai st 210A ou ‘wessoud 3y

u 3jedpaied 03 sueid JUaWLIBA0S 18207 Y3 4 1akojdwa 10123s ajeaud yeadAy Aue
1] JUNOIDR UR 918310 PUB LWAISAS |TWyH SU3 Ul 131515 ISNW JUSWLISA0D 18I0 AL

| "INV ur syedonieg

‘uonedidpied YIAOTIWI BUdaa «

uoljediyed Ty aulpag  «

"19hojdwa 10323s ajeapd Jayjo
Aue a1 3snf ITwv4 ul 9jedpiied  «

‘ued Jafojdwa Juswulaaos (ea0)

v ‘wesosd uns-aye3s ayy ut uoyyeddised

419y} Buipiesal suopydo aalyy aey
SJUSWWIAA0Y) Je207 *wedsoud ay) jo no
1do 031 Ajiqe 3y SJUSWILIAA0Y |30
OpEI0J0) DAL 0] UIJILIM SBM 3IMels
Twvd ayy ‘suafojdwa ajeaud aynun

SIUDWIUIDAON)
1€J0'T 10J S19AI]
uonedidnied

3PIND JUSWUIIA0Y |e207 [TWYA a



‘UoIsIALg WYL

3y} 03 Jayenb e aduo ejep afem

Sulpuodsaliod pue (safem Jo %c'0)

wnwaid ayy jo aleys s,3240)dwa

ay3 J1Wwal pue suol1anpap jjoiied

Auejun)oa s,2afojdwa ue ajeINOR)

*weadold wy4 ay3 Jo Jyauaq PINOM JUSLLILISA0Y |B307 3Y) Ing
uol32330.4d qof ay3 Aq pataaod aq jou ‘wniwald Jakojdwa ayy Suihed
1M “Ino s3do JuawiuIaA0D 18207 Jiay] 30 1no 1do 03 2104 )35 3sNw Apoq
Jayje ui 1do 03 asooyd oym saakojdwg BUIUIBA0S 5,JUBWILISA0Y 18207 By L

ua)enb "IIWv4 ul @3ediied Ajjenplatput

A13Aa eiep 38eM puE swniwaid 0} Juem oyMm saakojdwa syt Isisse

UMO Jlay3 Bunjiwal Jo usping 11s 3ng wniwaid ay) jo aseys
aAlesIUWPe 343 Inoge A11om 0} Jakodwa ayy Aed 03 A)iqisuodsal
Butaey Inoyym wessoud ayy oul 3do 511 SUIJI3P 0] JUSLILIDAOR)
Ajurejunioa 0] saakojdwa smope siyL 18207 e smojje uolido sy

uonyedidnied rv4ojdug aurndaq

3pINY JUSWILIBACY B30T [TWY4 SPIND JUBILIBA0YH |8307 [TWY (01




"A0S°0pRI0]0d

‘llwey 1e ajge|ieAe aie pue uolye|ngal
SIY3 Ul uoleuliojul paainbal ayy
Buiejuod saoijou ajqeziwolsna pue
512150d pa1eaud sey uojsiAlg 3yl

*32J0JHI0M ,SIUSWIUIBA0Y 18I0

33 jo Juadiad aay Isea) Je Agq uayods
afendue) 151y ay) Sunjuasaidas
adendue) Aue uy pue ysysu3 ui aq
M painbau Jaysod pue aopou ay)

‘wuojjeid paseq-dde Jo paseq

-gam ayy ut Suiysod snondidsuod e
Y3N01Y) JO UOLIBDJUNLLILIOD JUSII3]2
BIA JUSS 3Q )M uonesyou ‘wiojied
paseq-dde Jo paseq-qam e ySnouyy
HJom suuopiad 1o syIoMaI)
aakojdwa ue Jo ‘ade)dyiom jedisAyd

«

B U[BJUIRW JOU S30P JUIWUIDA0D
12207 3Y3 3J3ym $3sBD U| "pakojdwa
aJe saaA0)dwa a1aym Juawystigelsa
yoea ut aoeyd ajqissadie pue
snondidsuod e uy uojewoul
paiinbal ay3 Sujuieiuod aspou ayy
Aeydsip 3snw sjusWILIAACY 18307

jooqpuey e ut paystignd

sapalod aakoidwa Jo ‘sjlews aq Aew
S32110U JENPLAIPUL UBIILIM Y] *(39
$33110U Joge) JaY30 Y3Mm) paisod

3 ISNW 3U0 pue ‘aj0A UoleUl)I3p

e 19)ye saako)dwa o3 Ajjenpiatpul
P3I2Al19p aq 3snw ad130u 3uQ *(Z
-£011 ¥2D £) weudoud [wvd 2y jo
1n0 1do 03 BurjoA uaym Aq apige Isnw
SIUSLILLIDAOD |BJ0T JBY] SJuawasnbal
uonedyliou aafo)dwa omy aJe alsy)|

@

€@«

UOISII3P SJUIWUIIA0Y 18d07T 1noA jJo seafojdura anok AjnoN b

42140nb D 23U0 UOISIALT 343 03 DIDP I5oM 1D PuD SHuIwADd whjwasd Nwas 0] asn J)pm ssako)dwa Supiodpdriod
11D wa)shs 3ujjuo aups ay3 3q JiiM SHLL $5330.d 4] IDSIADU SJUBUILIIAGS (0307 d]ay O] 2)qD}IDAD [Jo3s Jioddns
SADY 1M 3 W) WIym Bupinp ‘s1ako)duia 3)oaid 310faq 13151531 0] PajIAL| 3q JjiM SIUBLUIIACS (0307

"ZZ0Z Jo 1104 343 Bunp uoj10.115i52.1 10f 3)qU}IDAD 3q 0] payradxa | waysAs swwaid JaKo)duwia auuo S, FIWYY

*€20T ‘) Asenuer

Aq — pajiews o payJewisod Jou —
w33sAs ayy ulym paaLadal aq isnw
UOLIEDYII0U SIY| *)]9M SB uojIedyliou
ay) UL papn)oul aq 3SNW UOIIBLLIOUL
siy) ‘wesSoud wvd ay3 ut ajedidiyed
Aljenpapul 03 asooy oym saako)dwa
31 Isisse 03 spuajut Inq “Ino 1do 03

"T20T 1e) Ul skodap 3
32U0 WaIsAs sadLuas Jakojdwa I Twvd
ay3 ojul papeoldn aq 3snw juawnop
SIY1 “330A 3] JO NSAJ Y] puUR UaNe)

SEM 3]0A 3Y] 3)ep Ay} a1edIpul ISNL
PUE peayIalIa] Lo UoISIALG [TWV4 243
A3130u 3snw weaSoud wvd 3yl jo
IN0-1do 03 S3J0A JEY) JUSWILIDAOG

*770Z duunp swAue jno 3do 03 3304
Jenjiul J1ay3} pjoyY ued SJUIWUIIA0Y) |ed0T

¢I'TIWVA J0 1no 3do 03 330A aMm ued uay )

€202 ‘I Aenuer Aq WwaysAs

Ay} ui BuniaisiBal Ja3e UoISIIP Jiayy
40 UoistAlg ay3 Aj130u Jsnw weisoud
ITwv4d 8y3 ut uopedidyred audap

0] 3]0A UIIYM SIUDLWILLIBAOS 18207

Wy Ut a3edidired o3 jou

350042 Jey] asoyy Sulpn)au; ‘waishs
BUIUO S, WV YIIM 1935183l Isnw
J1aA0]dwa JUaWUIBA0) 18207 AUaA]

(2202 D) WaisAs ITWV 243 YItm 1935169y *;

*s1eah 812 puofaq Jno-1do 03
SNUIIUOD 03 SAYSLM 31 JI 310A Jayjoue
PI0Y 3SNLU JUSLLLIBAOK) |80 BY ]

*3]0A
auy Jo ajep ayy wouj sieak 12
10§ poo§ s| au}23p 03 UOISIIBP YL

*ssadoud o)\qnd
e Y3noJy) Auowi}sa) pue sjuawWLwod
Jtwgns 03 Ajjunyioddo pue ssadoid

9]0A ay3 SulpJedal uoljeWIOUL YIM
910A 3y3 03 Joud SuluMm UL pauliou
a4 os)e 1snw ssafojdwa pue “Apoq
8UlUIBA0E U3 9.0Jaq sSaulsnqg Jaylo
Aue Se J3UUBLW 3WeS ay] Ul UaAIE
aq ISNW 30A 33 J0 Id130U 211gnd

*ajeddied

03 paJinbai st 310A ON ‘23edid|jed
0} 3ul23p 03 330A Isnw Apoq
SUIUIBA0S 5,JU3WILISA0Y) 18207 BY )

TV ut uonjedronsed s,3UaWIUIIAOCL 1BI0T INOK JUTULIA( * ]

"TWv4 Joj aJedaid 03 ae3 pjnoys sUSLILIAADY 12307 5335 SUIMO]10) BY) aJe asay )

TTWVA 10}
o1edaxg 0}y MOH

P310A sey JUBWUIAA0S 1830] 3Y} J| « Je307 ® ‘uoljeaIsiBal IBYY  «

UOISIDAP §,JU3UIIA0D 120 anok Jo I'TIWVA AJION o

BpIND JUSWIUIIA0Y [2207 [TWV4

SPIND JU3WUIBA0Y |20 [TWVS [Zh




"UOIRULIOJUL |RUOLIIPPE O} Z-/0}} ¥ £ O} 4331 3seald

‘uonealunWWodsIW pue sjuatuAediaAo pioAe 0] swajsAs a8ueyd ued am
0s ‘@3j30u sAep 06 JO WNWjUjW B s3INbal UOISIAIG [TWY4 313 ‘poLiad Jeak-aauyy
343 JO pus ay) Je WeJdoid 3U3 WOJ) MRIPYIIM 0] SYSIM JUSLLLIDAOS 1B20) B J|

‘Winuwiuiw e e sJeak Jysia A1aAa pailisiaal aq Isnw UostIap auyy ‘welSoid
IWv4 a3 ut aredpised A))nj 03 aul)ap 03 S3500UI JUALWILLISACS |B20] 343 I

*s1eak 2a4y3 Jo wnwjupw e 1oy swnywaid Aed “UoRRP Jo

saalkojdwa Kpoy
0] 8aJ8e pue weudoid ay) U} ulewal 3snw ‘a8eIaA0d 323]3-]95 OUM S]enplAIpU| A
“ne Bupydo Kjsnopuaud Jaye vy do

uawLIaACS [r: saurawa
*sieak 83.y3 Jo Wnwjupw e Joj swnwa.id Uorwdiioed 1o bom panpbes OM m%nohh
Aed 03 3a.8e pue weigoid ay3 ul uleWa IsnW uoledidied aul123p 03 SUII0A SIE3A € I'THNVYa

Kjsnoiaaad Jazje [wvd Ut 31edpned Ajnj o3 95004 LDIUM SJUILILISADS 18207 M
*28RJBA0D 123]135-)135

PUE S3USLI3BURLIR 3)BLL 0} BLUL} SISHIOM SAAIS SIYJ ‘DA1D3}J3 St SIYaUAG [TWY4 03 Q T
$53208 BulpJedal a8ueld Aue a10jaq saakojdwa 03 UaAS aq IsnwW 23130U sAep og ) e T K

“wwak g Liasa jmwa) Auojed wa) fary
'930A SUIP1DaP 3y) 4233 sAep OE UIYIM uonedidped L) 081 cowmﬁwhu“z_az
[TWY4 UO UOISIDap 1133 Jo s3akojdwa AJ1I0u 3SNL S)USLIUISACS 12307 00 3d0 03 1oAY "VLOZ 14N 3 3,o. 5J218q 5% 720 Ul A1dce You LY sl

I2PISU0D) .
0} sdye(q AaY sourduIL], bunop

Gl SPINY JUSWUIIA0Y |Bd0T [TWVL SPINY JUaWUIaA09 207 WYL E




"S°d"D (L1) €0S-£°€1-85 Ut |1eIap

ul paquasap se puoq jeuossad Juedylusis
e aaey A3U] WOYM UILM SUOSLWIOS JO
‘Bunqis ‘pryopuess “‘yuasedpuess
“aupred opsawop ‘asnods ‘quated ‘piyd
S, 1ENPLAIPUL PAI3A0D ¥ « Jaquay Ajlweq

*}INESSE 1enXas Jo/pue
32U3101A D13saWOP Jo Joedwy pue
spaau £jajes ajelpaluwl ay) sSaIppyY

A

Juawhoidap Aeiw s Jaquiaw
Ajwey e Joj syuswaBuelse ayew «

uohilpuod aeay
SNOLI3S 5,JaqWaLW AJlWey B 10j 3J8) «

UO[JIPUOI YIjeay SNoUas
B 3ARY A3 JI ‘SaAjISWIY) JO) AIB) «

UaIp|IYd pasalsoy pue pardope
SupnouL ‘pliyd Mau B J0j 1B «

103 J3PJO UL YoM

wouy Aeme 31} 9Xe) 0] AR3] [TWV4 25N
ued sjenplAlpu] ‘bas 35 105-£°EL-8S SI
weioid siy) $J2A0D JBY3 ME) OpRIO|0)
‘uesijied-1q sem 2304 ay] "UOIIIBD 00T
ay) uunp ope.1ojo) Jo suaziyid ayl Aq
ul pajoA sem wessoud (wyd) @auelnsu|
9ARaT |EIPAW pue Ajlwed ay] « [Twvd

swnywaud o3 32alqns
3q J0U ||IM SBDLAISS J13Y) J0) Way] 03
sjuswAed pue ‘saako)dwa palapisuod
aq j0u M ‘uondasxa Suaid-oma siyy
Aysiyes A esauad |)im SJeIYJ0 Pa123)T «

S () £05-€°61-85 2wasafay *swinwald
0} 13[qgns aq j0u pjnom wayy 03
sjuawded pue 3oy [TWv4 ay3 Japun
aa/o)dwa ue jou 5| uostad ey uayy
‘ape) 1o uoissajoid Juapuadapul
4123 Jo Jed si YoM Jey] pue ‘yiom
11843 jo asuewopad ayy up joju0d
wouy 234y Aluewud Yogstuosiad e §|  «

‘uolydadxa

Suoid-omy e sapnjoul ,2940idwsa,,

JO uonjluyap 5,30V |TWvd UL "sisixa
JUBAJSS pUR 13)5RW Jo diysuolie|al me)
-UOWWO? 3Y3 Jay3laym Jo aAlldadsanly
‘Jayjoue Jo Jyauaq ayj 10j SIILAIDS JO
Joge) Suiuiopad “aloqe) AlojesSiw e
Suipn)oul ‘lenpialpul Auy « aakojdw3

5D (€) £05-6°61-55 1920213024 *1eak e KjySnou
40 pouad e JaA0 ‘31R15 ay) UM saSem
uL 006G ‘Z$ 15E3] JB paulea sey oym
13)10M OpEI0JO) ¥ « |RNPIAIPU] PAISAO)

¢J'TINV ut
OUM S,oym

E SpIND JUBLWIUIIACY [BI07 [TWV4

*swniwsa.d Suifed ploAe 03 £707
‘) Arenuer jo peaye uolsiAlg Y3 AJ130U ISNW NOA "£70Z ‘L
|udy uo anp sjuswAed wnjwaid pue ejep afem yjoq 3oadxa
11tM UoISIALG TWVA 9yl “wesSoud |wy4 ay3 ul sjuedidyyled
Se payluap} aq |im £Z0Z “} Atenuer £q 3no-3do 03 930A e Jo
UOISIALG |TWV4 343 AJ130U J0U Op YdIYMm SJUSWIUIBAOS) [B307]

¢49113] D puas 10 ‘330A D 3)D3 J0U Op aM i suaddoy IDyYM

*ade|d ut uejd aAes) pred juajeainba ue aAey 03
paJinbai jou aue weiSoud Iwy4 2y3 ui uonjeddnaed
3Ul23p 03 930A 0yM s1ako]dws JuaWuIIA0S |BD0T

ajejdwa) siafojdw3 Supedioiiey
UOLIRIYIION lew] 11V 10} 133504 Wooy
2a2/ojdw3 3jqezjwoisn)y jea.g piepueis

N0 3do oym
SIUSWIUIIADD) |B207
10} 12)50d WOO0Y yealg

S1001.

BpIND JUSLILISA0S |20 [TWYH




(13

1]
1
1
i
i
1
]
1
1
I
1
1

Jpd-siayiow-Aod fiayjoasnisnf

-JJW0U0)3 {$321N0S3J {3 JOM-1N0 510 "d}Y513u3Dd|DUCIIOU MMM/ 115033y WOLf *ZZ0Z ‘ZZ BUN[ PaAaLIay
'S3J)jWoy B UaWOM Jof djys1auziod ouclIDN *I1qNd Y] PUR SIssaulsng ‘saj|jweS Joj aAea] Ajwey
Pied jo s3oedw) JjWoU0I3 3ARISOd YL isiajiew Aed *( 'PU) YoM PUD USWOM J0f J3]ua) S1aBIny

Jpd’1z0z1dy Mi11q1xa)f513Y10)13]D)S- USSOYTUOSSIad [UISSOILL~ [NPI
"pJofupis*qam/ 1:sd1y wouf ‘7707 ‘7z aunp paAallay A1isiaAjuf pofup)s “yieaH [eulajey pue
Kligixal 4 aoe|djiop siayjed tawoH Aels ue) pRQ UaUM (0f 1udy ‘LZ0Z) ‘W J3)D)5-Ussoy

Z10ZZ wiod/Z001 "0} /10p /woaAa)m Aipigaugjuoy 1:sdi3y "£z8
-06£ ‘(b)9E ‘JuawaBeury pue siskjeuy £3}10d Jo jeuinor "weiBold aAraT A)jwed pjed s,ejuioie)
8umo)|o4 Jooyas Arejuawal3 uj y3jeaH PIIYD *(SZ AInr ‘2102) d N ‘1138 B 'S ‘30pos-uowiyar]

Jpd’s[-aApa)-paw-wo-pjod-1Z£zk0/#0/ 1 Z0Z /5P0O]AN f3Uaju03
-dMm 810 3mM0IB3)qoIINba 1 :5d33y Wouf ‘Z7Z07 ‘ZZ AUNf PaA3LIaY YIMOoID 3)qoainb3 isajyjod
2AR3)| |edipaw pue Ajjwej pjed Inoqe Aes YdJeasal ay) Saop IRYM ‘("p'U) "YIMoJ9 3)qo3inb3

Jpd’°z| Aow-aApaT)pa]pawpunh)iwD 45up1DN|DAF /32UDINSU|-3ADa) Al WS /sppo)dn /3uajuo3
-dm540°31n3supfjunyoddo mmm / £ :sdiy “810 a3nyjasuhyjungioddo mmm *ajels uojBujysep Joj
JUeInsu| aAea] [edjpayy pue Ajjwed Bupyen|eAl ‘() fow ‘Z10z) ainiisu) Ajunjsoddg Iiwouod3

WY ZZ8¥BZO0E -2AD3]-|DIU3.Dd-BUYD]-3]qDIJ0JWi0I-133-UaWI-5d)aYy-UO[IDZIUDEI0-113Y] ]33 f-PIAaAIns
-a]doad-fo-f1oy-upy]-553]-A3AINS-317|0]3P [535D3]3.1-5MaUl {LLIOD*3ILMSMIUIT MMM | J:5d1y wouf ‘zzoz
‘ZZ 3UN[ PaA3LIIaY "JIMSMAN Yd "aARaT |RIualed BupjEl 3]qRHOJWO) |99 Uay sdjaH uopneziueEiQ
djay1 1224 pakaains a)doad J0 JIeH eyl ssa :A3Aing aNojaq “(5) aunp ‘910z) *33110)30

Jpd-ajqoiaAliagaspatpiod sa)y 1f08a)
1dSY0/53]1f 1ADE|Op /53115 /A0E |Op MMM/ f:5d23Y WOLS ‘ZZ0Z ZZ AUNT PaAaLIaY JoOqDT] Jo Juawiyiodag

SN °r Qyd ‘wneg sajJey) j0oyds ssaujsng BIqIN|o) gyd ‘|aJeg Uuy apeaaq 3sijd 3yl wolj
5U0sS3T tMRT aARaT AjjWed PIRd 5,BJUI0j|RD (£ 3UNS ‘F10Z) ‘MD] 3ADaT A)iWD4 piod S, DiUiofi|o)

CERIVES EY EYY |

SPIND JUALILIIACY [e207 |TWV4

'S'4°D (02) E0S-E°€4-85 PuD 'S'4"D

200-£-815 “S"HD (E)I04-L744-91 (S3UI2[ay *WILYDIA
ay3 pue 103D ay) uaamiaq diysuone)al
ayy jo ssajpsedau uossad Jayjoue Jsuese
uosiad e AQ paljiWILIOD JNBSSE [ENXas JO
95Ud}J0 AUV « BSNQY JO I Nessy |enxas

$°¥°2 (68) £OS-E°EL-BS

Japuaold ased yjeay e Aq juawiean
Suminuiuod Jo ‘A1oey ased Jesipaw
Jetjuapisal Jo adidsoy ‘jejidsoy e up
aled jJualyedul SSA)0AUL JBY] UOKIPUOD
1ejuaw Jo jedtsAyd Jo ‘ygpliys wouy
Aaaoday ‘foueuaid ‘yuauutedw ‘Knfu
‘SSAUN|L UY « UOIIIPUOD Y3|e3H SNOWI3S

*sjyauaq
DURINSUL DARI) BIIPAL pue AjLwey
YIIM UOI23UL0D Ul JuaWiojdwa wouy
uaye) aAea) pred Jo) uondudsap |esauss
3L « 9ARI] |RIPAW pue Ajjwe) pied

SU D (QUE)S HOE-1-625 sauasafay

"33V ITWV4 2Y1 Japun S1UaWUIdA0D
1207 paJapisuod aJe §)00YdS Jaiey)
*31835 3} JO uoisiAIpgns Jeantjod Jayjo
Jo ‘fyuoyine ‘3ousip jedads ‘yauasip
100y2s Aue Jo ‘AuoInjels 10 3N Swoy
13y1aym ‘umol 1o A3 ‘KJunod pue
K15 ‘fQunod Auy « Juswulaaoy jedoT

‘Apoq Suju1aA08 sut Aq

pPa3anpuod aq 1snw |wyd Jo no 3do 03
B]0A 5,]USLWILLIAA0S B0 ¥ 213 51012341p
Jo (s)pJeoq ‘sjuaBal jo pieoq ‘spieoq
100y2s 21gnd :03 pajiwy) Jou ale Inq

apn)out saydwex3 -uojsiapgns jeatytjod
10 JUSLWIUIDAOS 1B20] B JSA0 9DURUIDADE
s512J9xa 03 AZjuoyine ayy sey oym
siapea) jo dnoiB ay) « Apog Suiuiarog

“1eak Joud ay) uj PaxIOM SINOY Uo paseq
saahojdwa Suowe Alea Aew afeianod
VW4 1enpLaiput Jey3 3jou 03 Juepodwt
SL L UDAIMOY “8Z 431doy) *3'SN 62 13uasafay
"VIW4 Yim A)3uaunduod uni o3 pausisap
s1 weasSoud [Twyd s,0pe1010) ‘s3akoldwa
3Jow 10 OG Yiwm sauedwod pue ‘sjooyds
Asepuodas pue Aejuswala ajeaud pue
ongnd jje ‘sauade oyqnd jje o3 saydde
VW4 "2AB3| 3y} Suuinp pauiejuiew

aq s3yauaq yieay dnous J1ay) Jeyy
salinbal osje 3] ueak uad aaea) padajold
-qof ‘piedun jo syaam 7| 03 dn yum
saafoldwa Sulfjenb urenan sapaold
Jeyy weasod Jesspay e st (Vw4 1oV
9AR3T 1e2Ipaw pue Ajlwed syl « YIW4

3p|IND JUSWUISA0Y |8207 [TWV4 B



COLORADO

Family and Medical Leave
Insurance Program (FAMLI)

Department of Labor and Employment

LS




DRAFT

A RESOLUTION OF THE TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY, COLORADO
DECLINING FULL PARTICIPATION IN THE COLORADO STATE-RUN
PAID FAMILY AND MEDICAL LEAVE INSURANCE PROGRAM

WHEREAS, in November of 2020, Colorado voters approved Proposition 118, which
established a State-run Paid Family and Medical Leave Insurance program ("FAMLI"); and

WHEREAS, the State's purpose for creating the program is to ensure all Colorado workers
have access to paid leave in order to take care of themselves or their family during life
circumstances that pull them away from their jobs; and

WHEREAS, under FAMLI, employers and their employees are both responsible for
funding the program and may split the cost 50/50; the premiums are set at 0.9% of the employee's
wage, with 0.45% paid by the employer and 0.45% paid by the employee; and

WHEREAS, the premiums required for FAMLI will be collected starting January 1, 2023,
and benefits will begin January 1, 2024; and

WHEREAS, as a local government, the Town of Columbine Valley (the "Town") may
decline to participate in FAMLI following a public hearing and vote of its governing body; and

WHEREAS, should the Town decline to participate in FAMLI, Town employees will still
have the option to participate in the program and remit premiums to the State: and

WHEREAS, the Town already offers short-term disability insurance coverage for its
employees that exceeds the requirements of the state-run program; and

WHEREAS, at tonight's meeting, the Board of Trustees will hold a public hearing on the
decision of whether to participate in FAMLI; and

WHEREAS, Town staff recommends that the Board of Trustees (i) decline participation in
FAMLI, and (ii) decline to withhold and remit the employee share of premiums for the Town
employees who elect FAMLI coverage.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE
TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY, COLORADO AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Public Hearing. The Board of Trustees finds and determines that, with regard
to the public hearing on the decision of whether to decline participation in FAMLI, notice was given
and the hearing was conducted in accordance with the regulations adopted by Colorado
Department of Labor and Employment and codified at 7 CCR 1107-2.

Section 2. FAMLI Participation. The Board of Trustees, acting by and on behalf of the
Town hereby declines full participation in FAMLI, including declining to collect and remit employee
premiums to the Slate for those employees who elect coverage under FAMLI. The Board of
Trustees further directs Town staff to bring the matter of revisiting the decision to decline
participation in FAMLI before a future Board of trustees by no more than eight years from tonight's
vote.




Date:
Title:
Presented By:

Prepared By:

Background:

Attachments:

Suggested Action:

Recommended Motion;

" Town of
;(Columbme\’ alley
Colorado

Request for Board of Trustee Action

October 18, 2022
2023 Draft Town Budget
J.D. McCrumb, Town Administrator

Diane Rodriguez, Finance Manager; J.D. McCrumb, Town
Administrator

This is the first draft of the 2023 Town Budget presented for review
and discussion. It has been drafted by Town staff. Several Trustees
have met with staff individually to advise and offer department level
direction.

The 2023 budget will be presented for a public hearing on November
15, 2022 and the budget will be presented for another reading on that
night. The Trustees will also go into Executive Session on that night
to discuss staff salary adjustments.

The budget is scheduled for adoption by Resolution on Tuesday,
December 6, 2022.

2023 Draft Town Budget

Direct staff to make any updates or changes to prepare for the
November Trustees meeting.

“I'move to set a public hearing on the 2023 town budget for Tuesday,
November 15, 2022.”



TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY

SUMMARY
2023 PROFPOSED BUDGET
WITH 2021 ACTUAL AND 2022 ESTIMATED AMQUNTS
2021 2022 YTD Actual 2022 2023
Actual Adopted 913072022 Estimated Proposed
Modifled Accrual Modified Accrual Modifled Accrual Modifled Accrual Modifled Accrual
REVENUES PER CATEGORY
General 5 4,002,765 5 3,142,757 $ 3,215250 8§ 4,358,713 3 2,804,853
Capital 3,649 - - - 926,773
Conservation trust fund 8,983 8,707 7,200 8,850 8,850
Arapahoe county open space 44,087 46,298 55,541 54,448 57,020
Impact fees 609,749 292,245 300,688 299,100 -
Transportation fees 107,339 90,000 58,941 90,000 90,000
Total revenues 4,776,572 3,580,007 3,637,620 4,811,111 3,887,496
EXPENDITURES PER CATEGORY
General 1,908,436 2,236,941 1,435,209 2,304,287 2,233,316
Capital 73,948 152,500 69,075 153,575 4,272,000
Conservation trust fund 4,800 6,000 2,120 6,000 6,000
Arapahoe county open space 3,549 30,000 4,296 30,000 255,000
Total expenditures 1,990,733 2,425,441 1,510,700 2,493,862 6,766,316
EXCESS OF REVENUES OVER (UNDER)
EXPENDITURES 2,785,839 1,154,566 2,126,920 2,317,249 (2,878,820
OTHER FINANCING SOURCES (USES)
Sale of capital asscts 9,000 - 5,000 5,000 -
Other loss - - (197,605) (197,605) -
Total other financing sources (uses) 9,000 - (192,605) {192,605) -
NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE 2,794,839 $ 1,154,566 1,934,315 2,124,644 (2,878,820)
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE 3,370,278 6,165,117 6,165,117 8,289,761
ENDING FUND BALANCE s 6,165,117 $ 8,099,432 § 8,289,761 ) 5,410,941
ENDING FUND BALANCE BY CATEGORY
General $ 3,224,940 1,307,376 8§ 1,581,761 3 2,153,298
Capital 1,448,068 4,883,993 4,799,493 1,454,266
Conservation trust fund 18,183 23,263 21,033 23,883
Arapahoe county open space 489,744 540,989 514,192 316,212
Impact fees 876,843 1,177,531 1,175,943 1,175,943
Transportation fees 107,339 166,280 197,339 287,339
ENDING FUND BALANCE BY CATEGORY § 6,165,117 s 8,099432 § 8,289,761 $ 5,410,941




REVENUES

Taxes
Cable television
Property taxes
Sales and use taxes
Specific ownership taxes
Utility franchise fees

Total taxes

Permits and fines
Fines
Permits, fees and services
Violations

Total permits and fines

Intergovernmental
Bow Mar IGA police
Bow Mar IGA admin
County highway tax revenue
Motor vehicle registration fees
State cigarette tax apportionment
State highway user's tax

Total intergovernmental

Interest

Other

Grants

Covid 19 Cares Act

TOTAL REVENUES

EXPENDITURES

Administration
Accounting and audit
Advertising/notices
Bank/credit card fees

Building inspection and plan review

Building maintenance and utilities
Community functions

Computer expense

County treasurer's collection fees

Emergency response and preparedness

Dues and publications
Educaticn and training
Election

Health insurance
Human resources
Insurance and bonds
Legal

Mayor/monthly breakfasts
Miscellancous

Payroll taxes

Pension

Salaries

Special projects

TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
OPERATIONS - DETAILS
2023 PROPOSED BUDGET
WITH 2021 ACTUAL AND 2022 ESTIMATED AMOUNTS

2021 2022 YTD Actual 2022 2023
Actual Adopted 9/30/2022 Estimated Proposed

Modified Accrual Modified Accrual Modified Accrual Modified Accrual Modified Accrual
s 38,740 $ 36,000 $ 29,462 s 44,193 $ 44,193
431,219 615,419 608,991 615,419 590,740
1,820,397 1,385,000 1,239,633 1,859,450 1,206,023
30,041 43,079 29,256 43,079 41,352
60,997 50,000 50,824 76,236 76,236
2,381,394 2,129,498 1,958,166 2,638,377 1,958,544
116,281 100,000 74,997 112,496 110,000
816,074 530,000 436,793 655,190 271,456

274,725 - 332,075 498,113 -
1,207,080 630,000 843,865 1,265,799 381,456
295,095 300,259 304,833 304,833 327,543
20,000 20,000 20,000 20,000 20,000
13,133 15,000 17,838 26,757 26,757
6,026 6,000 4,383 6,575 6,575
2,109 1,000 523 785 785
47,688 40,000 29,207 43,811 40,000
384,051 382,259 376,784 402,761 421,660
1,077 1,000 28,795 43,193 43,193

4,163 - 5,755 5,755 -

25,000 - 1,885 2,828 -
4,002,765 3,142,757 3,215,250 4,358,713 2,804,853
57,722 63,500 65,203 97,805 90,000
218 500 1,661 1,595 500
7,295 5,100 6,518 9,780 9,780
265,471 238,500 143,588 238,500 122,155
70,340 22,011 16,747 22,011 22,860
41,354 55,000 27,555 53,138 57,000
8,073 14,500 4,705 14,500 14,500
4,314 6,154 6,095 6,154 5,907
2,076 3,000 1,225 3,000 3,000
9,426 8,850 9,931 12,341 12,510
399 12,000 3,174 12,000 12,000

u: 4,000 " = -
41,458 47,000 37,832 47,000 48,202
- - - - 13,000
22,900 34,047 19,463 34,047 35,000
22,289 45,000 24,972 45,000 45,000
269 2,000 289 2,000 2,000
2,874 2,300 2,453 2,500 2,500
11,886 12,575 5,641 12,575 13,204
10,668 12,575 6,142 12,575 13,204
216,817 251,500 177,900 251,500 264,075
- - 10,350 10,350 9,000



Supplies, printing, postage
Telephone/communications
Emergency reserve

Total administration

Planning and engineering
Town planning
Town engineer
Miscellaneous

Total planning and engineering

Public safety
Operations
Cruiser gas
Cruiser oil/maintenance
Cruiser insurance
Education/training
Equipment repair
Health insurance
Workers comp insurance
Payroll taxes
Pension
Salaries
Supplies/dues/miscellaneous
Telephones/air cards
Uniforms

Total operations
Municipal court
Judge
Legal
Administration
Supplies
Interpreter
Total municipal court
Contracts
Arapahoe county dispatch fee
Mobile Cad
Human society
Juvenile assessment
Netmotion
CACP
CIsC

Total contracts
Computer/IT
Merakie
Offsite server backup
Office 365 accounts
Scheduled computer replacement
Govpilot

Total computer/IT

Total public safety

Public works
Ground maintenance
Health insurance
Homeowner association subsidy

TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
OPERATIONS - DETAILS
2023 PROPOSED BUDGET

WITH 2021 ACTUAL AND 2022 ESTIMATED AMOUNTS

2021 2022 YTD Actual 2022 2023
Actual Adopted 9/30/2022 Estimated Proposed

11,795 13,000 5,813 13,000 13,000
7,695 6,500 5,450 6,500 6,500
- 94,000 - 94,000 84,200
815,339 953,612 582,707 1,001,871 899,097
30,959 36,000 8,890 36,000 36,000
12,537 16,000 11,312 16,000 16,000

- 1,500 - - -
43,496 53,500 20,202 52,000 52,000
16,903 22,100 13,354 22,100 28,730
7,131 18,000 5,430 18,000 18,000
6,956 8,487 4,558 8,487 8,487
3,131 11,750 4,246 11,750 12,620
454 5,875 - - 5,875
64,273 70,900 56,044 74,725 79,095
24,577 29,705 35477 29,705 29,705
18,333 24,730 14,455 24,730 26,500
41,572 49,459 36,081 49,459 53,000
484,208 494,550 378,836 494,590 529,211
12,285 16,430 8,966 26,467 16,410
1,928 2,938 - - 3,000
4,433 11,750 5,160 11,750 11,750
686,184 766,714 562,607 771,763 822,383
6,000 8,000 4,500 6,000 6,000
31,923 27,500 21,690 28,920 30,000
706 4,000 3,128 4,400 2,000
2,216 2,000 1,312 2,000 2,000
2,200 - - - 2,400
43,045 41,500 30,630 41,320 42,400
31,949 33,709 34,406 34,406 34,406
1,18% 1,225 - - 1,225
- 500 - 500 500
782 782 595 595 632
- 500 - 500 500
- 250 - 250 350
- 1,000 - 1,000 1,000
33,920 37,966 35,001 37,251 38,613
2,172 1,800 2,700 1,800 1,800
1,800 2,500 3,087 4,116 4,700
4,055 3,500 3,737 3,500 3,500
10,000 14,000 14,000 14,000 14,000
18,027 21,800 23,524 23416 24,000
781,176 867,980 651,762 873,750 927,396
2,842 8,578 9,635 10,000 10,000
7.342 7,934 5,895 7,934 8,258



Maintenance water - Hunter Run
Other drainage/water
Payroll taxes
Pension
Professional fees-mosquito control
Salary
Sanitation/trash/recycle service
Signs maintenance
Snow removal
Storm water permit process/NPDES
Street lighting
Streets and gutters maintenance
Streets and gutters contingency
Striping
Vehicle maintenance

Total public works

TOTAL EXPENDITURES

EXCESS OF REVENUES OVER
EXPENDITURES

OTHER FINANCING USES
Transfer to capital
Other loss

Total other financing uses

NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE

BEGINNING FUND BALANCE

ENDING FUND BALANCE

TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY

OPERATIONS - DETAILS
2023 PROPOSED BUDGET

WITH 2021 ACTUAL AND 2022 ESTIMATED AMOUNTS

2021 2022 YTD Actual 2022 2023
Actual Adopted 9/20/2022 Estimated Preposed
1,805 5,000 - - 5,000
2,707 4,193 1,917 4,193 4,408
3,333 4,193 3,500 4,193 4,408
6,645 7,500 7,042 7,043 7,543
73,706 83,850 52,591 83,850 88,163
93,685 92,000 73,901 110,852 103,421
512 1,061 - 1,061 1,082
1,910 5,500 2,246 5,500 5,500
1,271 7,500 705 7,500 7,500
20,340 15,000 15,315 15,000 15,000
47,563 75,000 5,740 75,000 50,000
- 40,000 - 40,000 40,000
251 1,040 - 1,040 1,040
4,513 3,500 2,051 3,500 3,500
268,425 361,849 180,538 376,666 354,823
1,908,436 2,236,941 1,435,209 2,304,287 2,233,316
2,094,329 905,816 1,780,041 2,054,426 571,537
(1,000,000) (2,700,000) (3,500,000) (3,500,000) -
- - (197,605) (197,605) -
(1,000,000) {2,700,000) (3,697,605) (3,697,605) -
1,094,329 $ t 1,794,1 84! (1,917,564) (1,643,179) 571,537
2,130,611 3,224,940 3,224,940 1,581,761
3 3,224,940 N 1,307,376 M 1,581,761 $ 2,153,298




REVENUES
Donations (Brick sales)
Denver water contribution
NEU Grant

Total revenues

EXPENDITURES
Public safety
Body Cameras
Flock camera system
Vehicle
Administration
Columbine park stage
Town Hall board room & basement carpet
Public works
Furnace and air conditioner
Lightpole replacement
Platte Canyon Sidewalk - Village to Fairway
Platte Canyon/Coal Mine right tum lanc
R.oad improvements
Truck - Snow Removal

Total expenditures

EXCESS OF EXPENDITURES OVER
(UNDER) REVENUES

OTHER FINANCING SOURCES
Sale of assets

Transfer from general
Transfer from impact fee

Total other financing sources
NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE

ENDING FUND BALANCE

TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
CAPITAL
2023 PROPOSED BUDGET
WITH 2021 ACTUAL AND 2022 ESTIMATED AMOUNTS

2021 2022 YTD Actual 2022 2023
Actual Adopted 813072022 Estimated Proposed
Modified Accrual Modified Accrual Modified Accrual Modifled Accrual Modifiad Accrual
s 3,649 5 * $ - 5 - 3 -
i & - - 550,000
- - - - 376,773
3,649 - - - 926,773
6,400 - - - -
- 17,500 - 17,500 -
47,055 55,000 - 55,000 50,000
7,943 - - - -
o = - - 15,000
12,550 - - - -
- 12,000 - 12,000 12,000
. - - - 100,000
- - - - 280,000
- - - - 3,815,000
- 68,000 69,075 69,075 -
73,948 152,500 69,075 153,575 4,272,000
(70,299) {152,500) (69,075) {153,575) (3,345,227)
9,000 - 5,000 5,000 -
1,000,000 2,700,000 3,500,000 3,500,000 -
= 9,520 - z E
1,009,000 2,709,520 3,505,000 3,505,000 -
938,701 s 2,557,020 s 3,435,925 3,351,425 (3,345,227)
509,367 1,448,068 1,448,068 4,799,493
$ 1,448,068 S 4,883,993 $ 4,799,493 S 1,454,266




REVENUES
Conscrvation trust fund entitlement
CTF interest

Total revenues

EXPENDITURES
Conscrvation trust fund expenditures

Total expenditures
NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE

ENDING FUND BALANCE

TOWN OF COLUMEBINE VALLEY
CONSERVATION TRUST FUND

2023 PROPOSED BUDGET

WITH 2021 ACTUAL AND 2022 ESTIMATED AMOUNTS

2021 2022 YTD Actual 2022 2023

Actual Adopted 9/30/2022 Estimated Proposed
Modifled Accrual Modifled Accrual Modifled Accrual Modlfied Accrual Modifled Accrual
S 8,976 $ 8,700 s 7,038 $ 8,700 s 8,700
7 7 162 150 150
8,983 8,707 7,200 8,850 8,850
4,800 6,000 2,120 6,000 6,000
4,800 6,000 2,120 6,000 6,000
4,183 S 2,707 5 5,080 2,850 2,850
14,000 18,183 18,183 21,033
s 18,183 S 23,263 M 21,033 S 23,883




REVENUES
Arapahoe county open space revenues
ACOP interest

Total revenues
EXPENDITURES
Trails Master Plan

Platte Canyon Sidewalk - Village to Fairway
Nevada ditch

Total expenditures
NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE

ENDING FUND BALANCE

TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
ARAPAHOE COUNTY OPEN SPACE

2023 PROPOSED BUDGET
WITH 2021 ACTUAL AND 2022 ESTIMATED AMOUNTS

2021 2022 YTD Actual 2022 2023
Actual Adopted 9/30/2022 Estimated Proposed
Modified Accrual Modifled Accrual Modified Accrual Modified Accrual Modified Accrual
3 43918 $ 46,114 $ 51,448 $ 51,448 5 54,020
169 184 4,093 3,000 3,000
44,087 46,298 55,541 54,448 57,020
3,549 - 4,296 4,196 -
o g £ - 225,000
- 30,000 - 25,804 30,000
3,549 30,000 4,296 30,000 255,000
40,538 $ 16,298 $ 51,245 24,448 (197,980)
449,206 489,744 489,744 514,192
$ 489,744 $ 540,989 $ 514,192 b 316,212




TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
IMPACT FEES
2023 PROPOSED BUDGET
WITH 2021 ACTUAL AND 2022 ESTIMATED AMOUNTS

2021 2022 YTD Actual 2022 2023
Actual Adopted 9/30/2022 Estimated Proposed
Modified Accrual Modifled Accrual Modified Accrual Modified Accrual Modifled Accrual

REVENUES
Impact fees s 609,600 8 292,100 $ 292,100 S 292,100 3 -
Impact fees interest 149 145 §,588 7,000 -
Total revenues 609,749 292,245 300,688 299,100 -
EXPENDITURES

Total expenditures = 2

EXCESS OF REVENUES OVER

EXPENDITURES 609,749 292,245 300,688 299,100 -
OTHER FINANCING USES

Transfer to capital - (9,520) - - -

Total other financing uses - (9,520) - - -

NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE 605,749 3 282,725 300,688 299,100 -
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE 267,094 876,843 876,843 1,175,943
ENDING FUND BALANCE S 876,843 $ 1,177,531 3 1,175943  § 1,175,943




TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
TRANSPORTATION FEES
2023 PROPOSED BUDGET
WITH 2021 ACTUAL AND 2022 ESTIMATED AMOUNTS

2021 2022 YTD Actual 2022 2023
Actual Adopted 9/30/2022 Estimated Proposed
Modified Accrual  Modified Accrual  Modifled Accrual  Modified Accrual  Madified Accrual

REVENUES
Transportation fees $ 107,339 $ 90,000 § 58,941 $ 90,000 § 90,000
Total revenues 107,339 90,000 58,941 90,000 90,000
EXPENDITURES
Total expenditures - p s = a
NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE 107,339 $ 50,000 58,941 90,000 50,000
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE - 107,339 107,339 197,339

ENDING FUND BALANCE 3 107,339 $ 166,280  § 197,339 § 287,339




