TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
BOARD OF TRUSTEES MEETING
November 15, 2022
6:30PM
AGENDA

ROLL CALL 6:30
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

PUBLIC COMMENT
Each speaker will be limited to three minutes. The Board of Trustees is not authorized by the
Colorado Open Meetings Law to discuss, comment, or act at the meeting on any issue raised by
public comment. The Mayor may refer the matter to the Town Administrator or Town Attorney for
immediate comment, or to staff to obtain additional information and report back to the Board as

appropriate,

CONSENT AGENDA Mayor Palmer
a. Approval of October 18, 2022 Minutes
b. Set December Trustees Meeting for December6, 2022

REPORTS

a. Mayor

b. Trustees

c. Finance Report

d. Town Administrator

e. Chief of Police
OLD BUSINESS

a. Trustee Bill #5 — Building Code (2" Reading) Mr. McCrumb
NEW BUSINESS

a. PUBLIC HEARING - Resolution #6 Ms. Eckel

b. Action on Resolution #6 — FAMLI

¢. PUBLIC HEARING - 2023 Town Budget Mr. McCrumb

EXECUTIVE SESSION - An executive session to Conference with an  Mayor Palmer
attorney for the purposes of receiving legal advice on specific
legal questions, pursuant to C.R.S. § 24-6-402(4)(b); and to discuss
personnel matters, involving performance and compensation,
pursuant to C.R.S. § 24-6-402(4)(f).

ADJOURNMENT



TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
BOARD OF TRUSTEES

Minutes

QOctober 18, 2022

Mayor Palmer called the Regular Meeting of the Trustees to order at 6:30 p.m., in the Conference
Room at the Town Hall at 2 Middlefield Road, Columbine Valley, Colorado. Roll call found the
following present:

Trustees: Roy Palmer, Bill Dotson, Kathy Boyle, Mike Giesen, Ed Icenogle,
Jim Tarpey, and Al Timothy
Also present: Lee Schiller, Diane Rodriguez, J.D. McCrumb, Brent Kaslon, Jim

Thelen, and Bret Cottrell
PUBLIC COMMENT: There was no public comment

APPROVAL OF AGENDA: Mayor Palmer asked that the Executive Session be moved to the top of
the agenda to accommodate the availability of the Town’s contract legal counsel.
ACTION: upon a motion by Trustee Tarpey and a second by Trustee Timothy,
the Board of Trustees unanimously approved amending the agenda.

EXECUTIVE SESSION: ACTION: upon a motion by Trustee Tarpey and a second by Trustee
Timothy, the Board of Trustees unanimously approved entering executive session at 6:34
p-m. for the purpose of receiving legal advice on specific legal questions, pursuant to
C.R.S. § 24-6-402(4)(b). The Trustees came out of Executive Session at 6:49 p-m.

CONSENT AGENDA:
ACTION: upon a motion by Trustee Tarpey and a second by Trustee Giesen, the
Board of Trustees unanimously approved the consent agenda as presented.

REPORTS
A. Mayor Palmer reported on concerns he has received from citizens regarding speed in
certain areas of Town. He asked staff to assemble recommendations and report them back
to the Board in January. The Mayor also alerted the Trustees that the Town would receive
approximately $4,500 from the Stadium District as a result of the sale of the Denver
Broncos. The funds are to be used for “youth activities”.
B. Trustee Boyle presented on her special project ideas for 2023, including a history display
in the Lobby of Town Hall and some updates to the Police bullpen in the basement.
C. Mrs. Rodriguez reviewed the September financials as presented in the Trustees Packet.
D. Mr. McCrumb reviewed his report as presented in the Trustees Packet. Mr. Kaslon
presented a development update to the Trustees.
E. Chief Cottrell reviewed the report as presented in the Trustee Packet.

OLD BUSINESS: There was no old business.

NEW BUSINESS
A. Public Hearing on Trustee Bill #5 — Building Codes: Mayor Palmer opened the Public
Hearing at 7:27 p.m. Mr. Thelen presented an ordinance with updates and amendments to
the Towns adopted building codes for Trustee consideration.
Public Comment: There was no public comment.



The public hearing was closed at 7:36 with a motion by Trustee Timothy and a
second by Trustee Giesen.

B. Trustee Bill #5 — Building Codes: The Trustees asked clarifying questions about the
building code updates.
ACTION: upon a motion by Trustee Timothy and a second by Trustee Giesen,
the Board of Trustees unanimously approved Trustee Bill #5 on 1% reading.

C. Master Plan Addendum re: Trails: Mr. Schiller and Mr. Kaslon presented to the
Trustees the addendum to the Town’s Master Plan. The trails addendum was originally
presented to the Trustees in March of 2022 and the Trustees directed staff to have the
Planning Commission review and adopt, which was completed in October of 2022. The
Trustees discussed the plan and asked clarifying questions.

ACTION: upon a motion by Trustee Icenogle and a second by Trustee Tarpey,
the Board of Trustees unanimously approved the Trails Addendum to the
Town’s 2020 Master Plan specifically noting language regarding implementation
on page 6 of the proposed addendum.

D. Set a Public Hearing for Resolution #6, 2022: Mr. Schiller introduced the resolution
addressing the State’s family medical leave plan to the Trustees. The item will be
discussed in November, 2022.

ACTION: upon a motion by Trustee Icenogle and a second by Trustee Timothy,
the Board of Trustees unanimously set a public hearing for November 15, 2022.

E. Presentation of 2023 Town Budget: Mr. McCrumb and Mrs. Rodriguez presented the
draft budget. The Trustees asked clarifying questions and had an in-depth discussion.
ACTION: upon a motion by Trustee Dotson and a second by Trustee Giesen, the
Board of Trustees unanimously set a public hearing for November 15, 2022.

ADJOURNMENT: There being no further business, the meeting was adjourned at approximately
8:47 p.m,

Submitted by,
J.D. McCrumb, Town Administrator

* All reports and exhibits listed “as attached” are available on the Columbine Valley web site and by request at Town Hall,
** All minutes should be considered in DRAFT form until approved by the Board of Trustees at the next regular meeting,



J;::EE";‘;"I"Lmbme\-f alley

Colorado ~

Request for Board of Trustee Action

Date: November 15, 2022

Title: Set date for Special Meeting

Presented By: J.D. McCrumb, Town Administrator

Prepared By: J.D. McCrumb, Town Administrator

Background: The Town is required to certify the 2023 mill levy to the Arapahoe

County Commissioners no later than December 15, 2022.

Accordingly, the regular December meeting set for December 20
will be moved forward two weeks to December 6, 2022 at 6:30 p.m.

Recommended Motion: “I move to set a Special Meeting for Tuesday, December 6, 2022 at
6:30 p.m. to be held at Columbine Country Club in order to consider
Town business including the 2023 mill levy and 2023 Town Budget,
and to cancel the Regular Meeting on Tuesday, December 20, 2022”.



TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
Financial Statements Ended October 31, 2022
Variance Summary

General Fund

Revenues
- General Fund Revenues are at 108% of budget (PY 120%)
o Property taxes $610,841, 99% of budget (PY 99%)
o Violations $236,076
o Software Grant from State of CO $1,885
o Interest $38,384
o NEU Grant of $376,773 & Broncos $4,591(on balance sheet)
Administration — 66% of budget (PY 64%)
- Special Projects, Municode of $10,350 unbudgeted
- Bank/Credit card fees — both Wells Fargo and Bank of the West are active
- Accounting and audit — add’l work by CRS
- Workers comp has been moved with liability now-thus having health insurance below budget and
workers comp and liability being fully paid for the rest of 2022, this is corrected in 2023 budget
Public Safety — 82% of budget (PY 92%)
- Workers comp and liability insurance — paid in full for the rest of 2022
Arapahoe Cty Dispatch, Govpilot & Juvenile assessment & Tri-tech software are paid for the year
Offsite server backup & protection — includes add’l costs for new protection
Office 365 $400 month, budgeted at $208 month
Public Works — 55% of budget (PY 51%)
General Fund Expenditures
- General Fund Expenditures are at 70% of budget (PY 68%). In addition, a transfer to the Capital fund
was made in the amount of $3,800,000
- The ending fund balance is $1,055,667

Capital Fund
- Purchase of Ford Interceptor $38,200

- Purchase of Ford F450 snowplow $69,075
- Sale of Ford F350 $5,000
- Transfer from the general fund of $3,500,000, the ending fund balance is $5,145,793

Conservation Trust Fund
- Ending fund balance $22,290

Arapahoe County Open Space Fund
- Open Space funding received of $52,230

- Ending fund balance $523,244

Wild Plum Impact Fees
- Impact Fee revenues $292,100, 100% of budget (PY 79%) with zero expenditures to date

- Ending fund balance $1,180,655

Page | 1



Transportation Fees

- Transportation fees $104,535, 116% of budget (PY 80%) with zero expenditures to date
- Ending fund balance $211,874

Page | 2



TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
CASH POSITION
YEAR TO DATE (YTD) AS OF OCTOBER 31, 2022

TOTAL
ALL
Account Activity Item Description CHECKING INVESTMENTS ACCOUNTS
Wells Fargo checking $ 1,216,012 | $ - $ 1,216,012
Bank of the West checking 1,456,524 - 1,456,524
Bank of the West money market - 419,729 419,729
C-Safe Primary - 3,478,356 3,478,356
C-Safe Wild Plum Impact fee - 1,167,956 1,167,956
C-Safe CTF - 23,181 23,181
Arapahoe County shareback - 550,304 550,304
YTD Cash Balances 2,672,536 5,639,526 8,312,062
Less amount allocated for capital - - (5,145,793)
Less amount restricted for CTF - - (22,290)
Less amount restricted for ACOS . s (523,244)
Less amount restricted for impact fees - - (1,180,655)
Less amount restricted for transportation fees - - (211,874)|
CURRENT UNRESTRICTED/UNALLOCATED BALANCE $ 2,672,536 | $ 5,639,526 | $ 1,228,206

Page 1



g obey

(z1 =bed) (11 obed) {01 abed) (g obed) (g abed) { ofied) aouaJlajal |enjae sA j1abpng
£Z5'6EL'R v28'112 $ | 559'08L°L $ | t+vz'szs $ || 06222 $ | £62'spL's $ | 299°C50'L SIONVIVE ANNd ONIONI LA
90r¥'v16'L SES'VOL Z19'€0E 00S'eE 0L'y G2l'l69'E r@.w.mor.& 8auejeq puny uj ebueyds JaN
000's E E - : 000's - 05€4 p104 Jo ajes

- % - - % 000'008'c (000'008°c) sigpsuel)
(s09'261) - 2 < # - (so9's61) §507
LLO'29L2 SES'VOL ZL8'e0g 00S'EE 201'y (s22'201) ZeL'eze'l sainjipuadxa {1apLn) J9AC SANUAABI JO SSAOXT
(ev6°z02'l) 8 - |(o6Z'¥2) l(ssi'e) (s2'i01) [tzzz'89s'n) salnipuadxa QLA [ej0L
656'698'E SES'V0L Z12'20¢ 96.1'45 z9z'L B $55'068'C Senuaial gLA [ejo)
SES'VOL SEG'Y0L . - - 2 = 539} uoepodsue))
001262 - 00L'z6z - = = 5 $99) Joedw| Wn|d pIiMm
0£2'2S - - 0£Z'Zs - - - puny eseds usdo Ajunon soyedely
8£0'2 - & = 8£0'2 = = jusWsnuUa pund Jsnt] UOREAIISUOD
588°tL = = = - = G88'L Sjuelo
0l2'9 2 = = = = 0/2'9 Jayio
988's5 = gLL'LL 995°g vZz 2 ¥8€'8E 1sase|
¥5p'98e - = = = - ¥G¥'98e [ejusLiLuaabia]
Liv'608 = * - - = llv's08 sauy pue spuusg
vrL'bsLe - - # = = WI'vEL'e saxe]
SINIWILVLS TVIONYNIH ¥3d SINNIATYH LA
LL1'591'9 6£E°20L $ | eve'ass $ | +¥L'est $ | esL'al $ | s90's¥r'L $ | ovB'¥22'e S3IONVIVE ANNd SNINNI93g
SIVLOL sea4 s394 yoeduw) adeds uadp FETT |eyden |elauag uonduossaq way) AANOY Junoday
uonepodsues) wnid piis K9 soyedery uojjealasuod)

ZZ0Z 1€ Y3E0L20 40O SV (ALA) 31va OL Hv3A
SAINVIVE NN ITIVTIVAY 20 NOILYIOTY

AITIVA INIGWNTOD 40 NMOL




TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
BALANCE SHEET - ALL FUNDS
GOVERNMENTAL FUNDS
October 31, 2022
Unaudited

ASSETS
Cash and investments
Accrued revenue
Other receivables
Property tax receivable

TOTAL ASSETS

LIABILITIES AND FUND BALANCES
LIABILITIES
Accounts payable
Accrued liabilities
NEU & Broncos Grant
Deferred property tax revenue

Total liabilities

FUND BALANCES
General
Capital
Conservation trust fund
Arapahoe county open space
Wild Plum Impact fees
Transportation fees

Total fund balances

TOTAL LIABILITIES AND FUND BALANCES

Page 3

General

$ 8,312,062
228,686

53,496

4,578

$ 8,598,822

$ 49,373
23,984

381,364

4,578

459,299

1,055,667
5,145,793
22,290
523,244
1,180,655
211,874

8,139,523

$ 8,598,822




TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
GENERAL - SUMMARY
STATEMENT OF REVENUES, EXPENDITURES AND CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BUDGET AND ACTUAL - MODIFIED ACCRUAL (BUDGETARY) BASIS
FOR THE TEN MONTHS ENDED OCTOBER 31, 2022

Unaudited
Percent of
Adopted YTD Variance Annual
YTD Annual from Annual Budget
Actual Budget Budget (83% YTD)
REVENUES
Taxes $ 2,154,144 $ 2,129,498 3 24,646 101%
Permits and fines 809,417 630,000 179,417 128%
Intergovernmental 386,454 382,259 4,195 101%
Interest 38,384 1,000 37,384 3838%
Other 6,270 - 6,270 -
Grants 1,885 - 1,885 -
Total revenues 3,396,554 3,142,757 253,797 108%
EXPENDITURES
Administration 632,319 953,612 (321,293) 66%
Planning and engineering 27,914 53,500 (25,586) 52%
Public safety 709,680 867,980 (158,300) 82%
Public works 198,309 361,849 (163,540) 55%
Total expenditures 1,568,222 2,236,941 (668,719) 70%
EXCESS OF REVENUES OVER
EXPENDITURES 1,828,332 905,816 922,516 202%
OTHER FINANCING USES
Other loss (197,605) - (197,605) -
Transfer to capital (3,800,000) (2,700,000) (1,100,000) 141%
Total other financing uses (3,997,605) (2,700,000) (1,297,605) 148%
NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE (2,169,273) 8§ (1,794,184) $  (375,089)
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE 3,224,940
ENDING FUND BALANCE $ 1,055,667

Page 4



TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
GENERAL - DETAILS
STATEMENT OF REVENUES, EXPENDITURES AND CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BUDGET AND ACTUAL - MODIFIED ACCRUAL (BUDGETARY) BASIS
FOR THE ONE MONTH AND TEN MONTHS ENDED OCTOBER 31, 2022

Unaudited
Percent of
Adopted YTD Variance Annual
Current YTD Annual from Annual Budget
Month Actual Budget Budget (83% YTD)
REVENUES
Taxes
Cable television $ 7412 8§ 33,714 § 36,000 $ (2,286) 94%
Property taxes (788) 610,841 615,419 (4,578) 99%
Sales and use taxes 297,067 1,419,522 1,385,000 34,522 102%
Specific ownership taxes 6,512 32,438 43,079 (10,641) 75%
Utility franchise fees 10,971 57,629 50,000 7,629 115%
Total taxes 321,174 2,154,144 2,129,498 24,646 101%
Permits and fines
Court fines 7,195 82,192 100,000 (17,808) 82%
Permits, fees and services 54,356 491,149 530,000 (38,851) 93%
Violations - 236,076 - 236,076 -
Total permits and fines 61,551 809,417 630,000 179,417 128%
Intergovernmental
Bow Mar IGA - 304,833 300,259 4,574 102%
Bow Mar IGA admin = 20,000 20,000 - 100%
County highway tax revenue 1,250 19,088 15,000 4,088 127%
Motor vehicle registration fees 528 4911 6,000 (1,089) 82%
State cigarette tax apportionment 292 815 1,000 (185) 82%
State highway user's tax 7,600 36,307 40,000 (3,193) 92%
Total intergovernmental 9,670 386,454 382,259 4,195 101%
Interest 9,589 38,384 1,000 37,384 3838%
Other 515 6,270 - 6,270 -
Grants - 1,885 - 1,885 -
TOTAL REVENUES 402,499 3,396,554 3,142,757 253,797 108%
EXPENDITURES
Administration
Accounting and audit 11,369 76,572 63,500 13,072 121%
Advertising/notices - 1,661 500 1,161 332%
Bank/credit card fees 613 7,131 5,100 2,031 140%
Building inspection and planning review 12,269 155,857 238,500 (82,643) 65%
Building maintenance and utilities 2,211 18,958 22,011 (3,053) 86%
Community functions 869 28,424 55,000 (26,576) 52%
Computer expense - 4,705 14,500 (9,795) 32%
County treasurer’s collection fees 19 6,114 6,154 (40) 99%
Dues and publications 300 10,231 8,850 1,381 116%
Education and training - 3,174 12,000 (8,826) 26%
Election - - 4,000 {4,000) 0%
Emergency response and preparedness - 1,225 3,000 (1,775) 41%
Health insurance (14,314) 23,518 47,000 (23,482) 50%
Workers comp and liability insurance 16,632 36,095 34,047 2,048 106%
Legal - 24,972 45,000 (20,028) 55%
Mayor/monthly breakfasts - 289 2,000 (1,711) 14%
Miscellaneous - 2,453 2,300 153 107%
Payroll taxes 810 6,451 12,575 {6,124) 51%
Pension 937 7,079 12,575 (5,496) 56%

Paage 5



TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
GENERAL - DETAILS
STATEMENT OF REVENUES, EXPENDITURES AND CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BUDGET AND ACTUAL - MODIFIED ACCRUAL (BUDGETARY) BASIS
FOR THE ONE MONTH AND TEN MONTHS ENDED OCTOBER 31, 2022

Unaudited
Percent of
Adopted YTD Variance Annual
Current YTD Annual from Annual Budget
Month Actual Budget Budget (83% YTD)
Salaries 17,523 195,423 251,500 (56,077) 78%
Special projects - 10,350 - 10,350 -
Supplies, printing, postage - 5,813 13,000 (7,187) 45%
Telephone/communications 374 5,824 6,500 (676) 90%
Emergency reserve - - 94,000 (94,000) 0%
Total administration 49,612 632,319 953,612 (321,293) 66%
Planning and engineering
Town planning 2,364 11,254 36,000 (24,746) 31%
Town engineer 5,348 16,660 16,000 660 104%
Miscellaneous - - 1,500 (1,500) 0%
Total planning and engineering 7,712 27,914 53,500 (25,586) 52%
Public safety
Operations
Cruiser gas 2,764 16,118 22,100 (5,982) 73%
Cruiser oil/maintenance - 4,647 18,000 (13,353) 26%
Cruiser insurance - 4,558 8,487 (3,929) 54%
Education/training - 4,246 11,750 (7,504) 36%
Equipment repair 783 783 5,875 (5,092) 13%
Health insurance 6,668 62,712 70,900 (8,188) 88%
Workers comp and liability insurance - 35477 29,705 5,772 119%
Payroll taxes 1,862 16,317 24,730 (8,413) 66%
Pension 3,797 39,878 49,459 (9,581) 81%
Salaries 39,429 418,265 494,590 (76,325) 85%
Supplies/miscellaneous 1,163 7,333 15,980 (8,647) 46%
Telephones/air cards 124 1,660 2,938 (1,278) 57%
Uniforms - 5,160 11,750 (6,590) 44%
Total operations 56,590 617,154 766,264 (149,110} 81%
Municipal court
Judge 500 5,000 8,000 (3,000) 63%
Legal - 21,690 27,500 (5,810) 79%
Administration - 1,328 2,000 (672) 66%
Supplies - 1,312 2,000 (688) 66%
Interpreter 200 2,000 2,000 - 100%
Total municipal court 700 31,330 41,500 (10,170) 75%
Contracts
Arapahoe county dispatch fee - 34,406 33,709 697 102%
Tri-tech software - 1,224 1,225 1) 100%
Humane society - - 500 (500) 0%
Juvenile assessment - 595 782 (187) 76%
Netmotion - - 500 (500) 0%
CACP - - 250 (250) 0%
CISC - - 1,000 (1,000) 0%
WhenIWork - 36 450 414) 8%
Total contracts - 36,261 38,416 (2,155) 94%
Computer/IT
Offsite server backup and protection 1,411 4,111 1,800 2,311 228%
Office 365 accounts - 3,087 2,500 587 123%
Scheduled computer replacement - 3,737 3,500 237 107%

Paae 6



Govpilot
Total computer/IT
Total public safety

Public works
Ground maintenance
Health insurance
Other drainage/water
Payroll taxes
Pension
Professional fees-mosquito control
Salary
Sanitation/trash/recycle service
Signs maintenance
Snow removal
Storm water permit process/NPDES
Street and gutter maintenance
Streets and gutters contingency
Street lighting
Striping
Vehicle maintenance
Total public works

TOTAL EXPENDITURES

EXCESS OF REVENUES OVER
EXPENDITURES

OTHER FINANCING USES
Other loss
Transfer to capital

Total other financing uses

NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE

BEGINNING FUND BALANCE

ENDING FUND BALANCE

TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
GENERAL - DETAILS
STATEMENT OF REVENUES, EXPENDITURES AND CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BUDGET AND ACTUAL - MODIFIED ACCRUAL (BUDGETARY) BASIS
FOR THE ONE MONTH AND TEN MONTHS ENDED OCTOBER 31, 2022

Unaudited

Percent of

Adopted YTD Variance Annual

Current YTD Annual from Annual Budget
Month Actual Budget Budget (83% YTD)
- 14,000 14,000 - 100%
1,411 24,935 21,800 3,135 114%
58,701 709,680 867,980 (158,300) 82%
3,804 13,439 8,578 4,861 157%
937 6,832 7,934 (1,102) 86%
- - 5,000 (5,000) 0%
249 2,166 4,193 (2,027) 52%
272 3,772 4,193 421) 90%
- 7,042 7,500 (458) 94%
3,154 55,745 83,850 (28,105) 66%
8,404 82,305 92,000 (9,695) 89%
- - 1,061 (1,061) 0%
- 2,246 5,500 3,254) 41%
- 705 7,500 (6,795) 9%
- 5,740 75,000 (69,260) 8%
- - 40,000 (40,000) 0%
951 16,266 15,000 1,266 108%
- - 1,040 (1,040) 0%
- 2,051 3,500 (1,449) 59%
17,771 198,309 361,849 (163,540) 55%
133,796 1,568,222 2,236,941 (668,719) 70%
268,703 1,828,332 905,816 922,516 202%

- (197,605) - (197,605) -
(300,000) (3,800,000) (2,700,000) (1,100,000) 141%
(300,000) (3,997,605) (2,700,000) (1,297,605) 148%

$ (31,297) § (2,169,273) § (1,794,184) § (375,089)

3,224,940

1,055,667




TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY

CAPITAL

STATEMENT OF REVENUES, EXPENDITURES AND CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BUDGET AND ACTUAL - MODIFIED ACCRUAL (BUDGETARY) BASIS
FOR THE TEN MONTHS ENDED OCTOBER 31, 2022

REVENUES

Total revenues

EXPENDITURES
Public safety
Flock camera system
Vehicle
Public works
Lightpole replacement
Truck - snow removal

Total expenditures

EXCESS OF EXPENDITURES OVER
REVENUES

OTHER FINANCING SOURCES
Gain on sale of asset

Transfer from general
Transfer from impact fee

Total other financing sources
NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE

ENDING FUND BALANCE

$ 5,145,793

Page 8

Unaudited
Percent of
Adopted YTD Variance Annual
YTD Annual from Annual Budget
Actual Budget Budget (83% YTD)
S - $ - S - -
- 17,500 (17,500) 0%
38,200 55,000 (16,800) 69%
- 12,000 (12,000) 0%
69,075 68,000 1,075 102%
107,275 152,500 (45,225) 70%
(107,275) (152,500) 45,225 70%
5,000 - 5,000 -
3,800,000 2,700,000 1,100,000 141%
- 9,520 (9,520) 0%
3,805,000 2,709,520 1,095,480 140%
3,697,725  §2557,020 § 1,140,705
1,448,068



TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY

CONSERVATION TRUST

STATEMENT OF REVENUES, EXPENDITURES AND CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BUDGET AND ACTUAL - MODIFIED ACCRUAL (BUDGETARY) BASIS

FOR THE TEN MONTHS ENDED OCTOBER 31, 2022

REVENUES
Conservation Trust Fund entitlement
CTF interest

Total revenues

EXPENDITURES
Conservation trust fund expenditures

Total expenditures
NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE

ENDING FUND BALANCE

Unaudited
Percent of

Adopted YTD Variance Annual

YTD Annual from Annual Budget
Actual Budget Budget (83% YTD)
$ 7,038 8 8,700 (1,662) 81%
224 7 217 3200%
7,262 8,707 (1,445) 83%
3,155 6,000 (2,845) 53%
3,155 6,000 (2,845) 53%

4,107 $ 2,707 1,400

18,183

$ 22,290

Page 9




TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY

ARAPAHOE COUNTY OPEN SPACE FUND

STATEMENT OF REVENUES, EXPENDITURES AND CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BUDGET AND ACTUAL - MODIFIED ACCRUAL (BUDGETARY) BASIS
FOR THE TEN MONTHS ENDED OCTOBER 31, 2022

REVENUES
Arapahoe County open space revenues
ACOP interest

Total revenues
EXPENDITURES

Nevada ditch
Trails master plan

Total expenditures
NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE

ENDING FUND BALANCE

Page 10

Unaudited
Percent of
Adopted YTD Variance Annual
YTD Annual from Annual Budget
Actual Budget Budget (83% YTD)
$ 52,230 $  4de,114 $ 6,116 113%
5,566 184 5,382 3025%
57,796 46,298 11,498 125%
20,000 30,000 (10,000) 67%
4,296 - 4,296 "
24,296 30,000 (5,704) 81%
33,500 $ 16,298 3 17,202
489,744
$ 523,244



TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
WILD PLUM IMPACT FEES
STATEMENT OF REVENUES, EXPENDITURES AND CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BUDGET AND ACTUAL - MODIFIED ACCRUAL (BUDGETARY) BASIS
FOR THE TEN MONTHS ENDED OCTOBER 31, 2022

REVENUES
Wild Plum Impact fees
Interest

Total revenues

EXPENDITURES
Total expenditures

EXCESS OF REVENUES OVER
EXPENDITURES

OTHER FINANCING USES
Transfer to capital

Total other financing uses
NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE

ENDING FUND BALANCE

Unaudited
Percent of
Adopted YTD Variance Annual
YTD Annual from Annual Budget
Actual Budget Budget (83% YTD)
$ 292,100 $ 292,100 $ - 100%
11,712 145 11,567 8077%
303,812 292,245 11,567 104%
303,812 292,245 11,567 104%
- (9,520) 9,520 0%
- (9,520) 9,520 0%
303,812 $ 282,725 b 21,087
876,843
$ 1,180,655

Page 11



TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
TRANSPORTATION FEES
STATEMENT OF REVENUES, EXPENDITURES AND CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BUDGET AND ACTUAL - MODIFIED ACCRUAL (BUDGETARY) BASIS
FOR THE TEN MONTHS ENDED OCTOBER 31, 2022

Unaudited
Percent of
Adopted YTD Variance Annual
YTD Annual from Annual Budget
Actual Budget Budget (83% YTD)
REVENUES
Transportation fees $ 104,535 $ 90,000 8 14,535 116%
Total revenues 104,535 90,000 14,535 116%
EXPENDITURES - - - -
Total expenditures - - - -
NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE 104,535 $ 90,000 3 14,535
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE 107,339
ENDING FUND BALANCE $ 211,874

Page 12



istrator’s Report

min

Town Ad

November 2022

oo
9
=
)
=
o
-
L.5]
R=1
B
i B
3 8 2
st ) O
i e o
L}
wy
%w.@
&~ 98
Lo
£ Sy
S 2 B
Lt TR
- T =
T =
B R 3,
> g o™
L @ o~
2 82
Vdoo
v = 0O
an
L= ¥
22 ;
2 8 =
() =
CMV
— N W
o 5
E B
o =
E ©
@]

b

Valle
Colorado

ine

Town of

Columb

*




—

Communications & Administration

N L add

The first (at least in a very long time) employee benefits fair was
held this week. Employees of the Town were invited for a pizza
lunch and to hear from all benefit providers so that they could ask
specific questions about their benefit options and chose the right
package for them and their families. This event was coordinated
and hosted by the Town’s HR consultant, Kate Eckel. Kate is
also building a proper benefits informational binder for all new
employees, which will be a formal part of all new employee
orientation/onboarding. The benefits fair will be an annual event
moving forward.

Town staff spent a great deal of time in the past six weeks
preparing and applying for a CDOT grant to provide funding for
the proposed sidewalk along Platte Canyon Road between Ponds
Circle and Village Drive. The effort was lead by Brent Kaslon
with tremendous help from Planning Commission chair (and
grant writer extraordinaire) Sandy Graham.

Public Works and Engineering staff continue to prepare for the
road construction project approved by the Trustees for 2023.
There is no new information to report at this time.

Additional 2022 projects will continue into next year, primarily
the codification of the Town’s municipal code which is presently
under review by Municode staff and is expected to be brought
back to the Trustees early next year for additional code clean-up
action.

Directory Update: Approximately 203 printed directories have
been picked up at Town Hall. Approximately 185 households
have also opted in for DirectorySpot (online directory). Work on

the 2023 printed directory has begun.




Building Department

; Monthly Stats Oct. Permit Rev.: $202,544.94

11 Permits Issued

e NewSFR: 1

e Major Remodels: 0
New Roofs: 1 Permit Fee,
Basement Finish: 3 $37,327.00
Other/Misc.: 6 Salesid Use, Plan Review,

i e $82,049.35
- 5 $20,532.78
164 Inspections

19 Licenses Issued _
S '/ Transportation =

General: 7 £ Fee, $43,097.00 )
Electrician: 7 "

Impact Fee,
$12,700

IR Open Space,
Plumbers: 1 $6,838.81

‘Mechanical: 2




Public Works

Town Hall: The computer cords and cables were
updated in the board room to increase the
functionally of virtual court. The Building was
prepped for winter weather and the irrigation system
was drained and blown out.

Fleet: The registration for the new F450 with the
DMV was completed including new license plates.

Wild Plum Streets: The official acceptance process
for accepting the Wild Plum streets and gutters was
finalized and sent to Lennar. The next step is for
Lennar to schedule a walk with the town to compile
a punch list of problems. Once the process is
complete, the town will take ownership of the streets
under probationary acceptance.

Wild Plum Landscape: A meeting of development
stakeholders and Town staff was held in order to
bring the new boardwalk contractor up to speed with
the history of that amenity and the processes the
Town will require as they move to complete the
boardwalk.

Wild Plum Review: A second draft of the emergency
accesses preliminary plans were submitted to the
town for review. Comments were sent back to
Lennar and we are awaiting the official submission
for review. The new camera system for Wild Plum
was also reviewed. There are many issues that
Lennar still needs to address before the system will be
in compliance.



Columbine Valley Police
Department

Serving Bow Mar
2 Middlefield Rd. Columbine Valley, Colorado 80123

www.columbinevalley.org
(303) 795-1434 Fax (303) 795-7325

Columbine Valley P.D. Monthly Report

For November 2022
Full Time Positions 6 of 6
Part Time Positions 2 of 4
Regular hours 845
OT hours worked 16
Off Duty 0
PTO 179

October 2022 Violations

Charges For the Date Range 10/1/2022 Thru 10/31/2022

Qty Charge
34 1101(2)(H) SPEEDING 10 - 19 MPH OVER:
3 1101(2)(H) SPEEDING 20 AND OVER:
1 703(3) FAIL TO STOP AT A STOP SIGN:
1 1210(A) ON STREET PARKING PROHIBITED (3-6 AM):

39 Total Number of Violations Issued



Case
Number
Cv22-0000172
Cv22-0000173
CV22-0000174
Cv22-0000175
Cv22-0000176
Cv22-0000177
Cv22-0000178
Cv22-0000179
Cv22-0000180
Cv22-0000181
Cv22-0000182
Cv22-0000183
Cv22-0000184
Cv22-0000185
Cv22-0000186
Cv22-0000187
Cv22-0000188

Monthly Case # Report

Event Date

10/03/2022 06:06:30 PM
10/06/2022 10:15:05 AM
10/06/2022 09:11:03 PM
10/06/2022 11:43:06 PM
10/10/2022 09:59:36 AM
10/11/2022 08:50:53 PM
10/11/2022 10:29:42 PM
10/11/2022 10:36:41 PM
10/13/2022 04:47:29 PM
10/21/2022 02:19:01 PM
10/22/2022 03:59:36 PM
10/23/2022 09:44:18 PM
10/24/2022 05:01:29 PM
10/26/2022 12:28:32 PM
10/26/2022 12:29:30 PM
10/27/2022 11:06:03 PM
10/28/2022 09:20:05 PM

Situation Reported
TRAFFIC STOP IP

Theft from Motor Vehicle
TRAFFIC STOP IP

Auto Theft

Harassment

WARRANT ARREST IP
RESIDENTIAL ALARM IP
TRAFFIC ARREST IP

ASSIST TO OTHER AGENCY IP
Disturbance Physical
TRAFFIC ARREST IP
WARRANT ARREST IP

Sex Crime

Sex Assault

Sex Crime

Restraining Order Vio
SUSPICIOUS CIRCUMSTANCE IP



Problem Type Summary

8:31 AM 11/8/2022
Data Source: Data Warehouse

gency: ACSO
ivision: Bow Mar, Bow Mar Inactive Personnel, Columbine Valley, Columbine Valley Inactive Pers
ay Range: Date From 10/1/2022 To 10/31/2022

¢ Calls canceled before first unit assigned
* Calls canceled before first unit at scene

Select a format L’E_xport

xclusion:

1 P1 In Progress
2 P2 Urgent
3 P3 Non Emergency
) |P4 Police Details
5 [P5 On View
6 P6 Phone
7 P7 Dispatch
8 P8 CAD Test Record
9 P9 Call on Hold
Priority
Problem Type | 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 Total
1 HANGUP IP 1 1
BANDONED VEHICLE IP*
CCIDENT ALERT IP
NIMAL CALL IP* 6 6
ssault B
SSIST TO OTHER AGENCY IP
uto Theft 1 1
UTO THEFT IP
urglary
urglary Attempt
URGLARY ATTEMPT IP
URGLARY IP
ALARM IP
"HECK IP*
ANCEL RUNAWAY IP
hild Abuse
HILD ABUSE IP
ITIZEN ASSIST IP 4 4
ODE ENFORCEMENT IP* 2 2
riminal Impersonation
RIMINAL IMPERSONATION IP




riminal Mischiefl
RIMINAL MISCHIEF 1P
riminal Tampering
RIMINAL TAMPERING 1P
EAD ON ARRIVAL IP
isturbance Physical
ISTURBANCE PHYSICAL IP
isturbance Verbal
ISTURBANCE VERBAL IP
omestic Violence Physical
OMESTIC VIOLENCE PHYSICAL IP
omestic Violence Verbal
OMESTIC VIOLENCE VE
rug Violation
RUG VIOLATION IP
RUNK SUBJECT IP
urie
Ider Abuse
LDER ABUSE IP
IREWORKS IP

UND PERSON IP

IND PROPERTY IP*

ARASSMENT IP
ate Crime

ATE CRIME IP
OME CHECK IP*

DENTITY THEFT IP
IPOUNDED VEHICLE IP
FORMATION IP
vJURY ACCIDENT IP
NTIMIDATING A WITNESS IP
EEP THE PEACE IP*

IQUOR VIOLATION IP

OUD NOISE COMPLAINT IP
EDICAL IP
enacing
ENACING IP
ENTAL SUBJECT IP
ESSAGE FOR DEPUTY IP
ISSING CHILD IP
issing Person
ISSING PERSON IP
BSTRUCTION IP
DOR INVESTIGATION IP
PEN DOOR IP*

VERSIZED VEHICLE IP*

“OMPLAINT IP*
SS SHOTS FIRED IP
roperty Accident

ROPERTY ACCIDENT IP
JFFING VEHICLE IP*
ECOVERED STOLEN PROPERTY IP
ECOVERED STOLEN VEHICLE IP
EDI REPORT IP
EPOSSESSED VEHICLE IP
ESIDENTIAL ALARM IP
estraining Order Vio

1 1

1 1
1 1

4

1 1

1 1

3 S
6 6

7 z

1 1

1 1
12 12
1 1




ESTRAINING ORDER VIO IP
obbery

OBBERY IP

unaway

UNAWAY IP

AFE 2 TELL

LECTIVE ENFORCEMENT IP*

10TS FIRED IP
icide Attempt
IICIDE ATTEMPT IP
IICIDE COMPLETED IP
JICIDE THREAT IP
ISPICIOUS CIRCUMSTANCE IP
ISPICIOUS PERSON IP
JSPICIOUS VEHICLE IP
heft
heft from Motor Vehicle
HEFT FROM MOTOR VEHICLE IP
HEFT IP
RAFFIC ARREST IP
raffic Complaint
RAFFIC COMPLAINT IP
RAFFIC OBSTRUCTION IP
RAFFIC STOP IP
RANSPORT IP
respass to Property
RESPASS TO PROPERTY IP
respass to Vehicle
RESPASS TO VEHICLE IP
NKNOWN INJURY ACCIDENT IP
NLAWFUL ACTS IP
NWANTED SUBJECT IP
EHICLE LOCKOUT IP
ARRANT ARREST IP
ARRANT PICKUP IP

feapons Violation
'EAPONS VIOLATION IP
'ELFARE CHECK IP
Z-Animal Call
Z-Suspicious Person

Z-Suspicious Vehicle
Z-Unwanted Subject
Z-ZONING IP

Total

7 7

1 1

2 2

1 1
2 2
2 2
2 2

1 1

1 1

2 2
81 81
1 1

1 i)

2 2
116 33 13 162




Date:

Title:
Presented By:
Prepared By:

Background:

Attachments:

Fiscal Impacts:

Staff Recommendations:

Recommended Motion(s):

Town of

*aColumbineValley
Colorado

Request for Board of Trustee Action

October 18, 2022

Trustee Bill #5 — Series 2022 Building Codes
Jim Thelen, Chief Building Official

Jim Thelen, Chief Building Official

The Town is presently utilizing the 2018 International Residential
Code and the 2017 National Electric Code. In October 2022 the
Board of Trustees were presented with the 2021 commercial building
code; the International Building, Plumbing, Mechanical, Energy
Conservation, Fuel Gas, Property Maintenance, Swimming
Pool/Spa, and Elevator codes. The Trustees held a public hearing
and approved the codes on first reading at that time.

A series of minor amendments from the codes as written were
presented for adoption in Columbine Valley; no changes to the
presented amendments were offered or acted upon.

To reflect a more accurate valuation for decks, patio covers and
garages the valuation tables have increased to $65.00 per square foot
for each of these projects. All other valuations remain the same. The
Trustees increased building permit fees with the adoption of the 2015
International Codes. A fee increase is not included in the ordinance,
however if the trustees wish to discuss an increase a Resolution will
be prepared.

Trustee Bill #5 — Series 2022

As presented, the increase in valuation for decks, patio covers and
garages would result in a slight increase in overall building
department revenue,

Approve as presented.

“I move to approve as presented Trustee Bill #5, 2022 on 2™
reading.”



TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY

TRUSTEE BILL NO. 5 INTRODUCTED BY TRUSTEE
SERIES OF 2022 TRUSTEE: AL TIMOTHY
A BILL FOR AN ORDINANCE

ADOPTING THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL’S 2021 INTERNATIONAL
BUILDING CODE; THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL’S 2021 INTERNATIONAL
RESIDENTIAL CODE; THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL’S 2021 MECHANICAL
CODE; THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL’S 2021 PLUMBING CODE; THE
INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL’S 2021 FUEL GAS CODE; THE INTERNATIONAL
CODE COUNCIL’S 2021 INTERTNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE; THE
INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL’S 2021 INTERNATIONAL  ENERGY
CONSERVATION CODE; THE INTERNATIONAL CODE CONFERENCE’S 2021
INTERNATIONAL SWIMMING POOL AND SPA CODE; AMERICAN NATIONAL
STANDARD INSTITUTE / AMERICAN SOCIETY OF MECHANICAL ENGINEERS A.17.1
2019 AMERICAN SOCIETY OF MECHANICAL ENGINEERS A.17.3 2005, AMERICAN
SOCIETY OF MECHANICAL ENGINEERS A.18.1 2017 SAFETY CODE FOR ELEVATORS
WITH AMENDMENTS AND ALL APPENDICES THERETO; PROVIDING PENALTIES
FOR VIOLATIONS THERETO; ADOPTING AMENDMENTS; AND PROVIDING NOTICE
THAT COPIES THEREOF ARE AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION AT THE TOWN’S OFFICE
LOCATED AT 2 MIDDLEFIELD.

WHEREAS, the purpose of the International Building Code is to provide minimum
standards to safeguard life or limb, health, property, and the public welfare by regulating and
controlling the design, construction, quality of materials, use and occupancy. Location and
maintenance of all buildings and structures within this jurisdiction and certain equipment
specifically regulated therein;

WHEREAS, the purpose of the International Residential Code is to provide minimum
standards for the construction, alteration, movement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy,
location removal and demolition of one- and two-family dwellings.

WHEREAS, the purpose of the International Mechanical code is to provide minimum
requirements and standards for the protection of the public welfare by regulating and controlling
the design, construction, installation, quality of materials, location operation and maintenance, or
use of heating, ventilating, cooling, refrigeration systems, incinerators, and other miscellaneous
heat producing appliances within this jurisdiction.




WHEREAS, the purpose of the International Plumbing Code is to provide minimum
standards for the protection of the public health, safety and welfare by providing for the safe
installation and maintenance of sewage and water piping systems.

WHEREAS, the purpose of the International Fuel Gas Code is to provide minimum
standards for the protection of the public health safety and welfare by providing for safe
installation of fuel gas piping systems, fuel gas utilization equipment and related accessories;

WHEREAS, the purpose of the International Property Maintenance Code is to provide
standards to safeguard life, health and the public welfare by regulating and controlling the uses
and occupancy, location and maintenance of all buildings and structures;

WHEREAS, the purpose of the International Energy Conservation Code is to establish
minimum standards and regulations for the design of energy efficient constructions;

WHEREAS, the purpose of the International Fire Code is to establish the minimum
requirements for providing a reasonable level of fire safety and property protection from hazards
of fire, explosion or dangerous conditions in new and existing buildings;

WHEREAS, the purpose of the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code is to
regulate the construction, alteration, movement, renovation, replacement, repair and maintenance

of aquatic recreation facilities, pools and spas;

WHEREAS, copies of the above-mentioned documents are available for inspection in
the office Columbine Valley, Colorado during weekday business hours; and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE TOWN TRUSTEES OF THE TOWN
OF COLUMBINE VALLEY, COLORADO, THAT:

Section 1: Chapter 15.08 of the Town of Columbine Municipal code is hereby amended
to read:

15.08.010 Code adoption

15.08.020 Amendments, Modifications and Changes

15.08.010 INTERNATIONAL CODES ADOPTED: The following codes are
hereby adopted for use and regulation of buildings and structures within the town; said
codes shall be available for public inspection at all reasonable hours in the town offices



A) International Building Code, 2021 edition of the International Code Council, including
Appendix Chapter C and J.

B) International Residential Code, 2021 edition of the International Code Council.

8) International Mechanical Code, 2021 edition of the International Code Council, including
Appendix Chapter A.

D) International Plumbing Code, 2021 edition of the International Code Council.

E) International Property Maintenance Code, 2021 edition of the International Code Council.
F) International Fuel Gas Code, 2021 edition of the International Code Council.

G) International Energy Conservation Code, 2021 edition of the International Code Council,
H) International Fire Code, 2021 edition of the international Code Council. (Reserved)

D American National Standard Institute/American Society of Mechanical Engineers (ASME) A17.1
2019 Safety code for Elevators and Escalators; (ASME) A17.3 2017 and (ASME) A18.1 2005
American National Standard Institute/American Society of Mechanical Engineers (ASME) A17.1
2007 Safety code for Elevators and Escalators; (ASME) A17.3 2005 and (ASME) A18.1 2017

)} International Swimming Pool and Spa Code, 2021 edition of the International Code Council,

Section 2: Chapter 15.08.020 of the Town of Columbine Valley Municipal Code is repealed and
reenacted to read.

15.08.020 AMENDMENTS, MODIFICATIONS AND CHANGES
A) Amendments to the International Building code: The following amendments are hereby
adopted to the International Building Code. _
1) Chapter 1 is hereby deleted, the administrative requirements for the International Building
Code are in Section 15.40.20 of the Town Municipal Code.

2) - Table 508.4 is hereby amended to read:

The required fire separation between a B occupancy and an F-1 occupancy shall be 1 hour, the required
fire separation between a B occupancy and an S-1 occupancy shall be 1 hour, the required fire separation
between an M occupancy and a F-1 occupancy shall be 1 hours, the required fire separation between an

M occupancy and an S-1 occupancy shall be 1 hours.
3) Section 1011.7.3 Exception is hereby deleted and reenacted to read:

Exception: Spaces under stairways serving and contained with single residential dwelling
unit in Group R-2 or R-# shall be permitted to be protected on the enclosed side with 5/8”

type x gypsum board.



B)

4) Section 1601 is hereby amended by the addition of a new paragraph 1601.1 which shall

read:

1601.1 Design Criteria: The design criteria for the Town of Columbine Valley shall be as

follows:

Roof snow load

Nominal wind speed
Ultimate wind speed

Frost depth

Seismic design category
Termite

Decay

Weathering

Winter design temperature
Ice shield underlayment requires
Degree heating days
100-year hourly rainfall

30 psf.

110 mph

120 mph

36 inches

B

slight to moderate
none to slight
severe

1 degree

yes (see sec. 1507.2.8.2)
6200

2.67” per hour

5) Section 1704.14 is hereby amended by the deletion of the exceptions.

6) Section 2701.1 is hereby repealed and reenacted to read:

2701.1 Scope: This chapter governs the electrical components, equipment and systems
used in building and structures covered by this code. The administrative code
requirements shall be in accordance with 18.08.020 of the Town of Columbine Valley

Municipal Code.

Amendments to the International Residential Code: The following amendments are hereby
adopted to the International Residential Code.

1) Prior to the issuance of the building permit HOA approval is required.

2) The height of a new single — family homes shall have the height certified by a
licensed Colorado Surveyor after the roof trusses are set.

3) Section R301.1 is hereby amended by the following paragraph:



Design Criteria: The design criteria or the Town of Columbine Valley shall be as follows:

0

Roof snow load

Nominal wind speed
Ultimate wind speed

Frost depth

Seismic design category
Termite

Decay

Weathering

Winter design temperature
Ice shield underlayment requires
Degree heating days
100-year hourly rainfall

30 psf.

110 mph

120 mph

36 inches

B

slight to moderate
none to slight
severe

1 degree

yes (see sec. 1507.2.8.2)
6200

2,677 per hour

4) Table 302.6 Dwelling/Garage Separation, is hereby amended to read:

Separation Materials
From the residence and attic 5/8” X gypsum beard applied
To the garage side

From habitable rooms above garage

Not less than 5/8” X gypsum board

Structures supporting floor ceiling
assemblies used for separation
required by the section

Not less than 5/8” X gypsum board

Garages located less than 3 feet
from a dwelling unit on the same lot

Not less than 5/8” X gypsum board
applied to the interior side of the
exterior walls that are within this
area

Amendments to the International Plumbing Code: The following amendments are hereby

adopted to the International Plumbing Code.

1) Chapter 1 is hereby deleted; the administrative requirements for the International Plumbing
Code are in chapter 15.04.20 of the Town of Columbine Valley Municipal Code.

2) Section 305.4 is hereby repealed and reenacted to read:

305.4 Freezing: Water, soil and waste pipes shall not be installed outside the building, attic or
crawl spaces concealed in outside walls, or in any other place subject to freezing temperatures

unless adequate provision.is made to protect

both. Exterior water supply piping shall be installed not less than

such pipes from freezing by insulation or heat or
60” below grade.

3) Section 903.1 is hereby repealed and reenacted to read:

903.1 Roof Extensions: All open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall be
terminated at least 12” above the roof.



D)

4

5)

Subsection 918.1 is hereby amended by the addition of a new paragraph 918.1.1 which
shall read:

918.1.1 Isometric drawings required: In other than one- and two-family dwellings, an
isometric drawing of the waste and vent system with location of air admittance valves
shall be provided. Such drawing shall be prepared and wet stamp and signed by a
registered Colorado Professional Engineer.

Subsection 1111.1 is hereby repealed and reenacted to read:

1111.1 Subsoil Drains: Subsoil drains shall be installed as required by the engineered
geo-technical soils report. Subsoil drains shall be open jointed, horizontally split, or
perforated pipe conforming to one of the standards listed in table 1102.5. Such drains
shall not be less than 4” in diameter. When the building is subjected to backwater, the
subsoil drain shall be protected by an accessibly located backwater valve. Subsoil drains
shall discharge to a trapped area drain, sump, drywell, or approved location above
ground. When the subsoil drains discharges into a pit locate within the structure, a sump
pump shall be provided and installed. The sump and plumbing system shall comply with
subsection 1113.1.

Amendments to the International Fuel Gas Code: The following amendments are hereby
adopted to the International Fuel Gas Code.

1

2)
3)

Chapter 1 is hereby deleted; the administrative requirements for the International Fuel
Gas Code are in chapter 15.04.20 of the Town of Columbine Valley Municipal Code.

Section 303.3 is hereby amended by the deletion of exceptions 3 and 4.
Section 406.4 is hereby repealed and reenacted to read:

406.4.1 Test pressure: The gas piping shall withstand a pressure of not less than10 pounds per

4
5)
6)

square inch gauge pressure as measured on a 30-pound gauge. Test pressures shall be
held for a length of time satisfactory to the administrative Authority, but in no case less
than 15 minutes, with no perceptible drop in pressure. For welded piping, and for piping
carrying gas at pressure more than fourteen inches water column, the test pressure shall
not be less than sixty pounds per square inch and shall be continued for a length of time
satisfactory to the administrative authority, but in no case less than thirty minutes. These
tests shall be made using air, C02, or nitrogen pressure only and shall be made in the
presence of administrative authority. All necessary apparatus for conducting tests shall
be furnished by the permit holder.

Section 406.4.2 is hereby deleted in its entirety and without substitution.
Section 501.8 is hereby amended by the deletion of items 8 and 10 hereof.
Section 621 is hereby deleted in its entirety and without substitution.



D)

E)

Amendments to the International Mechanical Code: The following amendments ae hereby
adopted to the international Mechanical Code.

D

2

Chapter 1 is hereby deleted: the administration requirements for the International
Mechanical Code are in chapter 15.0.20 of the Town of Columbine Valley Municipal

Code.

Section 902 is hereby amended by the addition of a new paragraph 902.1.1 which shall
read:

902.1.1 Decorative appliance in solid fuel masonry: Notwithstanding anything
contained in this code to the contrary, any new or remodeled solid fuel fireplace

shall be one of the following:
1) A gas appliance
2) An electric device or

3) A fireplace or fireplace insert that meet the most stringent emission standards for
wood stoves established by the Air Pollution Control Division Quality Control
Commission of the Department of Health of the State of Colorado, or any other
clean device that is approve by said commission.

Any person who installs or constructs any fireplace insert or fireplace shall
provide evidence of a certificate issued by the Air Pollution Control Division of
the Department of Health of the State of Colorado, and in the case of site-build
fireplace shall demonstrate compliance with the certificate.

Amendments to the International Property Maintenance Code: The following amendments
are hereby adopted to the International Property Maintenance Code.

2)

1) Subsection 107.1 is hereby amended by the following paragraph to be the last
paragraph thereof:

Statements advising that if any owner refuses or neglects to comply with an order issued
by the building official, and where conditions exist which make a building or premises
unsafe, dangerous, or hazardous, that the building official 1. Will order the building
vacated and posted to prevent further occupancy until the work is completed or/and (ii)
may proceed to cause the work to be done and charge the costs thereof against the
property or its owners. The giving of the notice provided for hereinabove shall not be a
condition precedent to the city’s right to prosecute, in its municipal court, any person for
any alleged violation of any of the terms of this code.

Section 107 shall be amended by the addition of subsection 107.7 to read:

Section 107.7 Extension of time to perform work: Upon receipt of an application form
the person required to conform to the order and by agreement of such person to comply
with the order if allowed additional time, the code official may grant an extension of
time, not to exceed an additional 120 days, within which to complete said repair,

7



3)

4)

rehabilitation or demolition, if the code official determines that such an extension of time
will not create or perpetuate a situation imminently dangerous to life or property. The
code official’s authority to extend time is limited to the physical repair, rehabilitation or
demolition to premises and will not in any way affect or extend the time to appeal the

notice an order.

Section 202 is hereby amended by the addition of the follbwing definition.

- NUISANCE: The Following shall be defined as nuisances as applied to the 2021
International Property Maintenance Code:

1) Any public nuisance known at common law or in equity jurisprudence,

2) Any attractive nuisance that may prove detrimental to children
whether in a building, on the premises of a building or on an
unoccupied lot. This includes any abandoned wells, shafts, basements
structurally unsound fences or structures; or any lumber, trash, debris,
or vegetation that may prove a hazard for inquisitive minors.

3) Whatever is dangerous to human life or is detrimental to health, as
determined by the Building Official.

4) Overcrowding a room with occupants.

5) Insufficient ventilation or illumination,

6) Inadequate or unsanitary sewage or plumbing facilities.

7) Uncleanliness, as determined by the Building Official.

8) Whatever renders air, food or drink unwholesome or detrimental to
health of human beings as determined by the Building Official.

Section 302.4 is hereby repealed and reenact to read:

302.4 Weeds: it is the duty of every person owning vacant or improved property,
including easements and drainage-ways within the Town, to keep cut within ten inches of
the ground all weeds and to keep said property free from brush and rubbish of all kinds,
However, this section shall not apply to vegetable gardens, flower gardens, and shrubbery
plots. Wheat, barley, oats, rye, and similar agricultural commodities also shall be
exempted from. Upon failure of the owner or agent having charge of a property to cut
destroy weeds after service of a notice of violation, they shall be subject to prosecution in
accordance with Section 106.33 and as prescribed by the Town of Columbine Valley.
Upon failure to comply with the notice of violation, any duly authorized employee of the
Town or contractor hired by the Town shall be authorized to enter upon the property in
violation and cut and destroy the weeds growing thereon, and the costs of such removal
and an administrative fee of forty percent of the cost, shall be paid by the owner of agent

responsible for the property.



F)

G)

I

Amendments to the International Energy Conservation Code: The following amendments
are hereby adopted to the International Energy Conservation Code.

(Reserved)

Amendments to the International Fire Code: The following amendments are hereby adopted
to the international Fire Code.

(Reserved)

Amendments to the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code: The following
amendments are hereby adopted to the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code.

1)

2)

3)

Section 305.1 is hereby amended to read:

Section 305.1 General. The provisions of this section shall apply to the design of barriers
for restricting entry into area’s having pools and spas. Spas and hot tubs equipped with a
lockable cover complying with ASTM F1346 shall not be required to comply with
sections 3.5.2 Through 305.7.

Section 305.1 is hereby amended by a new section 305.1.1.2 which shall read:

Section 305.1.1.2 the maximum size of spas and hot tubs; spas and hot tubs shall not be
greater than 150 cubic feet. Maximum length is 10 feet, maximum width is 5 feet and
maximum depth is 3 feet. Spas and hot tubs larger than the given dimensions shall be

considered swimming pools.
Section 305.2.1 is hereby amended to read:

The top of the barrier shall not be less than 60” above grade were measured on the side of
the barrier that face away from the pool or spa. Such height shall exit around the entire
perimeter of the barrier and for 3 feet measured horizontally from the outside of the

required barrier.

Amendments to the American National Standard Institute / American Society of
Mechanical Engineers (ASME) A17.1 2007 Safety code for Elevators and Escalators;
(ASME) A17.3 2005 and (ASME) A18.1 2005 shall be as follows:

(Reserved)

Section 3: Section 15.08.030 is hereby amended to read:



MISCELLANEOUS PROJECT VALUATION SCHEDULE

PATIO COVER $65 PER SQUARE FOOT
DECK $65 PER SQUARE FOOT
GARAGE $65 PER SQUARE FOOT

Section 4:  Severability.

If any part, section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase of this ordinance is for any
reason held to be invalid, such invalidity shall not affect the validity of the remaining
sections of this ordinance. The city council hereby declares that it would have passed this
ordinance, including each part, section, subsection, sentence, clause or sentences, clauses

or phrases may be declared invalid.

Section 5:  Repealer.

All ordinance or resolutions, or parts thereof, in conflict with this ordinance are hereby
repealed, provided that this repealer, shall not repeal the repealer, or clauses of such
ordinance nor revive any ordinance thereby.

10



PUBLIC HEARING on the ordinance to take place on the day of , 2022
in the offices of the Town of Columbine Valley, 2 Middlefield Road, Columbine Valley,

Colorado, at the hour of 6:00 p.m., or as soon thereafter as it may be heard.

Introduced as Trustee Bill No. 5, series of 2022 at a regular meeting of the Board of Trustees of
the Town of Columbine Valley, Colorado, on the 18% day of October 2022, passed by a vote of ___ for
and ___ against, on first reading; passed on second reading, as Trustee Bill No. 5, 2022, at a regular

meeting of the Board of Trustees by a vote of ___ for and__ against on the 15 day of November

2022.

2022, and ordered published in the Littleton Independent on the __dayof

Roy Palmer, Mayor

TRUSTEE BILL NO. 5
SERIES OF 2022

ATTEST:

J.D. McCrumb,
Clerk of the Town of Columbine Valley

11



Date:

Title:
Presented By:
Prepared By:

Background:

Attachments:

Recommended Motion:

J;(Sgloilmbine\"allc\_'

Colorado ~

Regquest for Board of Trustee Action

November 15, 2022

Resolution #6, 2022 - FAMLI Opt-Out
Kate Eckel, Town HR Consultant
Kate Eckel, Town HR Consultant

Colorado voters approved Proposition 118 in November of 2020,
approving the creation of a paid family and medical leave insurance
(FAMLI) program administered by the State of Colorado Division of
Family and Medical Leave Insurance (the “Division”). Details of this
program are attached. Local governments may elect to decline all
participation or elect to decline employer participation via city
council vote. Declining employer participation allows a local
government agency to decline to pay the employer share of the
premium, while still supporting employees who want to participate
by voluntary deducting and remitting the employee share of the
premium (0.45% of wages) and corresponding wage data to the
Division every quarter. If the Town opts out of the FAMLI program,
they may choose to opt back in at the beginning of their annual
budget cycle. If the Town opts in, they must remain in the program
for at least three (3) fiscal years. In order to opt out, the Town must
follow a prescribed process including: - Notification in the same
manner as any other business before the governing body -
Taking/hearing public comment prior to the vote pursuant to the
procedural rules of the governing body - Employees must be notified
in writing prior to the vote and provided with information on the
process and opportunity to submit comments As a result, a public
hearing is scheduled tonight along with consideration of this
resolution

Resolution #6, 2022
Staff memo re FAMLI
FAMLI information packet

“I move to approve Resolution #6-2022 authorizing the Town to opt
out of participating in the Colorado Family and Medical Leave
Insurance program.”



RESOLUTION NO. 6
SERIES OF 2022

A RESOLUTION CONCERNING
DECLINING FULL PARTICIPATION IN THE COLORADO STATE-RUN
PAID FAMILY AND MEDICAL LEAVE INSURANCE PROGRAM FOR THE TOWN
OF COLUMBINE VALLEY

WHEREAS, in November of 2020, Colorado voters approved Proposition 118, which
established a State-run Paid Family and Medical Leave Insurance program ("FAMLI"); and

WHEREAS, the State's purpose for creating the program is to ensure all Colorado
workers have access to paid leave in order to take care of themselves or their family during life
circumstances that pull them away from their jobs; and

WHEREAS, under FAMLI, employers and their employees are both responsible for
funding the program and may split the cost 50/50; the premiums are set at 0.9% of the
employee's wage, with 0.45% paid by the employer and 0.45% paid by the employee; and

WHEREAS, the premiums required for FAMLI will be collected starting January 1,
2023,and benefits will begin January 1, 2024; and

WHEREAS, as a local government, the Town of Columbine Valley (the "Town") may
decline to participate in FAMLI following a public hearing and vote of its governing body; and

WHEREAS, should the Town decline to participate in FAMLI, Town employees will still
have the option to participate in the program and remit premiums to the State; and

WHEREAS, the Town already offers short-term disability insurance coverage through its
cafeteria plan for its full time employees that exceeds the requirements of the state-run program;
and

WHEREAS, at tonight's meeting, the Board of Trustees will hold a public hearing on the
decision of whether to participate in FAMLI; and

WHEREAS, Town staff recommends that the Board of Trustees (i) decline participation
in FAMLI, and (ii) decline to withhold and remit the employee share of premiums for the Town
employees who elect FAMLI coverage.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE TOWN
OF COLUMBINE VALLEY, COLORADO as follows:

Section 1. Public Hearing. The Board of Trustees finds and determines that, with regard
to the public hearing on the decision of whether to decline participation in FAMLI, notice was
given and the hearing was conducted in accordance with the regulations adopted by Colorado
Department of Labor and Employment and codified at 7 CCR 1107-2.



Section 2. FAMLI Participation. The Board of Trustees, acting by and on behalf of the
Town hereby declines full participation in FAMLI, including declining to collect and remit
employee premiums to the Slate for those employees who elect coverage under FAMLI. The
Board of Trustees further directs Town staff to bring the matter of revisiting the decision to
decline participation in FAMLI before a future Board of Trustees by no more than eight years
from tonight's
vote.

Section 2. Should any one or more sections or provisions of this Resolution be judicially
determined invalid or unenforceable, such judgment shall not affect, impair, or invalidate the
remaining provisions of this Resolution, the intention being that the various sections and
provisions are severable.

Section 3. Any and all Resolutions or parts thereof in conflict or inconsistent herewith
are, to the extent of such conflict or inconsistency, hereby repealed; provided however, that the
repeal of any such Resolution or part thereof shall not revive any other section or part of any
Resolution heretofore repealed or superseded.

PASSED, ADOPTED AND APPROVED by a vote of for and against this
day of November, 2022.

JD McCrumb, Clerk Roy Palmer, Mayor



October 12, 2022

To:; Columbine Valley Board of Trustees
From: Kate Eckel, HR Consultant
RE: State of Colorado FAMLI Leave for Local Governments

Information on Colorado Family and Medical Leave Insurance Program (FAMLI)

What is FAMLI?

FAMLI is a state funded paid leave program. It covers up to 12 weeks (additional 4 weeks for
pregnancy/birth of a child) of partial wage replacement. This fund was implemented to financially assist
and protect employees who are caring for themselves or a family member with a serious health
condition, birth/adoption/foster care of a child, care of military member, and victims of domestic
violence. FAMLI will start providing benefits to employees beginning January 1, 2024. Employees may
receive up to 90% of their pay through the FAMLI benefit.

Beginning January 1, 2023, Colorado Employers with over nine (9) employees will begin collecting
premiums of 0.9% of their employees’ wages and submitting to the State of Colorado Fund for Paid

Family and Medical Leave,

Local Governments

With this said, Local Governments may “opt out” of this program. Local Governments have the
following three options.

1. Participate in FAMLI. The premiums are set to 0.9% of employees’ wage with 0.45% paid by the

employer, CV, and 0.45% paid by the employee
2. Decline all participation: Local government would vote no to participation. Employees would still

have the option to participate in FAMLI and would register as an independent contractor
3. Decline Employer Participation: Employees have the option of participating at 0.45% that CV
would collect and submit payment to the government FAMLI plan.

While opting out is an option, both City of Littleton and City of Aurora are offering paid Short Term
Disability policies for their employees instead of the State of Colorado FAMLI fund. These policies
typically cover 12 weeks of partial salary replacement. Other local governments who have decided to
“opt out” include Lyons, Kremmling, Milliken, Meeker, Eaton, Canon City, Creede, New Castle, Bennett,
Bayfield, Fountain and Johnstown. The City of Windsor has decided on the employee only option,

Columbine Valley also offers a Short-Term Benefit policy as an ancillary benefit that can be paid for
under the Town’s cafeteria plan. Unfortunately, all of the carriers declined to underwrite short term



Important details:

All employers must register their intentions with the State of Colorado by the end of the year.

The benefits of participating in the state funded plan or having an equivalent plan is that it will
be easier to recruit quality talent with a benefit like this in place. Employees who experience
significant illness/birth of child or the illness of a child/spouse/parent will be able to take time
off without worrying if they have funds to pay their bills. Studies have shown that employers
who offer similar benefits experience greater employee loyalty and lower turnover.

Staff Recommendation: Per the Town Administrator, it is recommended that the Town “Opt Out”
of the State Funded plan and remind all employees of their ability to sign up for the Short-Term
Disability benefit under the Town’s Cafeteria plan.



i
|

coloravo | | FAMILY AND MEDICAL

Family and Medical Leave

e | LEAVE INSURANCE
Department of Labor and Emplaymnent | i ,
| {30 :

GOVERNMENT
GUIDE

! FAMLI i



£

53JUa13)3Yy

S5M1qy 40 3]NDSSY. |DNXas: «
UoI11pUO) Y3 1D3H SNoL1aS «
SAD3];|DIIPALIPLD AJIWDS PIDY <
JUSLLILIBADD |D30T] <

Apog Suttiiapaon «

ST\L £

Jaquiapy Ajiupy; «

TV <«

aafojdwg «

1DNPIALDUL D13AOY «

LWV ULOUM s,.oLpm -

81pjdwa| uo13naifizoN
23A0)dwiz 3)gpziwioysny «
siafojdwz 5u13pdioN3any
11y tof 433504
Lo0Y ¥Dalg pJDpUD]S: <
3N0 3d0oyM sIUaWLIZA0D
1D207'10{ 133504 Wooy ypaig
Sjoo]

SPIND JUSILISA0D |B30T [TWV4

13pisun) 03 sajeq Aoy
sauljauwn ) mc_uo>
saafojdw3 nof AfijoN =
LoISIALG | IWYd a3 Af13oN <
WaysAs Wy ay3
LIIM 1335153y «
FTWYH ut ...._oaun_u_tun.
1nojf auwialaq «
IIWV4 10} aiedaly 03 __soz
uo3ndnniog
YIA0TdW3I aut)aaq «
Uuol3nd1313104 17y -aut)3aq «
uol3pdion3ind 1)n4
SJUBLLUIIADE)
18307710} uonjedioyieg
£P2PUD] ITTWY sI MOH
¢5133JOM JLaUaq WY S0P MOH
uoneziuesio
Aw3usuag Wy saop Moy

“91 WY staeym

SJUU0H

3PINY JUBWUISA0Y |B20T [TWVH m



“uojeziuesio

97 104 3539 s| Jeyy Aem sarajeym uL
SPaau xom Sulnsal ayy )y Ajuelodway
01 Wopa3yy ayl sjuaWIaAeg Jeao]
3pLaoad ued sulaes fouesea ay3 ‘caead)
ITWV4 Uo 3no s1 safojdws ayy SNUM
ANy suswwaA0Y 18307 sapiAcId
weJssold riwy4 3y tajqixa)4 s,

"saakoldwa mau uteny pue any

031 pasu ayy Bunpai Aq sutes aplaosd
uIn3 ut N yoiym vonedpied asioy
410qe] 35009 pue ‘A1anpoad ‘quaey
Ule3al spualiwanog Jedoq djay Jm
uonoeysies qol ysiy - swom puo usuoy
J0f 13433 s13853my) S2I0U0M 2] Ut Ulewsas
Pue sqof 11ayy 03 wmai o3 A1y asow
aIe aAea] pled 03 ssa008 ym saafo)dwa
Pue “rtoz moy aana7 Ajumy ping s,opsofyion)
3lelow 3afojdwa 3s00q ues 943 Ajiwey
pled o3 ssaooe 1By} smoys youeasay
:uondejsnes Jayiopm saseasu) 3

*Spaau Awey Aeyw ssalppe pue
‘aouajolA Jenxas jo 21358L0p 03 puodsau

‘PlIiYD MaU B ym puoq ‘ssuadiswa
183tpaw Ajwey Jo jeuossad Joj ared

031 Jjo awn pled apureid Ajqepioye oy
$198pNq Ja3ysyy ym s13fojdwa sygnd
a)jews smoe rwy4 39xo0d Jo 3no
BAe3) 1ed1paw pue Ajuwey pred apiaosd
©3 31qe 3q S s1afo)dwa sasie) UM
"93e3s 3y uy s1afojdwa ajeaud FEID ]
Yim Juale) doy oy s3adwos 1a112q 0
OpeI0]0) ss0.100 s1akojdwa Juswwanos
1830] 31qeua )M Wy ‘eBevioys

40qe) Suo8-uo Juaund ayy Yim
@3loy) jo sahojdwy ue swodag noj

‘sBulAes

1500 571103l 03 B)qe 3q Aew aAea) Ajwey
pied 1330 Jo area) Ajjwaew aplaoud
031 13%20d-J0-3n0 Buifed AjuaLind aze
ey suafojdwy juem Siaylom opeiojo)
ey Jyauaq e pue wessoid JAIDBY40
3502 B st ITWy4 :3A1339))3 3507 5,31

"wessoud asueinsuj
wawhojdwaun ayy se 3NPayds awes ayy
Uo pue Aem awes ayy up yiom Kjagie) nm

3 Urstunwipe 03 Asea st [Twyy Ase3 5,3

cuoneziueb.io Awx

Igoudq I'TINVA
S90pP MO

ﬂ SPLID JUSUILIBACS [e207 WA

=

*weisold [wyd auy Aq papiaoidiasoy; UBl) s1yalag 1ajeals

10 1enba apiao.dijely sueydazeaud Buifinenb a0 oym s1afodwa 101aas ayeanid
PUB SJUSLILISAOD) 18207 10} 5U0I1d83%3 9110 a.p 913U 1s1a%J0M 0 SIYauaqng
Aed )1mM 3843 Puny 3y 03 swn 1Wa1d aInqLiuod )M s99£0]dwa pue siafojduia ylog

‘swelsoud uni-ajeys JBjiwis ssedio) anui3uod sajess alolw
PUe ‘weiSoid 9Aea) Jedipaw Ajlwe} piede 21B1|10B) 03 31B1S ULl 8y s OpEI0)0)

*Joddns 1aj0A
%LS YHM 0Z0Z J3qWDAON UL SI1570A Ope10]0)) Aq paroidde sem aagenu ayy

*suoljeandwon y3qp)ila 10 AueuSaid 22uaLiadxaloym asoLy doj

SY39M 9] 03 .dn'pue pasu uo uipuadsp aAeaj pied 40'$43amM Z|'0) dn axe) 03 3|qe aq
LM SIS310M 81q18112 350W ‘suaddey aJ1) uaym salo P=A0] 11843 Jo saA|aswaL) Jo a1ed
ULeY pue ¥2ayoAed e BUIUIES U3amiaq 95002 03 SABY 7, UOM pue SS2UBISWINDILD
ule3192 SULINp 9AR3) pied 03 ssadoe SARU S1ayJOM OPEI010T IS0 ainsua NI [T

“weisoid ([wy4) 93LRINSL| 5ARST |BD|pay pue Alwey 5,0PBI010D.SL WV

¢ITINYA STieym

SPIND3UaLILIBA0Y |20 WYL




-y &

'%C°) e paddes fjuoiness s wnweaid ayy
Inq ‘ejnuwio} Kq pajsnipe 29 Aew a3e) wnwaid wWvd 8yl ‘szoz w 8uluuiSag

"Iyauaq sakojdwa pappe ue se wnwaid 943 jo areys saafojdwa au jo e Jo
awos Aed 03 uondo aip 9ARY SjUBLIWIBAOY 1207 ‘s1akojdwa Jojoas ajeaud ayy isnr

‘safem saakoidwa say)

40 %5H°0 9Y3 Jwaa Isnf )M pue wnuwaid sy Jjo aseys s Jakojdwa ayy synquyuos
01 9ARY Jou M ‘saafo)dwsa Jamay 1o SUIL LM SJUSLILLIBAOS) 1207 “safiem nay)
40 %640 Aed osje 1m JaKojdwa JuawLIBA0S 1820 11313 pue ‘safiem 11au3 Jo 50
ANQLIUD 1M saafolduig “saakojdws yym wniwaid ayy Jo 3503 ayy Jds m
wesdoud auyy up ayedidpied op 950042 oym saakoydwa +0) yym SJUBLLILLIADY) 1207

"%6°0 5! 4207 ydnouyy ayes winywaad sy

*puny
2 0jut pred st jeyy wnuwaid e ysnouyy papuny weisoid JdueINsul |e130S B St ITWY4

cpdpuny
I'TINV ST Moy

SPINY JUSWILISACY [2207 [TWY

210z *23mpsy

Aapunasoddo spwousrz) *pa 102Dl aney Ly
210J3q Jom 03 Suluman Aq SIAIRsWA
aInfutas Jo asdejas pinos SUonIpuod
W38y JluoIyd Yawm s1axom Jeyy Koy
S53] 3t saxewW pue saunfur qof-ayy-uo
40 5]U3pIOUL SDNPAL BAR3) JEIIPaW pue
Awrey pred smoys Jaynny yoseasay

(Pu “main aigoynba) ~y0ys

JlWouod3 0] pea) pjnol Jeyy sawyy
8uunp ssa.35 pue Aundasuy leueuy
$32npaJ pue ‘panlut Jo )1 uaym sauo
P3AD] pue ssA1asWaLy} 10) a1ed suayiom
$19] 2Ae3) BuiaiBale pue jealpal prey

(1zoz vamis-urssoy) “\yyeay winyedysod
1ewatew edwy Ajaanisod ues siayey

10} 3Aea] pred pasealsul 0] ssadoe
Pue Aliqxey adejdiiom alow Suuayg

(ez8-06¢ 53504 *£107 *Nog B 20p05

weuaer “pooypiyd Apea puokaq Sunse)
US.pJiy3 Joj s3yauaq yyjeay juesyiusdis
sey osje 3nq ‘suated mau Joj sawodno
Ymeay uo 3oedwy aaysod e sey Ajuo
10U 2Ae3) ejuared pred smoys yoleasay

(P tamasn aiqeanbs) “fLIND3s D1WoU0I3

s Aturey e sasueyua pue ‘yneay jewsjew
saaosdwy “Jualdolarsp Aueay s Anwey
© 03 S3InqLIued piiyd 133504 1o pardope
Apuadal ‘wogmau e Joj ated 03 yjo
awyp pred arey syuared mau Suunsug

ESINIOM JIJoURq
I'TINVA so0op moHy

SPIND JUSWLISACH 12307 [TWYS

e

&




6

uiod fue e up1do uea saafoidws
258l] :pouiad Juaiijolus ou sy =IETTE

19]qB3352.10'S[ SAPS) Uaym Ajuo
ULSUdoiploAe’ 03 s1paA 331U 115e9] 1B
10}:33edi131318d 03 3105 03 paiinbai
S1E SIBNpLAIDUL 8saLy3 fweiSod

3t} 03ul Bundo. A)uejunioa uodn

‘WasAs ay3 ojur winiwaid

Aj1231enb e SunIwa) PUB BIED 3feMm
d1343 5uiniodal Jias 10} 31qisuodsal
2Gi11M pUR3UN0DR MO/ IaYY
231B2131]11Mm 33£0)dWa jenpiaipul =l

‘WasAs jqwy4 auluo BU) BlA
PInomiuvosiad pafordwa jias'e IOy
PUBLI3ULIBWI LIRS B3 UL'afRIaA0D
3122]2-113S pinom saafoldiwia asay]

‘wniwWaldiaafoldwa auy jo %CH0
au3'Aed 0} paJinbai aq Ajuo PInom

sdafo)dwa asay] ‘sjusiufed winuaad
UMOIIaL) J1Wal pUe saSem umo S[ETT
110da1 03 paau')jm ajedidiyied oy
850042 AjL1R3UN|oA oym saaf0)dwig

‘850042 05 A1)

JL8ultedidied jo uondo auy3 aaey
11135 ‘WeiSoid aU3 Jo 300 3do 0] 310A
ABU} 53UaLLILISA0S 1RI0T 0 saa/0]dw3

"32e|d ut ueid saea) pied juajesinba
UB 9ABY 0 pa.inbal jou aJe weifo.d
[TWyd a4y ut uonedioied surap
03 9304 OYM sJUaLILIDAOY) (20T

:uoljedidiyied

SUl125p 03 2104 J1aU3 40 UOISIALG [TWvA
843 AJ110U 03 Wajshs WYL 3L ut
12351831 35N UaLLUIZA0D 1BI0T U |

‘uojediyied
11B 8U1123p 03/330A 3snw Apoq
SULLIBAOS 5,JUSWUIBA0G (B30T 3y |

ﬂoﬁm&u._rmn .qﬂw UL

3PIND JUALILISA0D 20T [TWY4

*(saBem

40 %564°0) wnwaud sy Jo areys
539Ko1dwa sy Y Suoje sayenb
B 33U0 uoistAIg U 03 elep afem
Jjwiqns 03 paau M JUIWWISADY)
18307 343 *soLieuads yyoq u)

"S9BEM JO %Gp"0 JO JRj0] B Joj

3leys saafodws ayy jo g0 ayy
Buniwal oy ayqisuodsay 14s st 3ng

‘areys 1akojdwsa ay; Jo %S0 a3 Aed

03 9ABY J0U 530D JUBWILISA0Y Je207]
M « ssakojdws gy ueyy BmMay «

"S35EM JO %6°0 J0 |230) © 10j UOISIALG
W4 313 03 aueys ,saakojdwa ayy
40 %SH°0 243 3uwB1 Im pue , ‘safem
30 %S+°0 ‘wniwaud ayy jo aseys
Jofoldws ayy Aed JusWW3ADY
18207 a3 « ssafojdws siow Jo 0F «

uﬁﬂﬁ&gﬂu 18307 30 9ZIS

*pauinbau s1 3304 ou ‘wesSod ay

ut ajedpised o3 sueid JUSWILIBA0Y 18307 ay) §| wakojdwss 103235 eaud jeadsy Aue
9411 Junodde ue 33eald pue waysAs ITWvd 3y3 w1 Ja3s18aa 3snw JUBWILIBA0Y Jed0T ay |

| FINYZ ur Sedronaeq |

"uoedidilied YIAOTIWE Suldaq «

uonedwiyted Ty aulPreg «

19hojdwa Jojoas ajeaud Jtayyo
Aue a1 3snf [TWv4 Ul s3edion ey

«

:ued sakoldwa Juawwaaos 1e20]

V ‘Wwesdord uni-ayeys ayy uy uonedonied

41243 Sutpsesal suondo aauyy 2ARY
SluaunuBA0g 18207 “wesSod ayy Jo Jno
1do 03 A31)1qe 3y sJUBLILIBAOY [ed0]
0peijo) aAS 0] uapyum sem ajnjeys
I'Wvd 33 ‘ssakojdws ajeaud asyun

SUBWUIDIAON)
1€J0T 10] S)on]
uonedronied

SPIND JuSWLIBA0Y [2207 [TV B



=y T
Lt AT
T~

“UOISIALG [WvH

3yl 03 J=31enb e @3u0 piep afem

8UIpuodsa110 pue! (safem 10 %6H°0)

wniwa.d ayy 4o aleys s,23401dwa

91 Jilial pur suolanpapiolked

Aejun)oa s;aafojdwa ue Chiza ] BIETE

"welsold [wyd 3y3 Jojuauaq PINOMIUBLWILIIACY 20T 313 ang
uol333301d qof au3 Aq pa1arod agjou ‘wnituaid’1af0)diws ayy Suiked
114 30 53d0 JUBLILISAGD 18207 U (ETH 10:3n013do.0} 810A 1135 35N Apog
4334e Ul 3do 03350040 oym saakojdwg - BUIUIIA0F S, JUSWUIZADD) 18307 3y L

*1311enb "[Wvd ut exeddiied A enpiatpul

A19A3 B3Ep 25EM pUB sWwnuuz1d 03 3UBM OUM s3ako)duia s 3sisse

UMO 1153 BUII3IWSL Jo UapInq 11135 309 Wniwsid ayy jo aeys
2AlIR13SIUILIDe B3 Jnoge A1lom o3 J1afodws auy Aed 03 A1iqisucdsa
BULABL IN0UIIM LRIS01d 3} 0juyado 531 aU199pI0] JUAlULISACD
AlUeIUn|oA 03 saafo)dwa SMOJB SIY] < 18207 B smo]e uopdo siy]:

uonedionied safojdwyg suro

@ aping JU3WUISA0 12207 Iwv4 SpLng juslluIason 12207 1wy .Ow




"AO3 0pel0]0d

“Hwey je s\qejieae ase pue uole|nsal
SIy3 ut uoyyeuLioyu; pasinbal ayy
BuiuteIuoa saa1j0u d1qeziwo)sno pue
s1a1s0d pajeasd sey uoysialg ay |

"82I0PIOM SJUBWIUIBADY JED0

9 Jo Juddad ay 3583 e Aq uasjods
a8en3ue) 3s1y ay) Sunuasaiday
aBensue) Aue uy pue ysnsuz ut aq
NiM paiinbai saysod pue acijou ayy

"utioneld paseq-dde Jo paseq

-Gam au ui Bupsod snonojdsuod e
Ysnouyy Jo uonesuNWwWoD Jluondae
BlA 3U3s aq 1)m uoneaynou ‘uuioyyed
paseq-dde Jo paseq-gom e ySnonypy
3HOM suuopiad Jo siomasjay
safo1dwa ue o ‘adeidyiom jeaishyd

UOISIIBP S juswruIsaon 18207 anoA jo ssafojduts ok Amopn

Ua3onb b 3300 VoA Jt 8230@!3?&35&9&53&&
1o Wwajsfs aujjuo aums ay aq N sty -ssasoud sy oSy
SADY 1M 34 AR 1PIYM Suunp “1ako)hua 2joaud

220z Jo 1104 3y3 Supnp uogonsiSas sof aiqoyoaz 3 oy

€207 ‘) Adenuer

Aq — pajrews 10 paxtew;sod jou —
wayshs ay3 uym P3Al9294 3q 3snw
UoneayRou sy *)jam se uonesynou
343 Ul papn)du aq 3snw uopewoyu)
SIY) ‘wesdord vy ay3 up ayediyed
Aenpapur 0y 250042 oym saakojdwa
S31 1sisse 0} spusjug Ing “‘Ino 1do o0y

P310A sey JuswuIaA0S 1exo)ayy )

€ Ulejuiew Jou s30p Juawiuarog
18307 343 a1aym sased u) ‘pakojdwa
ale saakojdwa asaym Juawystgelsa
Yaea ul 3oeyd ajqissanoe pue
snondidsuod e uy uoneuojuL
Pauinbay ayy Sulrejuos asou ay
Aeydsip 3snw SIUBLILIBAOY) |20

“oogpurey e ut paysignd

s3phod 3akojdwa to ‘siewa aq Aew
$30130U JenplAalpur ualIuMm 3y (539
$320u Joge) Jayyo yyim) paysod

94 Isnui auo pue ‘ajoa uoljeurdap

e Jaye ssafojdws oy Anenpraipug
P2J3AY2p 8q 3snw adp0u auQ *(7
~£011 42D /) wesSoud w4 a3 o
no 3do 03 Surjoa uaym Aq apiqe 3snw
SIUSWLLIBAOY) 12207 Jey sjuawalinbas
uonesynou aafoldwsa omy ase atay)

*Z20T 33e) ut shoydap 1
93u0 WasAs sadas sakordwa Twv4
a3 ojut papeojdn aq ysnw juawnoop
SILL "330A 313 Jo Ynsal ay) pue uaye)

SeM 310A a3 a1ep au ajedipul Jsnw
Pue peasna) uo uolstag wyy ayy
Aynou 3snw wessoad Iwv4 ays jo
Ino-1do 03 53304 Jeu JU3WWISACY
18207 & ‘uojensial Jayyy

UOISIO3P s juswuraaon JesoT ok jo ITWVI Ao =

SPINg JUSWLLISACSH JB207 WYL

<«

W31 03 35N Jm s1380)duwsa Sugodppand
SUaURLI2A0Y 0307 d)3Y 03 2)qD)DAD ffo3s Yi0ddns
2J0/3q 42151831 0} payiAul 3q )M SJuLNLIADS 10307
Papadxa s wayshs swniwasd Jakordwa aufjuo s, vy

L4

*ZZ0T Suunp awpAue no ydo 03 910A
IBRIUL 1133 ploy ued sjuawuiaAog jes07

cI'TIWVI 30 1no ydo o} 9304 24 wed waym

1£20Z: p7Aienue Aq WaysAs

843Ul BULI3sIBal 191 e uois3p iayy

JO.UOISIALG 93 AJ3ousnw weiSoud

ITWyd 8yy-ut.uoljedioyied auiap
03,3304 U3IUM' SIUBILIDA0D B30T/ «¢

“I7Wv4 uL:a3edidired 0y 10u

500U 1BL3:a50Y3 Sulpn]oul lWajsAs
SULUOS; FTWVA Ultm 18351824'35nLW
13f01duwia qusiuIanose0T A19A3

(2202 v0) WweIsAs ITWY3 oups warm 1035169y L

9104 84y SulpJeSaiiuofieiwioul UILme
930A:3L3:03 J10Lid BUR LIM UL pa L 30U
29/0s)2 3snui:saako1dwa; pue Apoq
BUILIBA0E 3U3;31043q ssaulsngJaylo
19104 : Aue:se JauueLy SWES|3UIiuLUaAls
241730.938p 3y W0} 5183k JY5La 29:3sNUWI310A 3Y):}073310U 211Ny
104,pO0B.s1"3U1)33p .03 UoIsI33p ayy

:s1eafqysia puofagino-1do oy
SNUBUOS 03 s3YsIM 1)1 a0A JaU 0UR
P1OU3SNLU JUBLWIUIIADD) 18207 3L -

*aledidiyied

031pa.inbaJisi 8304 0N *a3edio11 1Rd
03,9U1133pi0},930A 35N Apoq :
BUIUIDACETS, JUSLILLIBA0D ! 1BIOT.3Y | /i ¢

*85920.1d 211qnd

2. usnaiy Auownsa PUB:5JUSWILLIOD
wgnsioy. Ayunyioddo pue:ssaso.d
ITWVI ur uonjedronzed w.wﬂuﬁ.ﬁm:ou. 1e20T Anof suruiayaqg T

[1Wv4 10} aJeda.d. 0y axe3p)nays sjuswusaan ]B307;5d335 5ULMO) 04 31) a8 CEET)

_ I'TWVYA 103

axedaid o) Mol

aping u.cmE.cgmyou._muo.._ 1IWYS




“HOHEULIOJUL 1BUORIPPR 10J Z-/01 | 43D / 03 Jaja1 35R3)4

‘UoREDIUNWIWOISILY pue sjuatuAediaso PLOAR 01 sWIa35AS 95UBYD URD am
0s ‘a3130u sAeP 6 JO wnwiuiw e saiinbal upisiaig IIWy4i8u) ‘poLiad teak-aa1uy
S41Jo pus auy e weifoid ai) LUOJJ MBIDUIIM 0] SSUSIM JUBLLLLISACS 1e30] B}

‘winuiiuiuseqe sieak qysia K1aas P1istA3.1/9q135nW Uois|Dap auyy ‘wiesSold
IWvdiauy utsledionied ANy 03 2U1139p.03 $85002 JUILLILIIACS |20 =1l

's1Eaf 83143 Jo wnwiuw e Joy swiniwaud fed “Ugi533n jo

taakoiduwa Lno
03'98.18e pue- Weifoid/aLy ut UIBUWS.3sNW ‘58R13A0D 33313-1195 aym S]eDplAlpU| skeq mm Ec.““,__, e,

ne Bupdo Ajtnopasd saye up3da

uopedpiied jo.giius) pasmbay

Aed 0393188 pue weiSoid S UL LlewaJ 3snwiuoyedioiyred SU133p 03 BUI0A SIBSA €
Aisnotasid uayje vy ul'a1edibiued Ajny o3 85002 UILUM SJUSWILLISAOS 12207

Bunop!

4 AL = |Hsaunaur, &
's4ea4 39,y Jownwiuiw e o) swnjwaid a0 2 - 0 - S

'98BI3A0D 103)35-4)a5
PUB S1USLUSBUBIIR 9)EW 03 Stul] S15X10M SBALB'SIY | *BA1}2)9 51 s]yausq wy4 01

$S323e SUIP1REal s5UBLD AUp 210439 53340]dWWa 03 UIAIS aq 3snLu 2d1j0usAep ggL « R . -W | : . ,nnow."?sq
“EiEad g iand 57a) | . SoBqaunduy,

"230A BUIPIDSP 3 Ja3je sAep g LM UohediDiIed A e doeti HOISIALD A30N

B ajopA st
ITWY4 U0 uoisiaap 11ay3 Jo s39/0]dWa AJ130U 35N SIUALILIDACE 18307 « #2300 51 BuAY FEOLIRN 3 3.LOM R11aU9q 527207 Ul idce 30u I s

Sieap g ‘safury Bupnaauiio; £ue jo saakoidiia AT
—— - " i Sijauag ul aduey) o3 Jolid sheq gg|
P J

Sl 8pinojualluIzA0S |e30T] RN A SPLND JUSWWISA0D 12207 [Ty E




$7U"D (11) €05-£7€1-85 wt jreyap

Ul P3qUIsap se puoq jeuostad Juesyiudis
© 9AeY ASY) WOYM ILM 3UO3WOS 1o
‘Bunaqis ‘puydpueis ‘quaredpuess
“aunred onsawop ‘asnods “uased ‘PIIYD
SJIENPLAIPUL P3IaA0D ¥ « Jaquayy Awey

“JINesse Jenxas Jo/pue
92UINOLA J3saWOP Jo 1oedw pue
Spaau £134es ajelpawwuwg 9y} SSAUPPY  «

Juawhoidap Areius s saquwaw
Allwey e Jop suawasuelre MW «

uoijipuod eay
SNOLI3S s Jaquiaw Kjiuwrey e Jojase) «

uonIpuod Y3jeay snouas
© 3AeY £3u] J1 ‘saajesway) Joy ae) «

UaJpuyd pasaisoy pue paydope
Bupnput ‘pygo mau e Joja1e) «

10} 19pJo Ul yiom

woij Aeme awyy ayey 03 AR [TWyd asn
ued sienpiatpuy “bas 33 Log-£ g -gs st
WweJsaud sy 19402 Jeyy Me] opelojo)
“uesiyred-1q sem 3304 ay| "uol2912 070z
33 Buunp opeojo) jo suazyo ap fq
Ul pajoa sem wesSoud (rwyd) soueinsuy;
9ABIT |EJIPAW pue A)Wed ay| « Wy

‘swniwaud 03 3afqns
9q 10U )M SIDIAISS I3y 10} Way) oy
swawhed pue ‘soakoidwa pasapisuoo
39 j0u M ‘uondadxa Suoid-omy su3
Aysiaes Anesauas s sjedyjo paraay «

YD () £0S-£°E1-85 tanasafoy ‘swniwasd
01 393(qns 2q 10u pjnom way) o3
sjuawfed pue ‘Y wyy ay lapun
23fojdwsa ue jou st uosiad ey uayy
‘apet} Jo uoissajoud uapuadapuy
d124 Jo ped si yiom Jey) pue “som
41843 jo sdoueuniopiad sy ug Jonuos
wayy sa.1y Ajuewud yyog si uosiad e N «

‘uopydaoxa

duoud-omy e sapnjpuy «o2fojdwa,,

40 UolLuyap 5,30V [TWvd 3y "s1spe
UBAI3S pUe Ja)sew Jo diysuonejal me)
-lowiwod a3 Jay3aym jo aadadsally
Jaljoue Jo Jyauaq 343 10} S80LAIaS JO
Joqe) Suluuiopad Yaroqe) fojessiw e
Bupnpout “lenpiapur Auy « sako)dwy

S (E) €0S-£E1-85 :ouassfay Jpak B Alysnou
40 pouad e JaA0 ‘a3e3s ayy UM saBem
Ut 005°Z$ 15e3) 38 pawsea sey oym
43X10M OPRIDIO) ¥ « [enplApU] palaro)

<I'TINVI ul
oYym s,.oym

E SPIND JUSWILISACD 18207 [TWY4

‘swinjwa.d Sulfed ploae 03 £707
‘} Asenuer jo PE3Ye uolsiAlg Sy3 Ajou 3snw NoA *€Z0Z ‘L
1dy uo anp syuswAed wniwaid pue eyep aSem yjoq padxa
1ItM UOLSIALG ITWVH 2y “wesSoad Iwys sy3 ut spuedried
S€ PSLBUSPL 34 ||1M £Z07 ‘) Asenuer Aq 3no-3do o3 8304 © Jo
UoLSIALG ITWV4 3Y3 A330u Jou op yoym SJUSWIULISA0Y JeI07

¢1833d] D pUas 1o ‘aj0A D 3%D3 30U 0p aM J1suaddoy 3oupm

*@2ejd ut uejd aAes) pred jusjeanbs ue aAey 03
paJinbau jou aue weisoid WV ay3 ut uonednied
Sul]I3p 03 9304 oYM siafo]dwd JUsWUISACS jecoq

ajejdwa]. siafojdwg suiediayiey
UO1JEJLII0N LBl 11V 10} 133504 Wooy
99kojdwi3 8)qeziwolsny 3ealg piepuels

300 3do oym
SJUBLLLLIBACD) [B207]
10J7181504 W00y yealg

S1001

9PIND JUBWIUISACD [BI07] [WY4




6

8

._.,um_.m._muqu.mun._Cmﬁo\mu.amaﬁ

=2JLUOUD33 1532111053 /¥10/-1n0510:djysiau) nd)pu Rousmm/fisd)y woif 7707 ‘77 SUNf PaAaLIIaYy
“S2I)WDH B Uawopm Jof diysiauiing IPUOHDN=2119nd ay3 pue sassautsng ‘saijiwey 40} aAaT Ajiwed
PIBd 40 s35Rdw| 310u033 2ARIS04 Ay ) :s1a33eyy Aed *(“p:u) “yioM pup UWOM 0] 133u3) siasiny

Jpd:y Z0Z4dy=A1igixalfsiayin s 431D]S-UISSONTUOSSIad [UISSOILI~ /DA
{PIofuD)S:qamy /:5033ywoif ‘ZZ0Z ‘zz aung PaAaLiiay Ayisiaaun Pdofupis uyjeaq |ewiajey pue
Aigixa) adejdyiopm ,siaured tauoy A®35,ue) peg usaum (pg )udy 1 707) ‘W 431)5-Uissoy

Z}02Z:Wod 700} 0} /10p 102 A3] 14 Ap. qijauluoyjisdiy /78
<064 (F)9£ ‘Juawiaieueyy PUR sisfeuy A3ljod jo jeuinor ‘Weliold aaeaT £jiey pied S,Blu.10)||eD
Buimoja3 jooydg Alejualua)3 utyyea piiyy (SZAIDC'210Z) N ‘N2g B s ‘JOPDS-UDLIYIT

Jpd:sf-aana)-paw-uinf-pimd-1 75740/ ¥0/1Z0Z /spoojdn3uajuod
-dm (810 43m0uB31qDInba | /25013y wouf ‘7707 ‘77 aunp PRAaLllay “y3mo.n 3)qo3inb3 jsajoljod
2AR3]|eJIpaw pue Aqiwey pred Inoqe Aes ydieasalay; S30P JRUM '("B1U) Ylmoln 2]qo3inb3

Mnn.mhm_cE.@.am.__Equr.__ﬁ:%HmEuu_mn__”ghu‘ﬂamucu._ﬁ“:.?m\_qm___émE&__a_qunzbnE:ou
-dm (510 .EE.__q“c._bmcntaqnnu.eé.:,_un_t:. '810°31n335UA3iUNY Joddo M ‘23815 Uo1FulYsEM 10
9IURJINSU| 3ARST JRIIPaW pUE A) ey Suien|eas «(1 fow. ‘z107) 'a)mnsufAunyoddp 2jWoup33

HEE,Nmm.vwmanm.m.,_u&.Ecmh_n.mEv__E_.m_nut&Eou.Hm&.cmE.mBmc‘za.zuu._cthou:mﬁ.E&..ngmtnn
-3jdoad-fo- f)py-uny3-ss3 ]-A3Ans-33310)3p fsas0a ]18.1:SM3UYLUOD S IIMSMALIT MMM | [y wolf ‘7707
‘22 aUnf pasaliiay 1BIIMSMIN Yd tanRaT |euaiegd Bupe) 9]9eHojWO)) 1994 uay sdijay uonezIUREIQ
18411334 pakaAins a1doad 10 JeH uey ssa7] :A2AInS 33310120 (5t 3unf '9107) a1i01ag

Jpd:ajqianilagasnaipiog sa) 1f1fop53a)

[dSY0 1531/ /A0510p [53)15 [A05 10p ‘mmm //:sd33y Wiosf 7707 ‘7z ounf parainay woqny fo Juauniodag
5171 QYd ‘wnegisa|iey) 10oyas ssauisng ElqLuN|0) gud ‘123Jeg uuy apedaq 35214 au3 woJj
Suossat ime aaeaT AR pied S(BIWIONRY *(£7 Bunp ‘#107) #DT aADIT AW piod s,pitwiofipy

mo_u_:m..umum

SPINDJUBLLILISADS B30T [IWYA

582 (02) £05-£°€1-85 pup 579D

TOFERIS S (ET00-L'44-98 502540y “WINILA
9l pue Jojoe sy uaamIaq diysuojge)al
a1 jo ss3)pIedal uossad Jayjoue Jsurese
uossad e Aq palIWWod Ynesse jenxas 1o
B5U3JJ0 AUY « asnqy 1o jjnessy jenxag

U (81) E05-£EL-85

uapiaoid ared yyeay e Aq Juaunesn
Buinunuod Jo ‘“Koey ased 1eapaw
1eluapisal io adydsoy ‘yeqidsoy e ug
3182 Juafjedul saAjoAuL TRy UOIIpUOD
1B3uaW Jo JedisAyd o “yngppyo wouy
K19A0231 ‘“foueusasd ‘auuredun “nfu
‘ssauNt uy « uonIpuoy YIeaY snouss

'Siyauaq

SJUBINSU} 3AR3) [e31paW pue Ajiwrey
M uondauuod ul Juawloldws wouy
uaxe) aaes) pred 1oy uopdLdsap jesaual
YL « 3AB3] [edIp3LL pue Ajlwe; pled

U2 (Ne)SroE-1-678 sacuasafay

"V WY 343 Japun sjuswiuIaaog
18307 P313pisuod aue sjooyas Japey?)
"a3e)s 3Uy3 Jo uoisiapgns Teantiod Jayjo
10 ‘Kyuoyine ‘PLasip jeads ‘PLasip
10042s Aue Jo Aioinyess Jo ajnu awoy
J3aym ‘umoy Jo A ‘Kunod pue
A1 ‘Qunod Auy « Juswusaron :aley]

*Apoq Sulwianod syt Aq

P319npuod aq 3snw w4 Jo Ino 3do 03
9104 5,JUBWWISA0S 1e20) ¥ *213 SI033311p
Jo (s)paeoq ‘sjuasal Jo pieoq “spreoq
100435 d1ignd :03 pajjwy Jou aue 3ng

3pnpuy sajdurexy “uoistapqns 1eannod
40 JUSLLILIBAOE |B20] B J9A0 SDURLLIDACS
9512133 0] AjLioy3ne ayy sey oym
s19pea) Jo dnous ay) « Apog Suiussacy

1eak soud a3 ug paspom sinoy uo paseq
seafojdwa Fuowe Area few asesanod
VW4 1enpLatpul Jel3 230u 03 Juepiodw
5131 UDADMOY BZ 521y 350 62 savuasafay
VIWA YItm Ajua.Lnouod unu 03 pausisap
st wetSo.d (W4 5,0pe1010) ‘saakodwa
2Jow Jo 0§ ym satuedwod pue ‘sjooyas
Asepuodas pue Aiejuswala ajeaud pue
2ngnd jje ‘sapuate oygnd jje o3 sapdde
VW4 "2Ae3] ay3 Suunp paurejuiew

2q sjysuaq yijeay dnoss sayy Jeyy
sainba. osye 31 ueak Jad aaea) paydajond
-qof ‘pedun Jo saam 7| 01 dn yam
s3afojdwa Butkjenb uenas sapiaosd
ey wesSoud jesapay e st (yIwd) 1oV
BAEST 1eIPaW pue Ajwey oy « yw4

SPIND JUBWILIBACD 2207 WY E



@ COLORADO

@ w Family and Medical Leave
Insurance Program (FAMLI)

Department of Labor and Employment



Date:
Title:
Presented By:

Prepared By:

Background:

Attachments:

Suggested Action:

Recommended Motion;

";(Ezloilmbine Valley

Colorado ~

Request for Board of Trustee Action

November 15, 2022
2023 Draft Town Budget
J.D. McCrumb, Town Administrator

Diane Rodriguez, Finance Manager; J.D. McCrumb, Town
Administrator

This 1s the second draft of the 2023 Town Budget presented for
review and discussion. The first draft was presented to and discussed
by the Trustees in October, 2022. Direction was provided to staff and
changes/updates were made accordingly.

The budget is scheduled for adoption by Resolution on Tuesday,
December 6, 2022.

2023 Draft Town Budget

Direct staff to make any updates or changes to prepare for the
November Trustees meeting.

No motion is required.



REVENUES PER CATEGORY
General
Capital
Conservation trust fund
Arapahoe county open space
Wild Plum Impact fees
Transportation fees

Total revenucs

EXPENDITURES PER CATEGORY
General
Capital
Conservation trust fund
Arapahoe county open space

Total expenditures

EXCESS OF REVENUES OVER (UNDER)
EXPENDITURES

OTHER FINANCING SOURCES (USES)
Sale of capital assets
Other loss
Total other financing sources (uses)

NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE

BEGINNING FUND BALANCE
ENDING FUND BALANCE

ENDING FUND BALANCE BY CATEGORY
General
Capital
Conservation trust fund
Arapahoe county open space
Impact fees
Transportation fees
ENDING FUND BALANCE BY CATEGORY

TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
SUMMARY

2023 PROPOSED BUDGET- MODIFIED ACCRUAL BASIS
WITH 2021 ACTUAL, 2022 ADOPTED, YTD 2022 ACTUAL AND 2022 ESTIMATED AMOUNTS

2021 2022 YTD Actual 2022 2023
Actual Adopted 10/31/2022 Estimated posed
5 4,002,765 3 3,142,757 s 3,396,554 % 3,844,462 2,711,373
3,649 - - - 1,326,773
8,983 8,707 7,262 8,950 8,950
44,087 46,298 57,796 58,230 58,200
609,749 292,245 303,812 304,100 -
107,339 90,000 104,535 110,000 100,000
4,776,572 3,580,007 3,869,959 4,325,742 4,205,296
1,508,436 2,236,941 1,568,222 2,259,466 2,341,910
73,948 152,500 107,275 153,575 4,654,500
4,800 6,000 3,155 6,000 6,000
3,549 30,000 24,296 34,296 -
1,550,733 2,425441 1,702,948 2,453,337 7,002,410
2,785,839 1,154,566 2,167,011 1,872,405 (2,797,114)
9,000 - 5,000 5,000 -
- - (197,605) (197,605) -
9,000 - {192,605) (192,605) -
2,794,839 S 1,154,566 1,974,406 1,679,800 (2,797,114)
3,370,278 6,165,117 6,165,117 7,844,917
b 6,165,117 S 8,139,523 § 7,844,917 5,047,803
3 3,224,940 3 1,055,667 8 1,012,331 1,081,794
1,448,068 5,145,793 4,899,493 1,871,766
18,183 22,290 21,133 24,083
489,744 523,244 513,678 571,878
876,843 1,180,655 1,180,943 1,180,943
107,339 211,874 217,339 317,339
S 6,165,117 S 8,139,523 § 7,844,917 5,047,803




REVENUES

Taxes
Cable television
Property taxes
Sales and use taxes
Specific ownership taxes
Utility franchise fees

Total taxes

Permits and fines
Fines
Permits, fees and services
Violations

Total permits and fines

Intergovernmental
Bow Mar IGA police
Bow Mar IGA admin
County highway tax revenue
Motor vehicle registration fees
State cigarette tax apportionment
State highway user's tax

Total intergovernmental

Interest

Other

Grants

Covid 19 Cares Act

TOTAL REVENUES

EXPENDITURES

Administration
Accounting and audit
Advertising/notices
Bank/credit card fees
Building inspection and plan review
Building maintenance and utilities
Community functions
Computer expense
County treasurer’s collection fees
Emergency response and preparedness
Dues and publications
Education and training
Election
Health insurance
Human resources
Insurance workers comp/liability/bonds
Legal
Mayor/monthly breakfasts
Miscellaneous
Payroll taxes
Pension
Salaries
Special projects
Supplies, printing, postage

TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
OPERATIONS - DETAILS

2023 PROPOSED BUDGET- MODIFIED ACCRUAL BASIS
WITH 2021 ACTUAL, 2022 ADOPTED, YTD 2022 ACTUAL AND 2022 ESTIMATED AMOUNTS

2021 2022 YTD Actual 2022 2023
Actual Adopted 10/3172022 Estimated Prop d

3 38,740 S 36,000 § 33,714  § 40,457 40,500
431,219 615,419 610,841 615,419 590,740
1,820,397 1,385,000 1,419,522 1,703,426 1,128,700
30,041 43,079 32,438 38,926 41,400
60,997 50,000 57,629 69,155 69,200
2,381,394 2,129,498 2,154,144 2,467,383 1,870,540
116,281 100,000 82,192 98,630 110,000
816,074 530,000 491,149 589,379 258,600

274,725 - 236,076 236,076 -
1,207,080 630,000 809,417 924,085 368,600
295,095 300,259 304,833 304,833 327,543
20,000 20,000 20,000 20,000 20,000
13,133 15,000 19,088 22,906 22,900
6,026 6,000 4,911 5,893 5,900
2,109 1,000 815 978 1,000
47,688 40,000 36,807 44,168 44,200
384,051 382,259 386,454 398,778 421,543
1,077 1,000 38,384 46,061 46,100

4,163 - 6,270 6,270 -
25,000 - 1,885 1,885 4,590
4,002,765 3,142,757 3,396,554 3,844,462 2,711,373
57,722 63,500 76,572 91,886 90,000
218 500 1,661 1,661 500
7,295 5,100 7,131 8,557 8,600
265,471 238,500 155,857 238,500 238,500
70,340 22,011 18,958 24,432 24,860
41,354 55,000 28,424 50,555 59,500
8,073 14,500 4,705 14,500 14,500
4,314 6,154 6,114 6,154 5,907
2,076 3,000 1,225 3,000 3,000
9,426 8,850 10,231 12,641 12,980
399 12,000 3,174 12,000 12,000

- 4,000 - . -
41,458 47,000 23,518 29,675 30,303
- - - - 13,000
22,900 34,047 36,095 36,096 37,179
22,289 45,000 24,972 45,000 45,000
269 2,000 289 2,000 2,000
2,874 2,300 2,453 2,500 2,500
11,886 12,575 6,451 12,575 13,200
10,668 12,575 7,079 12,575 13,200
216,817 251,500 195,423 251,500 264,075
- - 10,350 10,350 23,000
11,795 13,000 5,813 13,000 13,000



TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
OPERATIONS - DETAILS
2023 PROPOSED BUDGET- MODIFIED ACCRUAL BASIS

WITH 2021 ACTUAL, 2022 ADOPTED, YTD 2022 ACTUAL AND 2022 ESTIMATED AMOUNTS

Telephone/communications
Emergency reserve

Total administration

Planning and engineering
Town planning
Town engineer
Miscellaneous

Total planning and enginecring

Public safety
Operations
Cruiser gas
Cruiser oil/maintenance
Cruiser insurance
Education/training
Equipment repair
Health insurance
Insurance workers comp/liability
Payroll taxes
Pension
Salaries
Supplies/dues/miscellaneous
Telephones/air cards
Uniforms

Total operations
Municipal court
Judge
Legal
Administration
Supplies
Interpreter
Total municipal court
Contracts
Arapahoe county dispatch fee
Mobile Cad
Human society
Juvenile assessment
Netmotion
CACP
CIsC
When[Work

Total contracts
Computer/IT

Offsite server backup and protection

Office 365 accounts
Scheduled computer replacement
Govpilot
Tatal computer/IT
Total public safety

Public works
Ground maintenance
Health insurance
Other drainage/water
Payroll taxes

2021 2022 YTD Actual 2022 2023
Actual pted 10/31/2022 ted Prop i

7,695 6,500 5,824 6,500 6,500
- 94,000 - 94,000 81,400
815,339 953,612 632,319 979,657 1,014,704
30,959 36,000 11,254 36,000 36,000
12,537 16,000 16,660 17,000 16,000

- 1,500 - - -
43,496 53,500 27,914 53,000 52,000
16,903 22,100 16,118 22,100 28,700
7,131 18,000 4,647 18,000 18,000
6,956 8,487 4,558 4,558 8,500
3,131 11,750 4,246 11,750 12,620
454 5,875 - - 5,875
64,273 70,900 62,712 75,254 80,380
24,577 29,705 35,477 35,477 36,541
18,333 24,730 16,317 24,730 26,500
41,572 49,459 39,878 49,459 53,000
484,208 494,590 418,265 494,590 529,211
11,585 15,980 11,000 26,017 15,980
1,928 2,938 - - 3,500
4,433 11,750 5,160 11,750 11,750
685,484 766,264 618,378 773,685 830,557
6,000 8,000 5,000 6,000 6,000
31,923 27,500 21,690 26,028 27,000
706 4,000 3,328 4,400 2,000
2,216 2,000 1,312 2,000 2,500
2,200 - - - 2,400
43,045 41,500 31,330 38,428 39,900
31,949 33,709 34,406 9,406 35,560
1,189 1,225 - - 1,262
- 500 - 500 500
782 782 595 595 632
- 500 - 500 500
o 250 - 250 350
- 1,000 - 1,000 1,000
700 450 36 450 430
34,620 38,416 35,037 12,701 40,234
2,172 1,800 4,111 5,000 11,400
1,800 2,500 3,087 3,704 4,700
4,055 3,500 3,737 3,737 4,000
10,000 14,000 14,000 14,000 14,000
18,027 21,800 24,935 26,441 34,100
781,176 867,980 705,680 851,255 944,791
2,842 8,578 13,439 16,000 10,000
7,342 7,934 6,832 7,934 8,397
1,805 5,000 - 8 5,000
2,707 4,193 2,166 4,193 4,408



Pension
Professional fees-mosquito control
Salary
Sanitation/trash/recycle service
Signs maintenance
Snow removal
Storm water permit process/NPDES
Street lighting
Streets and gutters maintenance
Streets and gutters contingency
Striping
Vehicle maintenance

Total public works

TOTAL EXPENDITURES

EXCESS OF REVENUES OVER
EXPENDITURES

OTHER FINANCING USES

Transfer to capital
Other loss

Total other financing uses
NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE

ENDING FUND BALANCE

TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY

OPERATIONS - DETAILS

2023 PROPOSED BUDGET- MODIFIED ACCRUAL BASIS
WITH 2021 ACTUAL, 2022 ADOPTED, YTD 2022 ACTUAL AND 2022 ESTIMATED AMOUNTS

2021 2022 YTD Actual 2022 2023
Actual Adopted 1003112022 Estimated Proposed
3,333 4,193 3,772 4,193 4,408
6,645 7,500 7,042 7,043 7,543
73,706 83,850 55,745 83,850 88,163
93,685 92,000 82,305 109,740 103,874
512 1,061 - 1,061 1,082
1,510 5,500 2,246 5,500 5,500
1,271 7,500 705 7,500 7,500
20,340 15,000 16,266 15,000 15,000
47,563 75,000 5,740 75,000 25,000
- 40,000 - 40,000 40,000
251 1,040 - 1,040 1,040
4,513 3,500 2,051 3,500 3,500
268,425 361,849 198,309 375,554 330,415
1,908,436 2,236,941 1,568,222 2,259,466 2,341,910
2,094,329 905,816 1,828,332 1,584,996 369,463
(1,000,000) (2,700,000) (3,800,000) (3.,600,000) {300,000)
- - (197,605) (197,605) -
{1,000,000) (2,700,000) (3,997,605) (3,797,605) (300,000)
1,094,329 S ! 1,794,1 84! (2,169,273) (2,212,609) 69,463
2,130,611 3,224,940 3,224,940 1,012,331
s 3,224,940 M 1,055,667 5 1,012,331 5 1,081,794




TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
CAPITAL
2023 PROPOSED BUDGET- MODIFIED ACCRUAL BASIS
WITH 2021 ACTUAL, 2022 ADOPTED, YTD 2022 ACTUAL AND 2022 ESTIMATED AMOUNTS

2021 2022 YTD Actual 2022 2023
Actual Adopted 10/31/2022 Estimated Proposed
REVENUES
Donations (Brick sales) 3 3649 % - s - 5 - s -
Denver water contribution - - - - 550,000
CDOT grant - - - - 400,000
NEU grant - - - - 376,773
Total revenues 3,649 - - - 1,326,773
EXPENDITURES
Public safety
Body Cameras 6,400 - - - -
Flock camera system - 17,500 - 17,500 17,500
Vchicle 47,055 55,000 38,200 55,000 -
Administration
Columbine park stage 7,943 - - - -
Town Hall board room & basement carpet - - - . 15,000
Public works
Fumace and air conditioner 12,550 - - - 15,000
Lightpole replacement - 12,000 - 12,000 12,000
Platte Canyon Sidewalk - Village to Fairway - - - - 500,000
Platte Canyon/Coal Mine right turn lanc < - - - 280,000
Road improvements - - - - 3,815,000
Truck - Snow Removal - 68,000 69,075 69,075 -
Total expenditures 73,948 152,500 107,275 153,575 4,654,500
EXCESS OF EXPENDITURES OVER
REVENUES {70,299) (152,500) (107,275) {153,575) (3,327,727)
OTHER FINANCING SOURCES
Sale of assets 9,000 - 5,000 5,000 -
Transfer from general 1,000,000 2,700,000 3,300,000 3,600,000 300,000
Transfer from impact fee - 9,520 - - -
Total other financing sources 1,009,000 2,709,520 3,805,000 3,605,000 300,000
NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE 938,701 S 2,557,020 8 3,697,725 3,451,425 (3,027,727)
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE 509,367 1,448,068 1,448,068 4,899,493
ENDING FUND BALANCE s 1,448,068 $ 5145793 8 4,899493 § 1,871,766




REVENUES
Conservation trust fund entitlement
CTF interest

Total revenues

EXPENDITURES
Conservation trust fund expenditures

Total expenditures
NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE

ENDING FUND BALANCE

TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
CONSERVATION TRUST FUND

2023 PROPOSED BUDGET- MODIFIED ACCRUAL BASIS

WITH 2021 ACTUAL, 2022 ADOPTED, YTD 2022 ACTUAL AND 2022 ESTIMATED AMOUNTS

2021 2022 YTD Actual 2022 2023
Actual Adopted 10/31/2022 Estl d Proposed
s 8,976 8,700 s 7.038 3§ 8700 3 8,700
7 7 224 250 250
8,983 8,707 7,262 8,950 8,950
4,300 6,000 3,155 6,000 6,000
4,800 6,000 3,155 6,000 6,000
4,183 2,707 5 4,107 2,950 2,950
14,000 18,183 18,183 21,133
$ 18,183 3 22,290 § 21,133 $ 24,083




REVENUES
Arapahoe county open space revenues
ACOP interest

Total revenues
EXPENDITURES

Trails Master Plan
Nevada ditch

Total expenditures
NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE

ENDING FUND BALANCE

TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
ARAPAHOE COUNTY OPEN SPACE

2023 PROPOSED BUDGET- MODIFIED ACCRUAL BASIS
WITH 2021 ACTUAL, 2022 ADOPTED, YTD 2022 ACTUAL AND 2022 ESTIMATED AMOUNTS

2021 2022 YTD Actual 2022 2023
Actual Adopted 10/31/2022 Estimatad Proposed

$ 43,918 $ 46,114 ) 52,230 $ 52,230 $ 52,200
169 184 5,566 6,000 6,000
44,087 46,298 57,796 58,230 58,200

3,549 - 4,296 4,296 -

- 30,000 20,000 30,000 -

3,549 30,000 24,296 34,296 -
40,538 $ 16,298 $ 33,500 23,934 58,200
449,206 489,744 489,744 513,678
$ 489,744 $ 523,244 $ 513,678 $ 571,878




TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
WILD PLUM IMPACT FEES
2023 PROPOSED BUDGET- MODIFIED ACCRUAL BASIS
WITH 2021 ACTUAL, 2022 ADOPTED, YTD 2022 ACTUAL AND 2022 ESTIMATED AMOUNTS

2021 2022 YTD Actual 2022 2023
Actual Adopted 10/3112022 Estimated Proposed
Modified Acerual Modified Accrual Modified Accrual Modified Accrual Madifled Accrual

REVENUES
‘Wild Plum Impact fees $ 609,600 s 292,100 $ 292,100 s 292,100 S -
Wild Plum Impact fees interest 149 145 11,712 12,000 .
Total revenues 609,749 292245 303,812 304,100 -
EXPENDITURES

Total expenditures - - & 2 -

EXCESS OF REVENUES OVER
EXPENDITURES 609,749 292,245 303,812 304,100 -
OTHER FINANCING USES
Transfer to capital - (9,520) - - -
Total other financing uses - {9.520) - - -
NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE 609,749 3 282,725 303,812 304,100 -
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE 267,094 876,843 876,843 1,180,943

ENDING FUND BALANCE S 876,843 3 1,180,655 S 1,180,943 3 1,180,943




TOWN OF COLUMBINE VALLEY
TRANSPORTATION FEES
2023 PROPOSED BUDGET- MODIFIED ACCRUAL BASIS
WITH 2021 ACTUAL, 2022 ADOPTED, YTD 2022 ACTUAL AND 2022 ESTIMATED AMOUNTS

2021 2022 YTD Actual 2022 2023
Actual Adopted 103172022 Estimated Proposed
Modified Accrual  Modifled Accrual Modifled Accrual  Medified Accrual  Modified Accrual

REVENUES
Transportation fees $ 107,339 $ 90,000 § 104,535 $ 110,000 3 100,000
Total revenues 107,339 90,000 104,535 110,000 100,000
EXPENDITURES
Total expenditures - - - - -
NET CHANGE IN FUND BALANCE 107,339 3 90,000 104,535 110,000 100,000
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE - 107,339 107,339 217,339

ENDING FUND BALANCE 3 107,339 S 211,874 § 217,33 % 317,339




